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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

DECEMBER 17, 2007

TO: JOHN J. VIGIL, PURCHASING MANAGER

FROM: BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYE@V

SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON\REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2008- BID OPENING DATE: 11/28/2007
066-BH

TITLE: SAND, GRAVEL, CRUSHER FINES, COBBLESTONE & FILL DIRT

I RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: VARIOUS

VENDOR
ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL PAYMENT
NO. QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT  AMOUNT TERMS

[TEMS 1-44 - SEE ATTACHED SPREAD SHEET FOR COMPLETE BREAK DOWN. RECOMMENDED VENDOR FOR AWARD BUILDOLOGY, INC.

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION BY
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON: . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: L—%L&[ﬂ_l




City of Albugquerque

AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Ii
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-066-BH
BID TITLE: SAND, GRAVEL, CRUSHER FINES, COBBLESTONE & FILL DIRT
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

ltem Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From Item No.: 1 To ltem No.: 3
$0.00 $0.00 EDGEWOOD AGGREGATES
$41,560.00 $39,482.00 BUILDOLOGY , INC.
$41,280.00 $41,280.00 VULCAN MATERIALS
$61,132.00 $58,075.40 WAYCOR
$67,840.00 $64,448.00 LAFARGE

DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS ON FOB

From ltem No.: 4 To Item No.: 12
$0.00 $0.00 EDGEWOOD AGGREGATES

$58,500.00 $55,575.00 BUILDOLOGY , INC.

$58,638.00 $58,638.00 VULCAN MATERIALS

$68,382.50 $64,963.38 WAYCOR

$105,575.00 $100,296.25 LAFARGE
DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS ON FOB

From Item No.: 13 To ltem No.: 33

$119,596.00 $119,596.00 VULCAN MATERIALS
VENDOR DID NOT BID ITEMS 29, 30, 31 32 & 33. THE CITY HAS USED THIS PARTICULAR
GRAVEL IN ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MAINTENANCE OF OUR PARKS. NOT HAVING ACCESS
TO THIS IS NOT ACCEPTABLE.

$141,680.00 $134,596.00 WAYCOR
SPECIFICATIONS WERE NOT MET ON ITEMS 29 THRU 32. ITEM SAMPLE WAS BROUGHT IN
AND ITEM DID NOT MATCH EXISTING PRODUCT.

$150,575.00 $143,046.25 BUILDOLOGY |, INC.

$178,994.50 $170,044.78 LAFARGE
DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS ON FOB

* Denotes that at least one item in the Group was 'No Bid'
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-066-BH
BID TITLE: SAND, GRAVEL, CRUSHER FINES, COBBLESTONE & FILL DIRT
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments

$200,946.00 $190,898.70 EDGEWOOD AGGREGATES

DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS ON ITEMS 15,16,17,18,19,20. VENDOR BID CRUSHED
LIMESTONE. DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS FOR SANTA FE BROWN CRUSHED GRAVEL IN
ORDER TO MATCH EXISTING GRAVEL IN PARKS AND OTHER AREAS VENDOR BID SIERRA

BROWN.
From item No.: 34 To ltem No.: 44
$55,265.00 $52,501.75 EDGEWOOD AGGREGATES
DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS FOR ITEMS 34 & 35. VENDOR BID CRUSHED LIMESTONE.
$479,616.00 $479,616.00 VULCAN MATERIALS

VENDOR DID NOT BID ITEMS 36, 37 AND 38. NOT HAVING ACCESS TO THIS PARTICULAR
MATERIAL WILL NOT BE ACCEPTABLE. WE USE THIS PRODUCTS IN ALL CONSTRUCTION
AND MAINTENANCE OF PARKS.

$521,468.75 $495,395.31 WAYCOR

DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS ON ITEMS 36 & 37. SAMPLE DID NOT MATCH EXISTING
PRODUCT BEING USED.

$633,012.50 $601,361.87 BUILDOLOGY , INC.

$699,730.00 $664,743.50 LAFARGE
DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS ON FOB AND ALSO ON QUANTITY, INSTEAD OF TON WAS
BID PER LOAD.

Total Offers = 20

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'
December 19, 2007 Page 2 of 2



Vendor

City of Albugquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM I
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Preference

Number Name Type Delivery Notes

VULCAN MATERIALS ITEMS 20, 30, 31, 32, 33, 36,37,AND 38 WERE A NO BID.

WAYCOR LOCAL BUSI GROUP 3 & GROUP 4, ITEMS 29, 30, 31, 32 AND ITEMS
36, 37. WAYCOR DOES NOT CARRY SANTA FE
BROWN, IS PROPOSING BOSQUE BROWN GRAVEL.
PRICING WAS FOR THE BOSQUE BROWN GRAVEL.

BUILDOLOGY , INC. LOCAL BUSI VENDOR BID ALL ITEMS.

EDGEWOOD AGGREGATES STATE BUSI GROUP 3, ITEMS 29, 30, 31, 32 36, 37, IS PROPOSING
SIERRA BROWN FOR SANTA FE BROWN. GAVE
PRICING FOR SIERRA BROWN. PROPOSES
CRUSHED LIMESTONE FOR ITEMS 15, 16, 17, 18, 19
20, 34, 35.

LAFARGE LOCAL BUSI ITEMS 2,5,9,14,16,24,26,28,35 ARE FOB PLACITAS PIT;

ITEM 18,22,39,40 ARE FOB SANTA ANA PIT; ITEM
#32,37 ARE FOB OSUNA PIT; ITEM#3, 12,33,38, ARE
PRICED PER LOAD NOT TON.

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 1 800
COBBLESTONE, 2 1/2"TO 6", A
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU TN
UNIT PRICE $29.6000
EXT. PRICE $23,680.00

December 19, 2007

REQUEST FOR BIiD NUMBER: RFB2008-066-BH
BID TITLE: SAND, GRAVEL, CRUSHER FINES, COBBLESTONE & FILL DIRT
BID OPENING DATE: 11/28/2007
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

TN
$40.5000
$32,400.00

3 4

TN TN
$27.0000 $0.0000
$21,600.00 $0.00

TN
$31.3500
$25,080.00

Page 1 of 12



GROUP ITEM QTY

1 2 800
COBBLESTONE, 21/2"TO 6" A
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU TN
UNIT PRICE $22.0000
EXT. PRICE $17,600.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 3

SHORT LOAD DELIVERY CHAR

RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU

UNIT PRICE
EXT. PRICE

240

1

N

$0.0000
$0.00

GROUP ITEM QTyY

2 4

WASHED PLASTER SAND, DEL

RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU

UNIT PRICE
EXT. PRICE

500

1

TN

$17.8200
$8,910.00

GROUP ITEM Qry

2 5

WASHED PLASTER SAND TO B

RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU

UNIT PRICE
EXT. PRICE

December 19, 2007

500

1

™
$13.5000
$6,750.00

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-066-BH
BID TITLE: SAND, GRAVEL, CRUSHER FINES, COBBLESTONE & FILL DIRT
BID OPENING DATE: 11/28/2007
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

TN
$33.3500
$26,680.00

TN
$8.5500
$2,052.00

TN
$19.7500
$9,875.00

TN
$12.6000
$6,300.00

TN
$24.5000
$19,600.00

TN
$1.5000
$360.00

TN
$23.0000
$11,500.00

TN
$21.5000
$10,750.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$22.8500
$18,280.00

TN
$102.0000
$24,480.00

TN
$21.1500
$10,575.00

TN
$12.6500
$6,325.00

Page 2 of 12



REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-066-BH
BID TITLE: SAND, GRAVEL, CRUSHER FINES, COBBLESTONE & FILL DIRT
BID OPENING DATE: 11/28/2007
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTY

2 6 500
PLASTER SAND, UNWASHED T
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID?
SKU TN TN TN TN TN
UNIT PRICE $16.3200 $19.7500 $23.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $8,160.00 $9,875.00 $11,500.00 $0.00 $0.00

GROUP ITEM QTyYy
2 7 500
PLASTER SAND, UNWASHED T

RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID?

SKU TN TN TN TN TN
UNIT PRICE $12.0000 $12.6000 : $21.5000 $0.0000 $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $6,000.00 $6,300.00 $10,750.00 $0.00 $0.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
2 8 1000
BRICK SAND, WASHED TO BE

RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID?

SKU TN TN TN TN TN
UNIT PRICE $17.8200 $19.7500 $8.0000 $0.0000 $21.1500
EXT. PRICE $17,820.00 $19,750.00 $8,000.00 $0.00 $21,150.00

GROUP ITEM QTy
2 9 500
BRICK SAND, WASHED TO BE

RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BiD?

SKU TN TN TN TN ™
UNIT PRICE $13.5000 $12.6000 $6.0000 $0.0000 $12.6500
EXT. PRICE $6,750.00 $6,300.00 $3,000.00 $0.00 $6,325.00

December 19, 2007 Page 3 of 12



GROUP {TEM QTy
2 10 150
BRICK SAND, UNWASHED TO

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU TN
UNIT PRICE $16.3200
EXT. PRICE $2,448.00

GROUP ITEM QTy
2 11 150
BRICK SAND, UNWASHED TO

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU TN
UNIT PRICE $12.0000
EXT. PRICE $1,800.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

2 12 600
SHORT LOAD DELIVERY CHAR
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU TN
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

GROUP ITEM QTyYy
3 13 500
ROUND ROCK 1 1/2"TO21/2"

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU TN
UNIT PRICE $23.3200
EXT. PRICE $11,660.00

December 19, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-066-BH
BID TITLE: SAND, GRAVEL, CRUSHER FINES, COBBLESTONE & FILL DIRT
BID OPENING DATE: 11/28/2007
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

TN
$19.7500
$2,962.50

TN
$12.6000
$1,890.00

TN
$8.5500
$5,130.00

TN
$19.4500
$9,725.00

TN
$8.0000
$1,200.00

TN
$6.0000
$900.00

TN
$1.5000
$900.00

TN
$14.5000
$7,250.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$102.0000
$61,200.00

TN
$21.8500
$10,925.00

Page 4 of 12



GROUP ITEM QTy
3 14 500
ROUND ROCK, 11/2"TO 2 1/2"

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU ™
UNIT PRICE $19.0000
EXT. PRICE $9,500.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
3 15 500
GRAVEL, ROUND ROCK 3/8" T

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU ™
UNIT PRICE $19.3200
EXT. PRICE $9,660.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

3 16 500
GRAVEL, CRUSHED 3/8" TO 1"
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU TN
UNIT PRICE $17.0000
EXT. PRICE $8,500.00

GROUP ITEM Qry

3 17 200
GRAVEL, CRUSHED 1/2" TO 1
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU TN
UNIT PRICE $24.6000
EXT. PRICE $4,920.00

December 19, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-066-BH
BID TITLE: SAND, GRAVEL, CRUSHER FINES, COBBLESTONE & FILL DIRT

BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

TN
$11.9500
$5,975.00

TN
$19.4500
$9,725.00

TN
$13.8500
$6,925.00

TN
$21.3500
$4,270.00

BID OPENING DATE: 11/28/2007

TN
$13.0000
$6,500.00

TN
$17.0000
$8,500.00

TN
$17.7500
$8,875.00

TN
$19.5000
$3,900.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$20.1600
$10,080.00

TN
$10.2300
$5,115.00

TN
$22.5300
$4,506.00

TN
$13.3500
$6,675.00

TN
$22.6500
$11,325.00

TN
$16.9600
$8,480.00

TN
$25.4600
$5,092.00

Page 5 of 12



GROUP ITEM

3

CRUSHED GRAVEL, 1/2" TO 1"

RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU

UNIT PRICE

EXT. PRICE

GROUP ITEM

3

GRAVEL, CRUSHED 1/4" TO 1/2

RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU

UNIT PRICE

EXT. PRICE

GROUP ITEM

3

CRUSHED GRAVEL, 1/4" TO 1/2

RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU

UNIT PRICE
EXT. PRICE

GROUP ITEM

3

QTy
200

1

TN
$17.0000
$3,400.00

QTYy
500

1

TN
$24.6000
$12,300.00

QTy
500

1

TN
$17.0000
$8,500.00

QTy
500

GRAVEL, CRUSHED 1/4" TO B

RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU

UNIT PRICE
EXT. PRICE

1

TN
$25.6000
$12,800.00

December 19, 2007

REQUEST FOR BiD NUMBER: RFB2008-066-BH
BID TITLE: SAND, GRAVEL, CRUSHER FINES, COBBLESTONE & FILL DIRT
BID OPENING DATE: 11/28/2007
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

TN
$13.8500
$2,770.00

TN
$17.1000
$8,550.00

TN
$10.3500
$5,175.00

TN
$17.1000
$8,550.00

TN
$18.0000
$3,600.00

TN
$23.5000
$11,750.00

TN
$19.5000
$9,750.00

TN
$23.5000
$11,750.00

TN
$12.6000
$2,520.00

TN
$30.1100
$16,055.00

TN
$20.1100
$10,055.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$16.9600
$3,392.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY

3 22

CRUSHED GRAVEL, LOADED |

RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU

UNIT PRICE
EXT. PRICE

300

1

TN

$18.0000
$5,400.00

GROUP ITEM QTy

3 23

GRAVEL, ROOFING 3/8" TO BE

RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU

UNIT PRICE
EXT. PRICE

300

1

TN

$19.3200
$5,796.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

3 24

ROOFING GRAVEL, 3/8" LOAD

RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU

UNIT PRICE
EXT. PRICE

300

1

N
$15.0000
$4,500.00

GROUP ITEM Qry

3 25

PLANT MIX, 3/8" TO BE DELIVE

RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU

UNIT PRICE
EXT. PRICE

December 19, 2007

300

1

TN
$26.8200
$8.046.00

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-066-BH
BID TITLE: SAND, GRAVEL, CRUSHER FINES, COBBLESTONE & FILL DIRT
BID OPENING DATE: 11/28/2007
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

™
$10.3500
$3,105.00

TN
$21.3500
$6,405.00

TN
$13.8500
$4,155.00

TN
$21.3500
$6,405.00

TN
$19.5000
$5,850.00

TN
$18.5000
$5,550.00

TN
$17.0000
$5,100.00

™
$16.5000
$4,950.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$16.9600
$5,088.00

TN
$23.6500
$7,095.00

TN
$15.1500
$4,545.00

TN
$20.8500
$6,255.00

Page 7 of 12



GROUP ITEM QTyY
3 26 300
PLANT MIX, 3/8" LOADED INTO

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU TN
UNIT PRICE $22.5000
EXT. PRICE $6,750.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
3 27 200
PLANT MIX, 1" TO BE DELIVER

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU TN
UNIT PRICE $21.8200
EXT. PRICE $4.,364.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

3 28 200
PLANT MIX, 1" LOADED INTO C
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU TN
UNIT PRICE $17.5000
EXT. PRICE $3,500.00

GROUP ITEM Qry

3 29 250
GRAVEL, CRUSHED 1 1/2" SAN
RESPONSE 1
NO BiD?

SKU TN
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

December 19, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-066-BH
BID TITLE: SAND, GRAVEL, CRUSHER FINES, COBBLESTONE & FILL DIRT
BID OPENING DATE: 11/28/2007
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

TN
$13.8500
$4,155.00

TN
$19.0500
$3,810.00

TN
$11.9500
$2,390.00

TN
$46.5000
$11,625.00

TN
$15.0000
$4,500.00

TN
$16.5000
$3,300.00

TN
$15.0000
$3,000.00

TN
$41.5000
$10,375.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$68.7100
$17.177.50

TN
$12.3500
$3,705.00

TN
$20.8500
$4,170.00

TN
$12.3500
$2,470.00

™™
$0.0000
$0.00

Page 8 of 12



GROUP ITEM QTy
3 30 250
GRAVEL, CRUSHED 1 1/2" SAN

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU TN
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
3 31 250
GRAVEL, CRUSHED 1" TO BE

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU TN
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

GROUP ITEM QTy

3 32 250
GRAVEL, CRUSHED 1" SANTA
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU TN
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

3 33 800
SHORT LOAD DELIVERY CHAR
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU ™
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

December 19, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-066-BH
BID TITLE: SAND, GRAVEL, CRUSHER FINES, COBBLESTONE & FILL DIRT
BID OPENING DATE: 11/28/2007
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

TN
$39.0000
$9,750.00

TN
$46.5000
$11,625.00

TN
$39.0000
$9,750.00

TN
$8.5500
$6,840.00

TN
$40.0000
$10,000.00

TN
$50.5000
$12,625.00

TN
$49.0000
$12,250.00

TN
$1.5000
$1,200.00

TN
$58.7800
$14,695.00

TN
$72.4500
$18,112.50

TN
$62.5200
$15,630.00

TN
$110.0000
$88,000.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

N
$25.4600
$6,365.00

TN
$47.2500
$11,812.50

TN
$102.0000
$81,600.00

Page 9 of 12



GROUP ITEM QTyY
4 34 250
CRUSHER FINES, TO BE DELIV

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU TN
UNIT PRICE $14.3200
EXT. PRICE $3,580.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
4 35 250
CRUSHER FINES, LOADED INT

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU TN
UNIT PRICE $10.0000
EXT. PRICE $2,500.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

4 36 250
CRUSHER FINES, SANTA FE B
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU TN
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

4 37 250
CRUSHER FINES, SANTAFE B
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU TN
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

December 19, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-066-8H
BID TITLE: SAND, GRAVEL, CRUSHER FINES, COBBLESTONE & FILL DIRT

BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

TN
$16.7500
$4,187.50

TN
$9.6000
$2,400.00

TN
$36.0000
$9,000.00

TN
$28.8500
$7,.212.50

BID OPENING DATE: 11/28/2007

TN
$21.5000
$5,375.00

TN
$20.0000
$5,000.00

TN
$24.0000
$6,000.00

TN
$21.0000
$5,250.00

TN
$22.1100
$5,527.50

TN
$12.1800
$3,045.00

TN
$70.8500
$17,712.50

TN
$60.9200
$15,230.00

TN
$20.7500
$5,187.50

TN
$12.2500
$3,062.50

N
$42.3500
$10,587.50

TN
$33.8500
$8,462.50

Page 10 of 12



REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-066-BH
BID TITLE: SAND, GRAVEL, CRUSHER FINES, COBBLESTONE & FILL DIRT
BID OPENING DATE: 11/28/2007
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTy
4 38 125
SHORT LOAD DELIVERY CHAR

RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID?
SKU TN TN TN TN TN
UNIT PRICE $0.0000 $8.5500 $1.5000 $110.0000 $102.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00 $1,068.75 $187.50 $13,750.00 $12,750.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

4 39 20000
BACKFILL MATERIAL (GROUP
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID?
SKU N TN N N TN
UNIT PRICE $2.0000 $6.5000 $11.0000 $0.0000 $9.1000
EXT. PRICE $40,000.00 $130,000.00 $220,000.00 $0.00 $182,000.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

4 40 20000
BACKFILL MATERIAL (GROUP
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID?
SKU TN TN TN N ™
UNIT PRICE $12.0000 $6.5000 $8.0000 $0.0000 $9.1000
EXT. PRICE $240,000.00 $130,000.00 $160,000.00 $0.00 $182,000.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

4 41 4000
BACKFILL MATERIAL TOBE D
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BiD?
SKU TN TN TN TN TN
UNIT PRICE $9.6000 $14.3000 $12.0000 $0.0000 $17.6000
EXT. PRICE $38,400.00 $57,200.00 $48,000.00 $0.00 $70,400.00

December 19, 2007
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GROUP ITEM

4

QTy
4000

BACKFILL MATERIALTOBE D

RESPONSE

NO BID?
SKU

UNIT PRICE

EXT. PRICE

GROUP ITEM

4

1

TN
$16.3200
$65,280.00

QTY
8000

BACKFILL MATERIAL TOBE D

RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU

UNIT PRICE

EXT. PRICE

GROUP ITEM

4

1

™
$9.6000
$76,800.00

QTY
800

BACKFILL MATERIAL TOBE D

RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU

UNIT PRICE
EXT. PRICE

1

TN
$16.3200
$13,056.00

December 19, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-066-BH
BID TITLE: SAND, GRAVEL, CRUSHER FINES, COBBLESTONE & FILL DIRT
BID OPENING DATE: 11/28/2007
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

N
$14.3000
$57,200.00

TN
$14.0000
$112,000.00

TN
$14.0000
$11,200.00

TN
$9.0000
$36,000.00

TN
$17.5000
$140,000.00

TN
$9.0000
$7,200.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$17.6000
$70,400.00

TN
$17.6000
$140,800.00

TN
$17.6000
$14,080.00
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