ROA, RFB2007-152-BH, Page 1
CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

APRIL 26, 2007
TO: JOHN J. VIGIL, PURCHASING MANAGER

FROM: BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER w

SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2007-
152-BH
TITLE: UNIFORMS FOR AQUATICS SECTION

BID OPENING DATE: 4/18/2007

I RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: PARKS & RECREATION

VENDOR
ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL PAYMENT
NO. QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT AMOUNT TERMS
1 500.0 T-Shirt, Short Sleeved, white Screen Images, Inc. $ 315  $1,575.00 30 days
2 500.0 T-Shirt, Short Sleeved, red Screen Images, Inc. $ 3.70 $1,850.00 30 days
3 350.0 T-Shirt, Long Sleeved, white Screen Images, Inc. $ 517  $1,809.00 30 days
4 350.0 T-Shirt, Long Sleeved, red Screen Images, Inc. $ 6.08 $2,128.00 30 days
5 180.0 Shorts, Female, red Screen Images, Inc. $26.65 $4,797.00 30 days
6 150.0 Swim Trunks, Male, red Screen Images, Inc. $22.75 $3,412.00 30 days
7 90.0 Female Durafast Maxback Suit, red Screen Images, Inc. $38.35  $3,451.50 30 days
8 40.0 Female Durafast Maxback, Two-piece Screen Images, Inc. $38.35  $1,534.00 30 days
Suit, red
9 20.0 Classic Oxford L/S Shirt, Male, white  Screen Images, Inc. $17.98 $ 359.60 30 days
10 20.0 Classic Oxford L/S Shirt, Female Screen Images, Inc. $17.98 § 359.60 30 days
11 50.0 Rapid Dry Polo Shirt, Male Screen Images, Inc. $21.89  $1,094.50 30 days
12 40.0 Rapid Dry Polo Shirt, Female Screen Images, Inc. $21.89 $ 875.60 30 days
13 30.0 Cargo Shorts, Male Screen Images, Inc. $16.64 $ 499.20 30 days
14 35.0 Shorts, Female, 8” Screen Images, Inc. $1294 § 45290 30 days
15 30.0 Dress, Pants, Male Screen Images, Inc. $1424 § 427.20 30 days
16 20.0 Dress Pants, Female Screen Images, inc. $1268 § 253.60 30 days
17 75.0 Hooded Sweatshirt Screen Images, Inc. $ 990 $ 74250 30 days
18 75.0 Sweatshirt, 1x1 Rib Knit Screen Images, Inc. $ 582 $ 436.50 30 days



THIS IS ARECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD.
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON:

’%\B thi/ses

APPR

19
20
21
22
23

100.0
200
20.0
15.0
15.0

Sweatpants, Drawsting Waistband

Windbreaker Jacket
Windbreaker, Pants

Jacket, 100% Polyester
Pants, 100% Polyester

Screen Images, inc. $ 732 §$ 732.00 30 days
Screen Images, Inc. $ 21.89 §$ 437.80 30 days
Screen Images, Inc. $ 2189 § 437.80 30 days
Screen Images, Inc. $ 26.78 $ 401.70 30 days
Screen Images, Inc. $2580 $ 387.00 30 days

25% off list price for any other items department may add. Screen Print or embroidery will be done on all shirts and pants.

A
///JOH J.V
PURCHA R

(DATE)

ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION BY
. DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: é’ Ol lQ Z

APPROVED:
( \i:>n~«tz¥xx»A4/” L{(%DO‘(Df}
JAY HART, DIRECTOR (DATE)

PARKS & RECREATION



REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-152-BH
BID TITLE: UNIFORMS FOR AQUATICS SECTION

City of Albuquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM I
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From ltem No.: 1 To ltem No.: 1

$1,575.00 $1,496.25 SCREEN IMAGES INC.

$2,750.00 $2,612.50 SUMMIT IMPRINTS, LLC
From ltem No.: 2 To ltem No.: 2

$1,850.00 $1,757.50 SCREEN IMAGES INC.

$3,125.00 $2,968.75 SUMMIT IMPRINTS, LLC
From ltem No.: 3 Toltem No.: 3

$1,809.50 $1,719.02 SCREEN IMAGES INC.

$2,800.00 $2,660.00 SUMMIT IMPRINTS, LLC
From ltem No.: 4 To item No.; 4

$2,128.00 $2,021.60 SCREEN IMAGES INC.

$3,062.50 $2,909.38 SUMMIT iIMPRINTS, LLC
From item No.: 5 To ltem No.; 5

$4,680.00 $4,446.00 SUMMIT IMPRINTS, LLC

$4,797.00 $4,557.15 SCREEN IMAGES INC.
From ltem No.: 6 Toltem No.: 6

$3,412.50 $3,241.88 SCREEN IMAGES INC.

$6,000.00 $5,700.00 SUMMIT IMPRINTS, LLC
From Iltem No.: 7 To ltem No.: 7

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'

April 18, 2007
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REQUEST FOR BiD NUMBER: RFB2007-152-BH
BID TITLE: UNIFORMS FOR AQUATICS SECTION
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
$3,451.50 $3,278.92 SCREEN IMAGES INC.
$6,300.00 $5,885.00 SUMMIT IMPRINTS, LLC

From ltem No.: 8 To item No.. 8
$1,534.00 $1,457.30 SCREEN IMAGES INC.
$2,800.00 $2,660.00 SUMMIT IMPRINTS, LLC

From ltem No.: 9 To ltem No.. 9

$359.60 $341.62 SCREEN IMAGES INC.
$360.00 $342.00 SUMMIT IMPRINTS, LLC

From item No.: 10 To ltem No.: 10

$359.60 $341.62 SCREEN IMAGES INC.
$360.00 $342.00 SUMMIT IMPRINTS, LLC

From ltem No.: 11 To ltem No.: 11

$950.00 $902.50 SUMMIT IMPRINTS, LLC
$1,094.50 $1,039.77 SCREEN IMAGES INC.

From Item No.: 12 To item No.: 12

$760.00 $722.00 SUMMIT IMPRINTS, LLC
$875.60 $831.82 SCREEN IMAGES INC.

From ltem No.: 13 To Item No.: 13

$489.20 $474.24 SCREEN IMAGES INC.
$750.00 $712.50 SUMMIT IMPRINTS, LLC

From ltem No.: 14 To ltem No.: 14

$452.90 $430.25 SCREEN IMAGES INC.

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'

April 18, 2007 Page 2 of 4



REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-152-BH

BID TITLE: UNIFORMS FOR AQUATICS SECTION
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments

$735.00 $698.25 SUMMIT IMPRINTS, LLC
From Iltem No.: 15 To Item No.: 15

$427.20 $405.84 SCREEN IMAGES INC.

$660.00 $627.00 SUMMIT IMPRINTS, LLC
From ltem No.. 16 To item No.. 16

$253.60 $240.92 SCREEN IMAGES INC.

$420.00 $399.00 SUMMIT IMPRINTS, LLC
From ltem No.: 17 To ltem No.: 17

$742.50 $705.38 SCREEN IMAGES INC.

$881.25 $837.19 SUMMIT IMPRINTS, LLC
From ltem No.: 18 To ltem No.: 18

$436.50 $414.67 SCREEN IMAGES INC.

$731.25 $694.69 SUMMIT IMPRINTS, LLC
From ltem No.: 19 To ltem No.: 19

$732.00 $695.40 SCREEN IMAGES INC.

$1,075.00 $1,021.25 SUMMIT IMPRINTS, LLC

From item No.: 20 To ltem No.. 20

$437.80 $415.91 SCREEN IMAGES INC.

$480.00 $456.00 SUMMIT IMPRINTS, LLC
From item No.: 21 To ltem No.: 21

$437.80 $415.91 SCREEN IMAGES INC.

$480.00 $456.00 SUMMIT IMPRINTS, LLC

* Denotes that at least one item in the Group was 'No Bid'

April 18, 2007
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-152-BH
BID TITLE: UNIFORMS FOR AQUATICS SECTION
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Vendor Name/Comments

item Bid Amount Discounted Bid
From Item No.: 22 To ltem No.: 22
$401.70 $381.61 SCREEN IMAGES INC.
$1,395.00 $1,325.25 SUMMIT IMPRINTS, LLC
From item No.:. 23 To ltem No.: 23
$387.00 $367.65 SCREEN IMAGES INC.
$1,095.00 $1,040.25 SUMMIT IMPRINTS, LLC

* Denotes that at least one ltem in the Group was 'No Bid'

April 18, 2007

Total Offers = 46
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Response

Vendor

City of Aibuquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Ii
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Preference

Number Name Type Delivery Notes
1 SUMMIT IMPRINTS, LLC LOCAL BUSI
2 SCREEN IMAGES INC. LOCAL BUSI

GROUP ITEM QTyYy
1 500
T-SHIRT, SHORT SLEEVED, W

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $5.5000
EXT. PRICE $2,750.00

GROUP  ITEM QTty

2 500
T-SHIRT, SHORT SLEEVE, RED
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $6.2500
EXT. PRICE $3,125.00

GROUP ITEM QTy

3 350

T-SHIRT, LONG SLEEVE, WHIT
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $8.0000
EXT. PRICE $2,800.00
April 18, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-152-BH
BID TITLE: UNIFORMS FOR AQUATICS SECTION

BID OPENING DATE: 4/18/2007

BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: {(505) 768-3320

EA
$3.1500
$1,575.00

EA
$3.7000
$1,850.00

EA
$5.1700
$1,809.50

Page 1 of 6



GROUP ITEM QTy

4 350
T-SHIRT, LONG SLEEVE, RED,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $8.7500
EXT. PRICE $3,062.50

GROUP ITEM QTY

5 180
SHORTS, FEMALE, RED, 100%
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $26.0000
EXT. PRICE $4,680.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

6 150
MALE SWIM TRUNKS, RED, 10
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $40.0000
EXT. PRICE $6,000.00

GROUP ITEM Qry

7 90

FEMALE DURAFAST MAXBACK
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $70.0000
EXT. PRICE $6,300.00

April 18, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-152-BH
BID TITLE: UNIFORMS FOR AQUATICS SECTION
BID OPENING DATE: 4/18/2007
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$6.0800
$2,128.00

EA
$26.6500
$4,797.00

EA
$22.7500
$3,412.50

EA
$38.3500
$3,451.50
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-152-BH
BID TITLE: UNIFORMS FOR AQUATICS SECTION
BID OPENING DATE: 4/18/2007
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM Qry

8 40
FEMALE DURAFAST MAXBACK
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $70.0000 $38.3500
EXT. PRICE $2,800.00 $1,534.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
9 20
CLASSIC OXFORD LONG SLEE

RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?

SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $18.0000 $17.9800
EXT. PRICE $360.00 $359.60

GROUP ITEM QTY

10 20
CLASSIC OXFORD LONG SLEE
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $18.0000 $17.9800
EXT. PRICE $360.00 $359.60

GROUP ITEM QTyYy

11 50
RAPID DRY POLO SHIRT, MAL
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BiD?
SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $19.0000 $21.8900
EXT. PRICE $950.00 $1,094.50

April 18, 2007 Page 3 of 6



GROUP ITEM QTY

12 40
RAPID DRY POLO SHIRT, FEM
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $19.0000
EXT. PRICE $760.00

GROUP ITEM QTyYy

13 30
CARGO SHORTS, MALE, CASU
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $25.0000
EXT. PRICE $750.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

14 35
SHORTS, FEMALE, 8" INSEAM,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $21.0000
EXT. PRICE $735.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

15 30

DRESS PANTS, MALE, RELAXE
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $22.0000
EXT. PRICE $660.00
April 18, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-152-BH
BID TITLE: UNIFORMS FOR AQUATICS SECTION
BID OPENING DATE: 4/18/2007
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$21.8900
$875.60

EA
$16.6400
$499.20

EA
$12.9400
$452.90

EA
$14.2400
$427.20
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-152-BH
BID TITLE: UNIFORMS FOR AQUATICS SECTION
BID OPENING DATE: 4/18/2007
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTY

16 20
DRESS PANTS, FEMALE, 1 1/2"
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $21.0000 $12.6800
EXT. PRICE $420.00 $253.60

GROUP ITEM QTY
17 75
HOODED SWEATSHIRT, DOUB

RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?

SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $11.7500 $9.9000
EXT. PRICE $881.25 $742.50

GROUP ITEM QTy
18 75
SWEATSHIRT, 1X1 RIB KNIT C

RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?

SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $9.7500 $5.8200
EXT. PRICE $731.25 $436.50

GROUP ITEM QTY

19 100

SWEATPANTS, DRAWSTRING

RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?

SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $10.7500 $7.3200
EXT. PRICE $1,075.00 $732.00
April 18, 2007
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GROUP ITEM QTY
20 20
WINDBREAKER JACKET, 100%

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $24.0000
EXT. PRICE $480.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
21 20
WINDBREAKER PANTS, 100%

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $24.0000
EXT. PRICE $480.00

GROUP ITEM QTYy

22 15
JACKET, 100% POLYESTER D
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $93.0000
EXT. PRICE $1,395.00

GROUP ITEM Qry

23 15

PANTS, 100% POLYESTER DO
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $73.0000
EXT. PRICE $1,095.00
April 18, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-152-BH
BID TITLE: UNIFORMS FOR AQUATICS SECTION
BID OPENING DATE: 4/18/2007
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$21.8900
$437.80

EA
$21.8900
$437.80

EA
$26.7800
$401.70

EA
$25.8000
$387.00
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