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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

JUNE 11, 2007

TO: JOHN J. VIGIL, PURCHASING MANAGER

FROM: DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER

SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2007- BID OPENING DATE: 5/23/2007
150-DG
TITLE: OVERHEAD DOORS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS -
REPAIR/REPLACE

| RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: VARIOUS

VENDOR
ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL PAYMENT
NO. QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT AMOUNT TERMS
1 varies OH door: Operator installed trolley Primary: Windsor Door $407.00 $6105.00 Net
2 varies “ “ jackshaft 3901-A Bogain Ave. NE $502.00 $7530.00
3 varies “ “normal headroom Albuquerque, NM 87109  $950.00 $4750.00
4 varies “ “low headroom $1000.00 $ 5000.00
5 varies “ “coiling overhead $1468.00 $11,744.00
6 varies “ “normal headroom, nominal 24 $1188.00 $4752.00
7 varies . “low headroom, nominal 24 $1238.00 $ 6190.00
8 varies “ “coiling overhead, 22 gauge $1862.00 $18,620.00
9 200 est. Hourly rate repairs — normal business hours $ 30.00 $ 6,000.00
10 150 hr est.  Hourly rate repairs — 2 man crew $ 60.00 $ 9,000.00
11 140 hr est. Hourly rate repairs — after normal bus. Hours $ 30.00 $ 4,200.00
12 60 hr. est. Hourly rate repairs — after normal bus. Hours 2 man crew $ 60.00% 3,600.00
Total $83,116.45
Discount off price list for odd sizes 20% off
Discount off price list for parts 20% off

Secondary: Overhead Door of Albuquerque
3820 Academy Parkway North
Albuguerque, NM 87109



Secondary contractor to be called ONLY when Primary contractor cannot perform work.

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUA|L AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION BY
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON: "]' 3»/07 . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: _{, Ze"_»ﬁ l o7




AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM i
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-150-DG
BID TITLE: OVERHEAD DOORS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS - REPAIR/REPLACE
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From item No.: 1 To ltem 12
$87,491.00 $83,116.45 WINDSOR DOOR SALES, INC.
$103,038.00 $103,038.00 OVERHEAD DOOR OF ALBUQUERQUE
$137,373.00 $130,504.35 ABC DOOR
From Item No.: 13 To Item 13
$0.05 $0.05 ABC DOOR
$0.10 $0.10 OVERHEAD DOOR OF ALBUQUERQUE
$0.20 $0.19 WINDSOR DOOR SALES, INC.
From ltem No.: 14 To ltem 14
$0.10 $0.10 OVERHEAD DOOR OF ALBUQUERQUE
$0.20 $0.19 ABC DOOR
$0.20 $0.19 WINDSOR DOOR SALES, INC.

Total Offers 9

* Denotes that at least one ltem in the Group was 'No
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GROUP ITEM QTy

1 7 5
DOORS - LOW HEADROOM.
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $2,196.0000
EXT. PRICE $10,980.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 8 10
DOOR - COILING OVERHEAD,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $2,640.0000
EXT. PRICE $26,400.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 9 200
HOURLY RATE FOR
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU HR
UNIT $58.0000
EXT. PRICE $11,600.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 10 150
SAME AS 9, EXCEPT WITH A
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU HR
UNIT $106.0000
EXT. PRICE $15,900.00

June 11, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-150-DG
BID TITLE: OVERHEAD DOORS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS - REPAIR/REPLACE
BID OPENING DATE: 5/23/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2

EA
$1,238.0000
$6,190.00

2

EA
$1,862.0000
$18,620.00

2

HR
$30.0000
$6,000.00

2

HR
$60.0000
$9,000.00

3

EA
$1,335.0000
$6,675.00

3

EA
$2,178.0000
$21,780.00

3

HR
$40.0000
$8,000.00

3

HR
$60.0000
$9,000.00
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GROUP ITEM Qry
1 1 140
HOURLY RATE FOR

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU HR
UNIT $87.0000
EXT. PRICE $12,180.00
GROUP  ITEM QTy

1 12 60
SAME AS #11, EXCEPT WITH
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $155.0000
EXT. PRICE $9,300.00
GROUP ITEM Qry

2 13 1
PROVIDE A DISCOUNT OFF
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $0.0500
EXT. PRICE $0.05
GROUP ITEM QTy

3 14 1
A PARTS PRICE LIST FOR
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $0.2000
EXT. PRICE $0.20

June 11, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-150-DG
BID TITLE: OVERHEAD DOORS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS - REPAIR/REPLACE
BID OPENING DATE: 5/23/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2

HR
$30.0000
$4,200.00

2

EA
$60.0000
$3,600.00

EA
$0.2000
$0.20

EA
$0.2000
$0.20

3

HR
$50.0000
$7,000.00

3

EA
$60.0000
$3,600.00

EA
$0.1000
$0.10

EA
$0.1000
$0.10
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