CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE
ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
JUNE 20, 2005

TO: RONN JONES, PURCHASING OFFICER

FROM: SHIRLEY GRIEGO, SENIOR BUYER uj

SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER BID OPENING DATE: 6/08/2005
RFB2005-166-SG
TITLE: FABRICATED METER PITS (VAULTS)

| RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: WATER UTILITY DEPT

ITEM ITEM VENDOR TOTAL PAYMENT
NO. QUANTITY DESCRIPTION RECOMMENDED UNIT AMOUNT TERMS
1 AS NEEDED FABRICATED METER PITS BAKER UTILITY SUPPLY CORP $105,126.75 NET 30
(VAULTS) 2351 AZTEC NE

ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87107

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION BY

ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON: 6/30/05 DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: 6/23/05
APPROVED: = APPROVED: )

Ul st ittt o fop LI o,
RONN JONES (DATE) R@Y’QGBINSON (DATE)

PURCHASING OFFICE /WATER UTILITY DEPARTMENT DIRECTOR



Item

City of Albuquerque

AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM i
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-166-SG
BID TITLE: FABRICATED METER PITS (VAULTS)
SHIRLEY GRIEGO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments

From ltem No.: 1 To ltem No.:

6

$105,126.75 $99,870.41 BAKER UTILITY SUPPLY CORP.
$100,360.00 $100,360.00 ARMORCAST PRODUCTS COMPANY
$109,592.00 $104,112.40 ENVIRONMENTAL SYSTEMS
$117,086.15 $117,086.15 NATIONAL WATERWORKS

Total Offers = 4

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid’

June 20, 2005
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City of Albuquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM i
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response  Vendor Preference
Number Name Type Delivery Notes
1 ENVIRONMENTAL SYSTEMS LOCAL BUSI 1-2 WEEKS ARO
2 ARMORCAST PRODUCTS COMPANY 7-10 WORKING DAYS TO SHIP ARO
3 BAKER UTILITY SUPPLY CORP. LOCAL BUSI STOCK TO 4 WKS ARO
4 NATIONAL WATERWORKS 7-10 DAYS

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-166-SG
BID TITLE: FABRICATED METER PITS (VAULTS)
BID OPENING DATE: 6/8/2005
SHIRLEY GRIEGO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320
GROUP ITEM QTY
1 1 20
4'X5 X3 -FABRICATED METE

RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $393.6400 $360.5000 $377.6200 $420.5600
EXT. PRICE $7,872.80 $7,210.00 $7,552.40 $8,411.20
GRCOUP ITEM QTyY

1 2 20
4' X 6' X 3 - FABRICATED METE
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $485.9400 $445.0000 $466.1300 $519.1700
EXT. PRICE $9.718.80 $8,900.00 $9,322.60 $10,383.40
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GROUP ITEM QTY

1 3 15
4' X 8 X3 - FABRICATED METE
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $655.2000
EXT. PRICE $9,828.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 4 20
LID FOR ITEM #1
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $1,135.6800
EXT. PRICE $22,713.60

GROUP  ITEM QTyYy

1 5 20
LID FORITEM #2
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $1,261.2300
EXT. PRICE $25,224.60

GROUP  |TEM QTY

1 6 15
LIDFORITEM #3
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $2,282.2800
EXT. PRICE $34,234.20

June 20, 2005

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-166-SG
BID TITLE: FABRICATED METER PITS (VAULTS)
BID OPENING DATE: 6/8/2005
SHIRLEY GRIEGO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$600.0000
$9,000.00

EA
$1,040.0000
$20,800.00

EA
$1,155.0000
$23,100.00

EA
$2,090.0000
$31,350.00

EA
$628.5000
$9,427.50

EA
$1,089.4000
$21,788.00

EA
$1,209.8600
$24,197.20

EA
$2,189.2700
$32,839.05

EA
$700.0000
$10,500.00

EA
$1,213.3300
$24,266.60

EA
$1,347.5000
$26,950.00

EA
$2,438.3300
$36,574.95
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