CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE
ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
JULY 28, 2005

TO: RONN JONES, PURCHASING OFFICER

FROM: SHIRLEY GRIEGO, SENIOR BUYER .»z»\j,/

SUBJECT. RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER BID OPENING DATE: 7/27/2005
RFB2005-191-SG
TITLE: ENDYN CHECK VALVES

| RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: WATER UTILITY DEPT

ITEM ITEM VENDOR TOTAL PAYMENT
NO. QUANTITY DESCRIPTION RECOMMENDED UNIT AMOUNT TERMS
1 1 ENDYN CHECK VALVES ENDYNLTD $8,235.36 NET 30

300 WEST FIRST STREET
ALICE, TX 78332

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION BY

ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON: 8-11-05 DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: 8-4-05
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PURCHASING & " WATER UTILITY DEPARTMENT DIRECTOR



Uity of Albuquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Ii
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-191-SG
BID TITLE: ENDYN CHECK VALVE ASSEMBLIES
SHIRLEY GRIEGO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From ltem No.: 1 Toltem No.: 3
$8,235.36 $8,235.36 ENDYNLTD
$9,138.00 $9,138.00 WAUKESHA-PEARCE IND.
$10,239.60 $9,727.62 GEORGE S. THOMSON
$11,068.00 $11,068.00 WISCO SUPPLY

Total Offers = 4

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'
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GROUP ITEM

1

Uity of Albuquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM II
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response Vendor Preference
Number Name Type Delivery Notes
1 WISCO SUPPLY 1 WEEK ARO
2 ENDYN LTD STOCK-1 WEEK AFTER AWARD
3 WAUKESHA-PEARCE IND. 1-2 WEEKS
4 GEORGE S. THOMSON LOCAL BUSI 7/25/05

QTY

36

ENDYN MANUFACTURED CHE

RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU

UNIT PRICE
EXT. PRICE

GROUP ITEM

1

1

EA

$295.0000
$10,620.00

QTY

8

ENDYN MANUFACTURED CHE

RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU

UNIT PRICE
EXT. PRICE

July 28, 2005

1

EA
$20.0000
$160.00

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-191-SG

BID TITLE: ENDYN CHECK VALVE ASSEMBLIES

BID OPENING DATE: 7/27/2005

SHIRLEY GRIEGO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$225.5000
$8,118.00

EA
$12.7500
$102.00

3 4

EA EA
$250.0000 $280.0000
$9,000.00 $10,080.00
3 4

EA EA
$15.0000 $17.2500
$120.00 $138.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY

1 3 12

ENDYN MANUFACTURED BALL,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $24.0000
EXT. PRICE $288.00

July 28, 2005

EA
$1.2800
$15.36

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-191-SG
BID TITLE: ENDYN CHECK VALVE ASSEMBLIES
BID OPENING DATE: 7/27/2005
SHIRLEY GRIEGO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$1.5000
$18.00

EA
$1.8000
$21.60
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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

INTER-OFFICE CORRESPONDENCE REF. RFB2005-191-SG
JULY 28, 2005

TO: RONN D. JONES, PURCHASING OI.M_ W

FROM: SHIRLEY GRIEGO, SENIOR mc<mmﬁm gmw

SUBJECT: BID NO. RFB2005-191-SG TITLE: ENDYN CHECK VALVE ASSEMBLIES

BID OPENING 7/27/2005
BIDS SUBMITTED: 4
RECOMMENDATION:

Bid packages for RFB2005-191-SG were mailed to nine prospective vendors, the bid was posted to the City Web, and it
was advertised in the Albuquerque Journal, and Tribune.

The recommendation for award of RFB2005-191-SG is to Endyn LTD. Endyn LTD. is the manufacture, and is responsive
to the specifications of the cited model with no exceptions requested.




