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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE
ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
APRIL 2, 2007
TO: JOHN J. VIGIL, PURCHASING MANAGER
FROM:  KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER
SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2007-133-KD BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007

TITLE: SOUND SYSTEM FOR VSA ARTS NM

I RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: FAMILY & COMMUNITY

VENDOR
ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL PAYMENT
NO.  QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT AMOUNT TERMS
SEE TABULATION REPORT SOUND PRODUCTIONS, INC. SEE TABUALTION REPORT N30
10480 SHADY TRAIL #104

DALLAS, TX 75220

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION BY
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON: k\ *\1-07] . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: ' q ‘07

ARPROVED: ) -
%ﬁ@w(//mﬂ H-3.0
VALORIE VIGIL, DIRECTOR () — (DATE)
FAMILY & COMMUNITY SERVICES




Item

ity of Albuguerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM i
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-133-KD
BID TITLE: SOUND SYSTEM FOR VSA ARTS NM

KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments

From item No.:

1

To Item No.: 21

$5,679.30

$6,431.18
$10,788.32
$11,383.40
$11,740.60
$12,397.00
$11,966.00
$12,794.00
$13,051.76

$5,679.30

$6,431.18
$10,788.32
$11,383.40
$11,740.60
$11,777.15
$11,966.00
$12,794.00
$13,051.76

# VALIANT IMC
* LONG'S ELECTRONICS

- *B&HPHOTO

SOUND PRODUCTIONS, INC
WASHINGTON MUSIC CENTER, INC.
GRS-TECH
WASHINGTON PROFESSIONAL SYSTEMS
SWEETWATER SOUND

‘1§J|ARKERTEK VIDEO SUPPLY

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'

April 2, 2007

Total Offers = 9
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City of Albugquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM II
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response Vendor Preference

Number Name Type Delivery Notes
1 GRS-TECH STATE BUSI 45 DAYS
2 B& H PHOTO 10-14 ARO
3 WASHINGTON PROFESSIONAL SYST 30 DAYS ARO
4 SWEETWATER SOUND 30 DAYS OR LESS
5 VALIANT IMC
6 SOUND PRODUCTIONS, INC 7-14 DAYS
7 MARKERTEK VIDEO SUPPLY 710 BUSINESS DAYS ARO
8 WASHINGTON MUSIC CENTER, INC. 15-30- DAYS ARO
9 LONG'S ELECTRONICS 7-31 DAYS ARO

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 1 6
12" 300 WATT TWO-WAY COM

RESPONSE 1

NO BID?

SKU EA

UNIT PRICE $485.0000

EXT. PRICE $2,910.00
April 2, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-133-KD
BID TITLE: SOUND SYSTEM FOR VSA ARTS NM
BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$504.0000
$3,024.00

EA
$461.0000
$2,766.00

EA
$481.0000
$2,886.00

EA
$476.0000
$2,856.00
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REQUEST FOR BiD NUMBER: RFB2007-133-KD
BID TITLE: SOUND SYSTEM FOR VSA ARTS NM
BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 1 6

12" 300 WATT TWO-WAY COM

RESPONSE 6 7
NO BID?

SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $420.0000 $522.0000
EXT. PRICE $2,520.00 $3,132.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 2 3
POWER AMPLIFIERS (SEE PA

RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?

SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $801.0000 $897.0000
EXT. PRICE $2,403.00 $2,691.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 2 3
POWER AMPLIFIERS (SEE PA

RESPONSE 6 7
NO BID?

SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $895.0000 $1,035.5000
EXT. PRICE $2,685.00 $3,106.50

GROUP ITEM Qry

1 3 2
NL-2 SUBSNAKE 4 CIRCUITS X
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID? Y
SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $207.0000 $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $414.00 $0.00
April 2, 2007

EA
$432.0000
$2,592.00

EA
$849.0000
$2,547.00

EA
$849.0000
$2,547.00

EA
$349.0000
$698.00

EA
$439.8200
$2,638.92

EA
$1,015.0000
$3,045.00

9

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$264.0000
$528.00

5

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

5

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY
1 3 2
NL-2 SUBSNAKE 4 CIRCUITS X

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $223.0000
EXT. PRICE $446.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 4 2
NL-2 CABLE 15" (SEE PAGES 7-
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $23.0000
EXT. PRICE $46.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 4 2
NL-2 CABLE 15' (SEE PAGES 7-

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $15.5000
EXT. PRICE $31.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 5 4

NL-2 CABLE 25' (SEE PAGES 7-
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $29.0000
EXT. PRICE $116.00
April 2, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-133-KD
BID TITLE: SOUND SYSTEM FOR VSA ARTS NM
BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

7

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

2

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$63.2000
$126.40

2

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$327.0000
$654.00

EA
$26.0000
$52.00

EA
$19.9500
$39.90

EA
$29.0000
$116.00

9

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$21.0000
$42.00

9

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$21.0000
$84.00

5

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

5

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY
1 5 4
NL-2 CABLE 25' (SEE PAGES 7-

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $17.6000
EXT. PRICE $70.40

GROUP ITEM QTy

1 6 2
NL-2 CABLE 50' (SEE PAGES 7-
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $33.0000
EXT. PRICE $66.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 6 2
NL-2 CABLE 50' (SEE PAGES 7-

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $24.0000
EXT. PRICE $48.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 7 2

NL-2 CABLE 75' (SEE PAGES 7-
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $47.0000
EXT. PRICE $94.00

April 2, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-133-KD
BID TITLE: SOUND SYSTEM FOR VSA ARTS NM
BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$66.3600
$265.44

2

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$95.9900
$191.98

2

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$24.9500
$99.80

EA
$39.0000
$78.00

EA
$34.9500
$69.90

EA
$49.0000
$98.00

9

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$31.0000
$62.00

9

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$66.0000
$132.00

5

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

5

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00
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GROUP ITEM QTYy
1 7 2
NL-2 CABLE 75' (SEE PAGES 7-

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $34.0000
EXT. PRICE $68.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 8 3
GRAPHIC EQUALIZERS (SEE P

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $317.0000
EXT. PRICE $951.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 8 3
GRAPHIC EQUALIZERS (SEE P
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $285.0000
EXT. PRICE $855.00

GROUP ITEM QTyYy

1 9 1

QUAD COMPRESSOR (SEE PA
RESPONSE 1
NO BIiD?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $458.0000
EXT. PRICE $458.00
April 2, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-133-KD
BID TITLE: SOUND SYSTEM FOR VSA ARTS NM
BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$111.2000
$222.40

EA
$277.8800
$833.64

EA
$314.9900
$944.97

EA
$399.9800
$399.98

EA
$47.5000
$95.00

EA
$299.0000
$897.00

EA
$294.0000
$882.00

EA
$406.0000
$406.00

9

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$313.0000
$939.00

EA
$215.6400
$646.92

EA
$497.0000
$497.00

5

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

5

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00
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GROUP ITEM QTyYy

1 9 1
QUAD COMPRESSOR (SEE PA
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $412.0000
EXT. PRICE $412.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 10 1
QUAD NOISE GATE ( SEE PAG
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $458.0000
EXT. PRICE $458.00

GROUP ITEM Qry

1 10 1
QUAD NOISE GATE ( SEE PAG
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $412.0000
EXT. PRICE $412.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 1" 1
DUAL EFFECTS PROCESSOR (

RESPONSE 1

NO BID?

SKU EA

UNIT PRICE $385.0000

EXT. PRICE $385.00
April 2, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-133-KD
BID TITLE: SOUND SYSTEM FOR VSA ARTS NM
BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$459.9900
$459.99

EA
$389.9900
$389.99

EA
$439.0000
$439.00

EA
$335.0000
$335.00

EA
$414.9500
$414.95

EA
$407.0000
$407.00

EA
$414.9500
$414.95

EA
$395.0000
$395.00

9

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$497.0000
$497.00

9

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$380.0000
$380.00

5

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

5

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-133-KD
BID TITLE: SOUND SYSTEM FOR VSA ARTS NM
BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTYy
1 1 1
DUAL EFFECTS PROCESSOR (

RESPONSE 6 7 8 9
NO BID? Y
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $332.0000 $399.0000 $349.0000 $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $332.00 $399.00 $349.00 $0.00

GROUP ITEM Qry
1 12 1
DIGITAL DELAY ( SEE PAGED

RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID? Y
SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $490.0000 $426.0000 $409.0000 $484.0000 $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $490.00 $426.00 $409.00 $484.00 $0.00

GROUP ITEM Qry

1 12 1
DIGITAL DELAY ( SEE PAGED
RESPONSE 6 7 8 9
NO BID? Y
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $423.0000 $469.1000 $449.0000 $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $423.00 $469.10 $449.00 $0.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 13 6
MICROPHONE FOR VOCALS (
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $105.0000 $79.9900 $82.0000 $91.0000 $90.2800
EXT. PRICE $630.00 $479.94 $492.00 $546.00 $541.68

April 2, 2007 Page 7 of 12



GROUP ITEM QTY
1 13 6
MICROPHONE FOR VOCALS (

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $94.0000
EXT. PRICE $564.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 14 6
MICROPHONE FOR INSTRUME
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $95.0000
EXT. PRICE $570.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 14 6
MICROPHONE FOR INSTRUME

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $75.0000
EXT. PRICE $450.00

GROUP ITEM QTty

1 15 4
MICROPHONE FOR INSTRUME
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA

UNIT PRICE $326.0000

EXT. PRICE $1,304.00
April 2, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-133-KD
BID TITLE: SOUND SYSTEM FOR VSA ARTS NM
BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$89.1000
$534.60

EA
$74.9900
$449.94

EA
$88.1000
$528.60

EA
$251.5500
$1,006.20

EA
$85.0000
$510.00

EA
$76.0000
$456.00

EA
$83.0000
$498.00

EA
$299.0000
$1,196.00

EA
$91.8300
$550.98

EA
$81.0000
$486.00

EA
$83.0400
$498.24

EA
$349.0000
$1,396.00

EA
$81.6400
$489.84

EA
$331.2900
$1,325.16
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GROUP ITEM QTY
1 15 4
MICROPHONE FOR INSTRUME

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $289.0000
EXT. PRICE $1,156.00

GROUP ITEM QTYy
1 16 1
MICROPHONE FOR INSTRUME

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $150.0000
EXT. PRICE $150.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 16 1
MICROPHONE FOR INSTRUME

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $135.0000
EXT. PRICE $135.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 17 6
DIRECT - DI- BOXES ( SEE PA

RESPONSE 1

NO BID?

SKU EA

UNIT PRICE $38.0000

EXT. PRICE $228.00
Aprit 2, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-133-KD
BID TITLE: SOUND SYSTEM FOR VSA ARTS NM
BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$331.5500
$1.326.20

EA
$114.8900
$114.89

EA
$170.1000
$170.10

EA
$31.9900
$191.94

EA
$299.0000
$1,196.00

EA
$139.0000
$139.00

EA
$149.0000
$149.00

EA
$42.0000
$252.00

EA
$377.7800
$1,511.12

EA
$138.0000
$138.00

EA
$172.0000
$172.00

EA
$38.0000
$228.00

EA
$129.3600
$129.36

5

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00
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GROUP ITEM QTy

1 17 6
DIRECT - Di- BOXES ( SEE PA
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $35.0000
EXT. PRICE $210.00

GROUP ITEM QTYy
1 18 4
XLRM-XLRF CABLE 15' (SEE P

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $17.0000
EXT. PRICE $68.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 18 4
XLRM-XLRF CABLE 15' (SEE P

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $15.0000
EXT. PRICE $60.00

GROUP ITEM Qry

1 19 8
XLRM-XLRF CABLE 25 ' (SEE P
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA

UNIT PRICE $22.0000

EXT. PRICE $176.00
April 2, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-133-KD
BID TITLE: SOUND SYSTEM FOR VSA ARTS NM
BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007
KELL! DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$37.0500
$222.30

EA
$11.9900
$47.96

EA
$14.7900
$59.16

EA
$14.9900
$119.92

EA
$34.5000
$207.00

EA
$15.0000
$60.00

EA
$14.9500
$59.80

EA
$18.0000
$144.00

9

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$10.0000
$40.00

EA
$4.9500
$19.80

EA
$13.0000
$104.00

EA
$6.1000
$24.40

EA
$7.2000
$57.60
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GROUP ITEM QTYy
1 19 8
XLRM-XLRF CABLE 25 ' (SEE P

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $19.0000
EXT. PRICE $152.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 20 8
XLRM-XLRF CABLE 50' ( SEE P
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $30.0000
EXT. PRICE $240.00

GROUP ITEM Qry

1 20 8
XLRM-XLRF CABLE 50' ( SEE P
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $27.0000
EXT. PRICE $216.00

GROUP ITEM QTy

1 21 6
MICROPHONE STANDS ( SEE
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA

UNIT PRICE $40.0000

EXT. PRICE $240.00
April 2, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-133-KD
BID TITLE: SOUND SYSTEM FOR VSA ARTS NM
BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$15.9900
$127.92

EA
$18.9900
$151.92

EA
$22.9500
$183.60

EA
$21.0000
$126.00

EA
$17.5000
$140.00

EA
$26.0000
$208.00

EA
$27.9500
$223.60

EA
$25.0000
$150.00

EA
$7.9500
$63.60

EA
$17.0000
$136.00

EA
$14.9500
$119.60

EA
$24.0000
$144.00

EA
$10.6000
$84.80

EA
$28.4100
$170.46
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GROUP ITEM QTY

1 21 6
MICROPHONE STANDS ( SEE
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA

UNIT PRICE $23.0000

EXT. PRICE $138.00
April 2, 2007

EA
$23.7500
$142.50

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-133-KD
BID TITLE: SOUND SYSTEM FOR VSA ARTS NM
BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$24.9500
$149.70

EA
$35.0000
$210.00
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