ROA, RFB2007-051-BH, Page 1
CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

DECEMBER 8, 2006
TO: JOHN J. VIGIL, PURCHASING MANAGER

FROM:Q} BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER

SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2007- BID OPENING DATE: 11/15/2006
051-BH
TITLE: BOARD-UP AND CLEAN-UP SERVICES

| RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BiD OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: PLANNING

VENDOR
ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL
NO. QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT AMOUNT
1 1 PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR BOARD-UP VIGIL CONTRACTING $120.00 $120.00
SERVICES PER DOOR OPENINGS
2 1 PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR BOARD-UP VIGIL CONTRACTING $80.00 $80.00
SERVICES PER WINDOW OPENINGS
3 1 PROVIDE PER CUBIC YARD PRICE FOR VIGIL CONTRACTING $30.00 $30.00
YARD AND TRASH REMOVAL
4 1 PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR REMOVAL VIGIL CONTRACTING $1,000.00 $1,000.00
OF ABANDONED VEHICLE(S)
1 1 PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR BOARD-UP DJC CONSTRUCTION $90.00 $90.00
SERVICES PER DOOR OPENINGS
2 1 PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR BOARD-UP DJC CONSTRUCTION $75.00 $75.00
SERVICES PER WINDOW OPENINGS
3 1 PROVIDE PER CUBIC YARD PRICE FOR DJC CONSTRUCTIOIN $150.00 $150.00
YARD AND TRASH REMOVAL
4 1 PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR REMOVAL DJC CONSTRUCTION $200.00 $200.00
OF ABANDONED VEHICLE(S)
1 1 PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR BOARD-UP NATIVE SON $75.00 $75.00
SERVICES PER DOOR OPENINGS




PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR BOARD-UP NATIVE SON $70.00 $70.00
SERVICES PER WINDOW OPENINGS
PROVIDE PER CUBIC YARD PRICE FOR NATIVE SON $100.00 $100.00
YARD AND TRASH REMOVAL
PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR REMOVAL NATIVE SON $95.00 $95.00
OF ABANDONED VEHICLE(S)
PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR BOARD-UP BACA'S TREES $127.18 $127.18
SERVICES PER DOOR OPENINGS
PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR BOARD-UP BACA’S TREES $87.63 $87.63
SERVICES PER WINDOW OPENINGS
PROVIDE PER CUBIC YARD PRICE FOR BACA'S TREES $29.65 $29.65
YARD AND TRASH REMOVAL
PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR REMOVAL BACA'S TREES $158.18 $158.18
OF ABANDONED VEHICLE(S)
PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR BOARD-UP JACKSON EQUIPMENT $280.00 $280.00
SERVICES PER DOOR OPENINGS
PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR BOARD-UP JACKSON EQUIPMENT $175.00 $175.00
SERVICES PER WINDOW OPENINGS
PROVIDE PER CUBIC YARD PRICE FOR JACKSON EQUIPMENT $52.50 $52.50
YARD AND TRASH REMOVAL
PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR REMOVAL JACKSON EQUIPMENT $210.00 $210.00
OF ABANDONED VEHICLE(S)
PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR BOARD-UP C & R HAULING $75.00 $75.00
SERVICES PER DOOR OPENINGS
PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR BOARD-UP C & RHAULING $27.00 $27.00
SERVICES PER WINDOW OPENINGS
PROVIDE PER CUBIC YARD PRICE FOR C & R HAULING $15.00 $15.00
YARD AND TRASH REMOVAL
PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR REMOVAL C & R HAULING $25.00 $25.00
OF ABANDONED VEHICLE(S)
PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR BOARD-UP ACT ENTERPRISES $60.00 $60.00
SERVICES PER DOOR OPENINGS
PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR BOARD-UP ACT ENTERPRISES $45.00 $45.00
SERVICES PER WINDOW OPENINGS
PROVIDE PER CUBIC YARD PRICE FOR ACT ENTERPRISES $25.00 $25.00
YARD AND TRASH REMOVAL
PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR REMOVAL ACT ENTERPRISES $100.00 $100.00

OF ABANDONED VEHICLE(S)




1 1 PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR BOARD-UP | HOLMAN'S PROPERTY SERVICES, $150.00 $150.00
SERVICES PER DOOR OPENINGS LLC

2 1 PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR BOARD-UP | HOLMAN'S PROPERTY SERVICES, $120.00 $120.00
SERVICES PER WINDOW OPENINGS LLC

3 1 PROVIDE PER CUBIC YARD PRICE FOR HOLMAN'S PROPERTY SERVICES, $150.00 $150.00
YARD AND TRASH REMOVAL LLC

4 1 PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR REMOVAL HOLMAN'S PROPERTY SERVICES, $200.00 $200.00
OF ABANDONED VEHICLE(S) LLC

THIS IS ARECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION BY
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON: \Q./I :1,;.} 0l . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: lQ,! 16'0 L

ROVED:
(bt / 77//3/06
RICHARD DINEEN, DIRECTOR " (DATE)

PLANNING




Item

City of Albugquergue
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM I|
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-051-BH
BID TITLE: BOARD-UP AND CLEAN-UP SERVICES
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments

From Item No.: 1

To ltem No.: 4
$142.00 $134.90 C & R HAULING
$175.00 $166.25 A CLASSIC GLASS SHOP, INC.
BID IS NON RESPONSIVE. VENDOR DID NOT BID ALL ITEMS.
$230.00 $218.50 ACT ENTERPRISES L.L.C.
$340.00 $323.00 NATIVE SON
$402.64 $382.51 BACA'S TREES, INC.
$515.00 $489.25 DJC CONSTRUCTION
$620.00 $589.00 HOLMAN'S PROPERTY SERVICES, LLC
$717.50 $681.63 JACKSON EQUIPMENT.
$1,230.00 $1,168.50 VIGIL CONTRACTING SERVICES, INC.

Total Offers = 9

* Denotes that at least one ltem in the Group was 'No Bid'

November 30, 2006
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City of JAlbuquerque

AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM I
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response Vendor Preference
Number Name Type Delivery Notes

1 VIGIL CONTRACTING SERVICES, INC LOCAL BUSI

2 DJC CONSTRUCTION LOCAL BUSI
3 NATIVE SON LOCAL BUSI
4 BACA'S TREES, INC. LOCAL BUSI
5 JACKSON EQUIPMENT. LOCAL BUSI
6 A CLASSIC GLASS SHOP, INC. LOCAL BUSI
7 C & RHAULING LOCAL BUSI
8 ACT ENTERPRISES L.L.C. LOCAL BUSI

9 HOLMAN'S PROPERTY SERVICES, LL  LOCAL BUSI

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-051-BH
BID TITLE: BOARD-UP AND CLEAN-UP SERVICES
BID OPENING DATE: 11/15/2008
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTyY
1 1 1
PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR B

RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID?

SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $120.0000 $90.0000 $75.0000 $127.1800 $280.0000
EXT. PRICE $120.00 $90.00 $75.00 $127.18 $280.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY
1 1 1
PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR B

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $100.0000
EXT. PRICE $100.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 2 1
PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR B
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $80.0000
EXT. PRICE $80.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 2 1
PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE FOR B
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $75.0000
EXT. PRICE $75.00

GROUP ITEM QTyY

1 3 1
PROVIDE A PER CUBIC YARD
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU cYy
UNIT PRICE $30.0000
EXT. PRICE $30.00

November 30, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-051-BH
BID TITLE: BOARD-UP AND CLEAN-UP SERVICES
BID OPENING DATE: 11/15/2006
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$75.0000
$75.00

EA
$75.0000
$75.00

EA
$27.0000
$27.00

CcYy
$150.0000
$150.00

EA
$60.0000
$60.00

EA
$70.0000
$70.00

EA
$45.0000
$45.00

cY
$100.0000
$100.00

EA
$150.0000
$150.00

EA
$87.6300
$87.63

EA
$120.0000
$120.00

CY
$29.6500
$29.65

EA
$175.0000
$175.00

cY
$52.5000
$52.50
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-051-BH
BID TITLE: BOARD-UP AND CLEAN-UP SERVICES
BID OPENING DATE: 11/15/2006
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 3 1
PROVIDE A PER CUBIC YARD
RESPONSE 6 7 8 9
NO BID?
SKU CY cY CcY Cy
UNIT PRICE $0.0000 $15.0000 $25.0000 $150.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00 $15.00 $25.00 $150.00

GROUP ITEM QTYy

1 4 1
PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE PER R
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $1,000.0000 $200.0000 $95.0000 $158.1800 $210.0000
EXT. PRICE $1,000.00 $200.00 $95.00 $158.18 $210.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 4 1
PROVIDE A UNIT PRICE PER R
RESPONSE 6 7 8 9
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $0.0000 $25.0000 $100.0000 $200.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00 $25.00 $100.00 $200.00
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