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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE
ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

MAY 24, 2007
TO: JOHN J. VIGIL, PURCHASING MANAGER
FROM: BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYE@
SUBJECT: l?éEngxMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2007- BID OPENING DATE: 5/9/2007

TITLE: PAVEMENT MARKINGS & THERMOPLASTIC STRIPING

| RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: VARIOUS

VENDOR
ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL PAYMENT
NO. QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT AMOUNT TERMS
1 100,000.00 FURNISH & INSTALL, PAINT SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION $.065 $ 6,500.00 30 DAYS
(WHT OR YELLOW) 4” STRIPE
1TO 13,200 LINEAR FEET
2 200,000.00 FURNISH & INSTALL, PAINT SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION $.055 $11,000.00 30 DAYS

(WHT OR YELLOW) 4" STRIPE
13,201 TO 26,000 LINEAR FEET

3 300,000.00 FURNISH & INSTALL, PAINT SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION $.050 $ 15,000.00 30 DAYS
(WHT OR YELLOW) 4” STRIPE
26,001 OR MORE LINER FEET

4 100,000.00 FURNISH & INSTALL, SPRAY SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION $ .28 $ 28,000.00 30 DAYS
TERMO (WHT OR YELLOW) 4”
STRIPING 60 MIL, 1 TO 13,200
LINEAR FEET

5 200,000.00 FURNISH & INSTALL, SPRAY SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION $ .26 $ 52,000.00 30 DAYS
THERMO (WHT OR YELLOW)
4" STRIPING 60 MIL, 13,201 TO
26,000 LINEAR FEET

6 300,000.00 FURNISH & INSTALL, SPRAY SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION $.22 $ 66,000.00 30 DAYS

THERMO (WHT OR YELLOW)
4" STRIPING 60 MIL, 26,001 OR
MORE LINEAR FEET



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

10,000.00

100,000.00

200,000.00

300,000.00

10,000.00

200,000.00

30,000.00

40,000.00

300,000.00

400,000.00

500,000.00

30,000.00

10,000.00

FURNISH & INSTALL, XWALK, SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION
STOP BARS, & SYMBOLS

EXTRUDED 125 MIL PER SQ.FT.

FURNISH & INSTALL EXTRUDED SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION
STRIPE (WHT & YELLOW) 4”

STRIPE 90 MIL 1 TO 13,200

LINEAR FT.

FURNISH & INSTALL, EXTRUDED SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION
STRIPE (WHT OR YELLOW) 4"

STRIPE 90 MIL 13,201 TO 26,000

LINEAR FT.

FURNISH & INSTALL EXTRUDED
STRIPE (WHT OR YELLOW) 4”
STRIPE 90 MIL 26,001 OR MORE

REMOVAL OF PAINTED STRIPES,
FOR LESS THAN 500 LINEAR FT.

REMOVAL OF PAINTED STRIPES, SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION
FOR GREATER THAN 500 LINEAR FT.

REMOVAL OF THERMO STRIPES,
LESS THAN 500 LINEAR FT.

REMOVAL OF THERMO STRIPES,
GREATER TGAB 500 LINEAR FT.

REFERENCE & RE-ESTABLISH
LAYOUTS, LINEAR FT OF STRIPING
1TO 13,200 LINEAR FT.

REFERNCE & RE-ESTABLISH
LAYOUTS, LINEAR FT. OF STRIPING
13,201 TO 26,000 LINEAR FT.

REFERENCE & RE-ESTABLISH
LAYOUTS, LINEAR FT. OF STRIPING
26,001 OR MORE LINEAR FT.

FURNISH & INSTALL EXTRUDED
STRIPE (WHT) 12” STRIPE, 90 MIL
1 TO 1500 LINEAR FT.

FURNISH & INSTALL EXTRUDED
STRIPE (WHT) 24" STRIPE, 90 MIL
1 TO 350 LINEAR FT.

SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION

SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION

SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION

SAN BAR COSNTRUCTION

SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION

SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION

SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION

SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION

SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION

$2.75

$.35

$.30

$.26

$ .40

$.25

$ .45

$.30

$.01

$.005

$.002

$2.50

$4.25

$27,500.00

$35,000.00

$60,000.00

$78,000.00

$ 4,000.00

$50,000.00

$13,500.00

$12,000.00

$ 3,000.00

$ 2,000.00

$ 1,000.00

$75,000.00

$42.500.00

30 DAYS

30 DAYS

30 DAYS

30 DAYS

30 DAYS

30 DAYS

30 DAYS

30 DAYS

30 DAYS

30 DAYS

30 DAYS

30 DAYS

30 DAYS



20 10,000.00 FURNISH & INSTALL 8 LEFT TURN  SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION $140.00  $49,000.00 30 DAYS
& 8’ RIGHT TURN ARROWS, PRE-
FORMED PLASTIC (HOT OR COLD)
90 MIL, 1 TO 16 EA.

21 175.00 FURNISH & INSTALL ONLY SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION $200.00 $35,000.00 30 DAYS
LEGENDS, PREFORMED PLASTIC
(HOT OR COLD), 90 MIL, 1 TO 8 EA.

22 10.00 MOBILIZATION FOR SMALL STRIPING SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION $200.00 $2,000.00 30 DAYS
PROJECTS. (PROJECTS WITH LESS
THAN 3,000 LINEAR FT OF TOTAL
STRIPING.

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION BY
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON:__le !01 g7 . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION:

(DATE)




City of Albuguerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM i
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-162-BH
BID TITLE: PAVEMENT MARKINGS & THERMOPLASTIC STRIPING
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From ltem No.: 1 To ltem No.: 1
$6,500.00 $6,175.00 SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION CORP

$11,000.00 $10,450.00 ADVANTAGE BARRICADE & ROADMARKS
$15,000.00 $14,250.00 ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY
$20,000.00 $19,000.00 HIGHWAY SUPPLY CO. INC.

From item No.: 2 To ltem No.: 2
$11,000.00 $10,450.00 SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION CORP
$18,000.00 $17,100.00 ADVANTAGE BARRICADE & ROADMARKS
$22,000.00 $20,900.00 ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY
$24,000.00 $22,800.00 HIGHWAY SUPPLY CO. INC.

From item No.: 3 To ltem No.: 3
$15,000.00 $14,250.00 SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION CORP
$22,500.00 $21,375.00 ADVANTAGE BARRICADE & ROADMARKS
$24,000.00 $22,800.00 HIGHWAY SUPPLY CO. INC.
$30,000.00 $28,500.00 ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY

From ltem No.: 4 To ltem No.: 4
$24,000.00 $22,800.00 ADVANTAGE BARRICADE & ROADMARKS
$27,000.00 $25,650.00 ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY
$28,000.00 $26,600.00 SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION CORP
$30,000.00 $28,500.00 HIGHWAY SUPPLY CO. INC.

From item No.: 5 Toltem No.: 5

* Denotes that at least one item in the Group was 'No Bid'
May 21, 2007
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-162-BH
BID TITLE: PAVEMENT MARKINGS & THERMOPLASTIC STRIPING
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

ltem Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
$43,000.00 $40,850.00 ADVANTAGE BARRICADE & ROADMARKS
$48,000.00 $45,600.00 ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY
$52,000.00 $49,400.00 SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION CORP
$56,000.00 $53,200.00 HIGHWAY SUPPLY CO. INC.

From item No.: 6 To ltem No.: 6
$58,500.00 $55,575.00 ADVANTAGE BARRICADE & ROADMARKS
$66,000.00 $62,700.00 SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION CORP
$66,000.00 $62,700.00 ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY
$78,000.00 $74,100.00 HIGHWAY SUPPLY CO. INC.

From item No.: 7 Toltem No.: 7
$21,000.00 $19,950.00 ADVANTAGE BARRICADE & ROADMARKS
$27.500.00 $26,125.00 SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION CORP
$30,000.00 $28,500.00 HIGHWAY SUPPLY CO. INC.
$42,500.00 $40,375.00 ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY

From ltem No.: 8 To ltem No.: 8
$29,500.00 $28,025.00 ADVANTAGE BARRICADE & ROADMARKS
$35,000.00 $33,250.00 SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION CORP
$45,000.00 $42,750.00 HIGHWAY SUPPLY CO. INC.
$47,000.00 $44,650.00 ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY

From Item No.: 9 Toltem No.: 9
$55,000.00 $52,250.00 ADVANTAGE BARRICADE & ROADMARKS
$60,000.00 $57,000.00 SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION CORP
$80,000.00 $76,000.00 HIGHWAY SUPPLY CO. INC.
$90,000.00 $85,500.00 ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was ‘No Bid'

May 21, 2007 Page 2 of 5



REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-162-BH
BID TITLE: PAVEMENT MARKINGS & THERMOPLASTIC STRIPING
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From item No.: 10 To Item No.: 10
$78,000.00 $74,100.00 SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION CORP
$79,500.00 $75,525.00 ADVANTAGE BARRICADE & ROADMARKS
$105,000.00 $99,750.00 HIGHWAY SUPPLY CO. INC.
$129,000.00 $122,550.00 ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY
From ltem No.: 11 To ltem No.: 11
$4,000.00 $3,800.00 SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION CORP
$4,000.00 $3,800.00 ADVANTAGE BARRICADE & ROADMARKS
$5,000.00 $4,750.00 ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY
$15,000.00 $14,250.00 HIGHWAY SUPPLY CO. INC.
From item No.: 12 To item No.: 12
$50,000.00 $47,500.00 SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION CORP
$64,000.00 $60,800.00 ADVANTAGE BARRICADE & ROADMARKS
$80,000.00 $76,000.00 ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY
$100,000.00 $95,000.00 HIGHWAY SUPPLY CO. INC.
From ltem No.: 13 To Item No.: 13
$12,600.00 $11,970.00 ADVANTAGE BARRICADE & ROADMARKS
$13,500.00 $12,825.00 SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION CORP
$17,100.00 $16,245.00 ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY
$45,000.00 $42,750.00 HIGHWAY SUPPLY CO. INC.
From ltem No.: 14 To ltem No.: 14
$12,000.00 $11,400.00 SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION CORP
$12,800.00 $12,160.00 ADVANTAGE BARRICADE & ROADMARKS
$16,000.00 $15,200.00 ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY
$24,000.00 $22,800.00 HIGHWAY SUPPLY CO. INC.

* Denotes that at least one item in the Group was 'No Bid'

May 21, 2007 Page 3 of 5



REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-162-BH
BID TITLE: PAVEMENT MARKINGS & THERMOPLASTIC STRIPING
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From ltem No.. 15 To ftem No.: 15
$3,000.00 $2,850.00 HIGHWAY SUPPLY CO. INC.
$3,000.00 $2,850.00 SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION CORP
$3,000.00 $2,850.00 ADVANTAGE BARRICADE & ROADMARKS
$6,000.00 $5,700.00 ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY
From ltem No.: 16 To ltem No.: 16
$2,000.00 $1,900.00 HIGHWAY SUPPLY CO. INC.
$2,000.00 $1,900.00 SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION CORP
$2,000.00 $1,900.00 ADVANTAGE BARRICADE & ROADMARKS
$6,000.00 $5,700.00 ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY
From ltem No.: 17 To ltem No.: 17
$0.00 $0.00 * ADVANTAGE BARRICADE & ROADMARKS
$1,000.00 $950.00 SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION CORP
$2,500.00 $2,375.00 HIGHWAY SUPi';’LY CO. INC.
$3,750.00 $3,562.50 ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY
From item No.: 18 To Item No.: 18
$0.00 $0.00 * ADVANTAGE BARRICADE & ROADMARKS
$60,000.00 $57,000.00 HIGHWAY SUPPLY CO. INC.
$75,000.00 $71,250.00 SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION CORP
$127,500.00 $121,125.00 ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY
From ltem No.: 19 To ltem No.: 19
$0.00 $0.00 * ADVANTAGE BARRICADE & ROADMARKS
$40,000.00 $38,000.00 HIGHWAY SUPPLY CO. INC.
$42,500.00 $40,375.00 SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION CORP

* Denotes that at least one ltem in the Group was 'No Bid'

May 21, 2007 Page 4 of 5



REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-162-BH
BID TITLE: PAVEMENT MARKINGS & THERMOPLASTIC STRIPING
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
$61,000.00 $57,950.00 ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY
From ltem No.: 20 To ltem No.: 20
$0.00 $0.00 * ADVANTAGE BARRICADE & ROADMARKS
$17,500.00 $16,625.00 ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY
$38,500.00 $36,575.00 HIGHWAY SUPPLY CO. INC.
$49,000.00 $46,550.00 SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION CORP
From Iltem No.: 21 To ltem No.; 21
$0.00 $0.00 * ADVANTAGE BARRICADE & ROADMARKS
$10,500.00 $9,975.00 ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY
$26,250.00 $24,937.50 HIGHWAY SUPPLY CO. INC.
$35,000.00 $33,250.00 SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION CORP
From ltem No.: 22 To ltem No.. 22
$0.00 $0.00 * ADVANTAGE BARRICADE & ROADMARKS
$2,000.00 $1,900.00 SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION CORP
$2,500.00 $2,375.00 ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY
$5,000.00 $4,750.00 HIGHWAY SUPPLY CO. INC.

* Denotes that at least one item in the Group was 'No Bid'
May 21, 2007

Total Offers = 88

Page 5 of 5



City of Albuquergque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Il
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response  Vendor
Number Name Type Delivery Notes
HIGHWAY SUPPLY CO. INC. STATE BUSI
SAN BAR CONSTRUCTION CORP STATE BUSI

ADVANTAGE BARRICADE & ROADMA  STATE BUSI

ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY

STATE BUSI

GROUP ITEM QTy

1 100000
PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT, FO
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU LF
UNIT PRICE $0.2000
EXT. PRICE $20,000.00

GROUP ITEM QTy

2 200000

PRICE PER LLINEAR FOOT, FO
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU LF
UNIT PRICE $0.1200
EXT. PRICE $24,000.00

May 21, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-162-BH

BID TITLE: PAVEMENT MARKINGS & THERMOPLASTIC STRIPING

BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

LF
$0.0650
$6,500.00

LF
$0.0550
$11,000.00

BID OPENING DATE: 5/9/2007

LF
$0.1100
$11,000.00

LF
$0.0900
$18,000.00

LF
$0.1500
$15,000.00

LF
$0.1100
$22,000.00

Page 1 of 6



GROUP ITEM QTy

3 300000
PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT, FO
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU LF
UNIT PRICE $0.0800
EXT. PRICE $24,000.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
4 100000
PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT, FO

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU LF
UNIT PRICE $0.3000
EXT. PRICE $30,000.00

GROUP ITEM QTy

5 200000
PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT, FO
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU LF
UNIT PRICE $0.2800
EXT. PRICE $56,000.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

6 300000

PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT, FO
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU LF
UNIT PRICE $0.2600
EXT. PRICE $78,000.00
May 21, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-162-BH
BID TITLE: PAVEMENT MARKINGS & THERMOPLASTIC STRIPING
BID OPENING DATE: 5/9/2007
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

LF
$0.0500
$15,000.00

LF
$0.2800
$28,000.00

LF
$0.2600
$52,000.00

LF
$0.2200
$66,000.00

LF
$0.0750
$22,500.00

LF
$0.2400
$24,000.00

LF
$0.2150
$43,000.00

LF
$0.1950
$58,500.00

LF
$0.1000
$30,000.00

LF
$0.2700
$27,000.00

LF
$0.2400
$48,000.00

LF
$0.2200
$66,000.00

Page 2 of 6



REQUEST FOR BiD NUMBER: RFB2007-162-BH
BID TITLE: PAVEMENT MARKINGS & THERMOPLASTIC STRIPING
BID OPENING DATE: 5/9/2007
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTY

7 10000
PRICE PER SQUARE FOOT, FO
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU SF SF SF SF
UNIT PRICE $3.0000 $2.7500 $2.1000 $4.2500
EXT. PRICE $30,000.00 $27,500.00 $21,000.00 $42,500.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
8 100000
PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT, FO

RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?

SKU LF LF LF LF
UNIT PRICE $0.4500 $0.3500 $0.2950 $0.4700
EXT. PRICE $45,000.00 $35,000.00 $29,500.00 $47,000.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

9 200000
PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT, FO
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU LF LF LF LF
UNIT PRICE $0.4000 $0.3000 $0.2750 $0.4500
EXT. PRICE $80,000.00 $60,000.00 $55,000.00 $90,000.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

10 300000
PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT, FO
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU LF LF LF LF
UNIT PRICE $0.3500 $0.2600 $0.2650 $0.4300
EXT. PRICE $105,000.00 $78,000.00 $79,500.00 $129,000.00

May 21, 2007 Page 3 of 6



GROUP ITEM QY
11 10000
PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT, FO

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU LF
UNIT PRICE $1.5000
EXT. PRICE $15,000.00

GROUP ITEM QTYy
12 200000
PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT, FO

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU LF
UNIT PRICE $0.5000
EXT. PRICE $100,000.00

GROUP ITEM QTy

13 30000
PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT, FO
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU LF
UNIT PRICE $1.5000
EXT. PRICE $45,000.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

14 40000

PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT, FO
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU LF
UNIT PRICE $0.6000
EXT. PRICE $24,000.00
May 21, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-162-BH
BID TITLE: PAVEMENT MARKINGS & THERMOPLASTIC STRIPING
BID OPENING DATE: 5/9/2007
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

LF
$0.4000
$4,000.00

LF
$0.2500
$50,000.00

LF
$0.4500
$13,500.00

LF
$0.3000
$12,000.00

LF
$0.4000
$4,000.00

LF
$0.3200
$64,000.00

LF
$0.4200
$12,600.00

LF
$0.3200
$12,800.00

LF
$0.5000
$5,000.00

LF
$0.4000
$80,000.00

LF
$0.5700
$17,100.00

LF
$0.4000
$16,000.00

Page 4 of 6



GROUP ITEM Qry
15 300000
PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT, FO

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU LF
UNIT PRICE $0.0100
EXT. PRICE $3,000.00

GROUP ITEM QTy

16 400000
PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT, FO
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU LF
UNIT PRICE $0.0050
EXT. PRICE $2,000.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

17 500000
PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT, FO
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU LF
UNIT PRICE $0.0050
EXT. PRICE $2,500.00

GROUP ITEM QTyY

18 30000

FURNISH ANID INSTALL EXTRU
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU LF
UNIT PRICE $2.0000
EXT. PRICE $60,000.00
May 21, 2007

REQUEST FOR BiD NUMBER: RFB2007-162-BH
BID TITLE: PAVEMENT MARKINGS & THERMOPLASTIC STRIPING
BID OPENING DATE: 5/9/2007
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

LF
$0.0100
$3,000.00

LF
$0.0050
$2,000.00

LF
$0.0020
$1,000.00

LF
$2.5000
$75,000.00

LF
$0.0100
$3,000.00

LF
$0.0050
$2,000.00

3

Y

LF
$0.0000
$0.00

3

Y

LF
$0.0000
$0.00

LF
$0.0200
$6,000.00

LF
$0.0150
$6,000.00

LF
$0.0075
$3,750.00

LF
$4.2500
$127,500.00

Page 5 of 6



GROUP ITEM QTY
18 10000
FURNISH ANID INSTALL EXTRU

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU LF
UNIT PRICE $4.0000
EXT. PRICE $40,000.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

20 350
FURNISH ANID INSTALL 8' LEFT
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $110.0000
EXT. PRICE $38,500.00

GROUP ITEM QTyY

21 175
FURNISH AN D INSTALL ONLY
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $150.0000
EXT. PRICE $26,250.00

GROUP ITEM QTYy

22 10

MOBILIZATION FOR SMALL ST
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $500.0000
EXT. PRICE $5,000.00
May 21, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-162-BH
BID TITLE: PAVEMENT MARKINGS & THERMOPLASTIC STRIPING
BID OPENING DATE: 5/9/2007
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

LF
$4.2500
$42,500.00

EA
$140.0000
$49,000.00

EA
$200.0000
$35,000.00

EA
$200.0000
$2,000.00

3

Y

LF
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

3

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

3

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

LF
$6.1000
$61,000.00

EA
$50.0000
$17,500.00

EA
$60.0000
$10,500.00

EA
$250.0000
$2,500.00
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