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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE
ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

APRIL 2, 2007
TO: JOHN J. VIGIL, PURCHASING MANAGER
FROM: KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER
SUBJEC T: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2007-134-KD BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007

TITLE: PROJECTION SYSTEM FOR VSA ARTS NM

I RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: FAMILY & COMMUNITY

VENDOR
ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL PAYMENT
NO.  QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT  AMOUNT TERMS
SEE TABULATION REPORT GAMUT COMMUNICATIONS SEE TABULATION REPORT N30
8 TWIN TREE COURT

CEDAR CREST, NM 87008

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVI%SN B O 7
L

ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON: & n . . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION:
. B /O ED:
(DATE) ALORIE VIGIL, DIREC (DATE)

FAMILY & COMMUNIT ERVICES




City of Albugquerque

AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM |l
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-134-KD
BID TITLE: PROJECTION SYSTEM FOR VSA ARTS NM
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From Item No.: 1 To Item No.: 12
$21,200.70 $21,200.70 * B& H PHOTO
$32,952.95 $32,952.95 * MARKERTEK VIDEO SUPPLY
$41,683.00 $39,598.85 GAMUT COMMUNICATIONS
$44,777.51 $42,538.63 GRS-TECH
$55,581.40 $52,802.33 PROFESSIONAL BUSINESS SYSTEMS, INC

* Denotes that at least one ltem in the Group was 'No Bid'
April 2, 2007

Total Offers = 5

Page 1 of 1



City of Albuguerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Ii
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-134-KD
BID TITLE: PROJECTION SYSTEM FOR VSA ARTS NM
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From Item No.: 1 To ltem No.: 1
$0.00 $0.00 * B& H PHOTO
$0.00 $0.00 * MARKERTEK VIDEO SUPPLY
$13,967.50 $13,269.12 GRS-TECH
$14,980.00 $14,231.00 GAMUT COMMUNICATIONS
$16,750.00 $15,912.50 PROFESSIONAL BUSINESS SYSTEMS, INC
From item No.: 2 To ltem No.: 2
$11,400.00 $11,400.00 B& H PHOTO
$13,980.00 $13,281.00 GAMUT COMMUNICATIONS
$17,790.00 $16,900.50 GRS-TECH
$17,291.80 $17,291.80 MARKERTEK VIDEO SUPPLY
$21,747.20 $20,659.84 PROFESSIONAL BUSINESS SYSTEMS, INC
From Item No.: 3 To item No.: 3
$5,550.00 $5,550.00 B& H PHOTO
$6,200.00 $5,890.00 GRS-TECH
$6,460.00 $6,137.00 GAMUT COMMUNICATIONS
$7,424.00 $7,052.80 PROFESSIONAL BUSINESS SYSTEMS, INC
$7,125.00 $7,125.00 MARKERTEK VIDEO SUPPLY
From item No.. 4 To ltem No.: 4
$1,530.00 $1,530.00 B& H PHOTO
$1,744.00 $1,656.80 GRS-TECH
$1,780.00 $1,691.00 GAMUT COMMUNICATIONS

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'

April 2, 2007 Page 1 of 4



REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-134-KD
BID TITLE: PROJECTION SYSTEM FOR VSA ARTS NM
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
$2,035.20 $1,933.44 PROFESSIONAL BUSINESS SYSTEMS, INC
$3,633.00 $3,633.00 MARKERTEK VIDEO SUPPLY
From ltem No.: 5 ToltemNo.: 5
$2,010.00 $2,010.00 B& H PHOTO
$2,280.00 $2,166.00 GRS-TECH
$2,340.00 $2,223.00 GAMUT COMMUNICATIONS
$3,270.00 $3,106.50 PROFESSIONAL BUSINESS SYSTEMS, INC
$3,607.50 $3,607.50 MARKERTEK VIDEO SUPPLY
From ltem No.: 6 To item No.: 6
$195.00 $185.25 GRS-TECH
$213.75 $213.75 MARKERTEK VIDEO SUPPLY
$230.00 $218.50 GAMUT COMMUNICATIONS
$339.95 $339.95 B& H PHOTO
$480.00 $456.00 PROFESSIONAL BUSINESS SYSTEMS, INC
From Item No.: 7 To ltem No.: 7
$239.00 $239.00 B& HPHOTO
$251.75 $251.75 MARKERTEK VIDEO SUPPLY
$290.00 $275.50 GAMUT COMMUNICATIONS
$301.00 $285.95 GRS-TECH
$480.00 $456.00 PROFESSIONAL BUSINESS SYSTEMS, INC
From ltem No.: 8 To item No.: 8
$0.00 $0.00 * B& H PHOTO
$270.00 $256.50 GAMUT COMMUNICATIONS
$711.00 $711.00 MARKERTEK VIDEO SUPPLY
$863.01 $819.86 GRS-TECH

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'

April 2, 2007 Page 2 of 4



REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-134-KD
BID TITLE: PROJECTION SYSTEM FOR VSA ARTS NM
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
$1,641.00 $1,558.95 PROFESSIONAL BUSINESS SYSTEMS, INC
From item No.: 9 To ltem No.: 9
$59.95 $59.95 B& H PHOTO
$60.75 $60.75 MARKERTEK VIDEO SUPPLY
$65.00 $61.75 GAMUT COMMUNICATIONS
$65.00 $61.75 PROFESSIONAL BUSINESS SYSTEMS, INC
$76.00 $72.20 GRS-TECH
From Item No.: 10 To Item No.: 10
$58.40 $58.40 MARKERTEK VIDEO SUPPLY
$68.00 $64.60 GAMUT COMMUNICATIONS
$71.80 $71.80 B& H PHOTO
$76.00 $72.20 GRS-TECH
$192.00 $182.40 PROFESSIONAL BUSINESS SYSTEMS, INC
From ltem No.. 11 To Item No.: 11
$0.00 $0.00 * B& HPHOTO
$0.00 $0.00 * MARKERTEK VIDEO SUPPLY
$880.00 $836.00 GAMUT COMMUNICATIONS
$968.00 $919.60 GRS-TECH
$1,130.00 $1,073.50 PROFESSIONAL BUSINESS SYSTEMS, INC
From item No.: 12 To item No.: 12
$0.00 $0.00 * B& H PHOTO
$0.00 $0.00 * MARKERTEK VIDEO SUPPLY
$317.00 $301.15 GRS-TECH
$340.00 $323.00 GAMUT COMMUNICATIONS
$367.00 $348.65 PROFESSIONAL BUSINESS SYSTEMS, INC

" Denotes th at at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'

April 2, 2007 Page 3 of 4



REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-134-KD
BID TITLE: PROJECTION SYSTEM FOR VSA ARTS NM
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments

Tota! Offers = 60

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'
April 2, 2007 Page 4 of 4



City of Albuguerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM i
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response Vendor Preference
Number Name Type Delivery Notes
1 GAMUT COMMUNICATIONS LOCAL BUSI ARO 30-60 DAYS
2 GRS-TECH STATE BUSI 45 DAYS

3 PROFESSIONAL BUSINESS SYSTEM LOCAL BUS! 30 DAYS ARO

4 B& H PHOTO 10-20 DAYS ARO

5 MARKERTEK VIDEO SUPPLY 14 DAYS ARO

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-134-KD
BID TITLE: PROJECTION SYSTEM FOR VSA ARTS NM
BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 1
AV MIXER (SEE PAGES 7-11 O

RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID? Y Y
SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $14,980.0000 $13,967.5000 $16,750.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $14,980.00 $13,967.50 $16,750.00 $0.00 $0.00
GROUP ITEM Qry

2
6500 LUMEN PROJECTOR (SE
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $6,990.0000 $8,895.0000 $10,873.6000 $5,700.0000 $8,645.9000
EXT. PRICE $13,980.00 $17,790.00 $21,747.20 $11,400.00 $17,291.80

April 2, 2007

Page 1 of 4



GROUP ITEM QTY

3 2
6500 LUMEN PROJECTOR LEN
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $3,230.0000
EXT. PRICE $6,460.00

GROUP ITEM Qry

4 2
6500 LUMEN PROJECTOR LEN
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $890.0000
EXT. PRICE $1,780.00

GROUP |TEM QTyY

5 6
6500 LUMEN PROJECTOR REP
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $390.0000
EXT. PRICE $2,340.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
6 1
HDTV/DVI SPLITTER (SEE PAG

RESPONSE 1

NO BID?

SKU EA

UNIT PRICE $230.0000

EXT. PRICE $230.00
April 2, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-134-KD
BID TITLE: PROJECTION SYSTEM FOR VSA ARTS NM
BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$3,100.0000
$6,200.00

EA
$872.0000
$1,744.00

EA
$380.0000
$2,280.00

EA
$195.0000
$195.00

EA
$3,712.0000
$7,424.00

EA
$1,017.6000
$2,035.20

EA
$545.0000
$3,270.00

EA
$480.0000
$480.00

EA
$2,775.0000
$5,550.00

EA
$765.0000
$1,530.00

EA
$335.0000
$2,010.00

EA
$339.9500
$339.95

EA
$3,562.5000
$7,125.00

EA
$1,816.5000
$3,633.00

EA
$601.2500
$3,607.50

EA
$213.7500
$213.75

Page 2 of 4



GROUP ITEM QTY

7 1
SDI DISTRIBUTION AMPLIFIER
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $290.0000
EXT. PRICE $290.00

GROUP |ITEM QTyYy

8 3
DVI CABLE MALE TO MALE 75'
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $90.0000
EXT. PRICE $270.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

9 1
SDI/HDTV BNC CABLE 100" (SE
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $65.0000
EXT. PRICE $65.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

10 4
SDI/HDTV BNC CABLE 10' (SEE
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA

UNIT PRICE $17.0000

EXT. PRICE $68.00
April 2, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-134-KD
BID TITLE: PROJECTION SYSTEM FOR VSA ARTS NM
BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$301.0000
$301.00

EA
$287.6700
$863.01

EA
$76.0000
$76.00

EA
$19.0000
$76.00

EA
$480.0000
$480.00

EA
$547.0000
$1,641.00

EA
$65.0000
$65.00

EA
$48.0000
$192.00

EA
$239.0000
$239.00

4
Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$59.9500
$59.95

EA
$17.9500
$71.80

EA
$251.7500
$251.75

EA
$237.0000
$711.00

EA
$60.7500
$60.75

EA
$14.6000
$58.40

Page 3 of 4



GROUP |TEM QTYy
11 2
ROAD CASES FOR PROJECTO

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $440.0000
EXT. PRICE $880.00

GROUP [TEM Q1Y

12 1

ROAD CASE FOR A/V SWITCH
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $340.0000
EXT. PRICE $340.00

April 2, 2007

EA
$484.0000
$968.00

EA
$317.0000
$317.00

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-134-KD
BID TITLE: PROJECTION SYSTEM FOR VSA ARTS NM
BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$565.0000
$1,130.00

EA
$367.0000
$367.00

4
Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

4
Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

5

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

5

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00
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