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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

NOVEMBER 29, 2007

TO: JOHN J. VIGIL, PURCHASING MANAGER

FROM: G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER

SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2008- BID OPENING DATE: 11/21/2007
071-GJ

TITLE: DIESEL FUEL FOR TRANSIT

| RECOMIMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFER ENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: TRANSIT

VENDOR
ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL PAYMENT
NO. QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT AMOUNT TERMS

FUELS PACIFIC FUEL DIST.
EVER-READY OIL CO.
SC FUELS
PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION
DIAL OIL COMPANY

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIV|S|ON BY
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON: Uk 1 \ecl . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: [H: 55.()"7

APPR : / APPROVED:
' 5 1174 @’.._.;( 72"’;(*& 15020
HNJ. VIGIL Au @a{{ (DATE) GREG PAYNE, DHMRECTOR ) (DATE)
' PURCHABING MAKA TRANSIT




City of Albugquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Il
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-071-GJ
BID TITLE: DIESEL FUEL FOR TRANSIT
G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From Item No.: 1 To Item No.: 1
$0.00 $0.00 * PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION
$0.00 $0.00 PACIFIC FUEL DIST.
$0.00 $0.00 EVER-READY OiL COADY OIL
$0.00 $0.00 SC FUELS
$46,500.00 $46,500.00 DIAL OIL COMPANYL COMPANY
From Item No.: 2 To ltem No.: 2
$0.00 $0.00 * PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION
$0.00 $0.00 PACIFIC FUEL DIST.
$0.00 $0.00 EVER-READY OIL COADY OiL
$0.00 $0.00 SC FUELS
$42,750.00 $42,750.00 DIAL OiL. COMPANYL COMPANY
From ltem No.. 3 To ltem No.: 3
$0.00 $0.00 * PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION
$0.00 $0.00 PACIFIC FUEL DIST.
$0.00 $0.00 EVER-READY OIL COADY OIL
$0.00 $0.00 SC FUELS
$42,975.00 $42,975.00 DIAL OIL COMPANYL COMPANY
From ltem No.: 4 To ltem No.: 4
$0.00 $0.00 PACIFIC FUEL DIST.
$0.00 $0.00 EVER-READY OiL COADY OiL
$0.00 $0.00 SC FUELS

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'
November 29, 2007

Page 1 of 2



REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-071-GJ
BID TITLE: DIESEL FUEL FOR TRANSIT
G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
$40,575.00 $40,575.00 PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION
$42,825.00 $42,825.00 DIAL OIL COMPANYL COMPANY

From ltem No.: 5 To ltem No.: 5

$0.00 $0.00 PACIFIC FUEL DIST.

$0.00 $0.00 EVER-READY OIL CC. .

$0.00 $0.00 SC FUELS
$35,040.00 $35,040.00 PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION
$36,195.00 $36,195.00 DIAL OIL COMPANY

Total Offers = 25

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'

November 29, 2007
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City of Albuguerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Ii
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response Vendor Preference
Number Name Type Delivery Notes
1 PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATI ARO 1 DAY

2 PACIFIC FUEL DIST.

3 EVER-READY OIL COADY OIL 24 HOUR ARO
4 SC FUELS VARIOUS
5 DIAL OIL COMPANYL COMPANY 11-29-07 24 HR NOTICE

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-071-GJ
BID TITLE: DIESEL FUEL FOR TRANSIT
BID OPENING DATE: 11/21/2007
G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 15000
DIESEL #1 PER THE TERMS A
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID? Y
SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000 $3.1000
EXT. PRICE $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $46,500.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

2 15000
DIELEL #2 PER THE TERMS AN
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID? Y
SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000 $2.8500
EXT. PRICE $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $42,750.00
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-071-GJ
. BID TITLE: DIESEL FUEL FOR TRANSIT
BID OPENING DATE: 11/21/2007
G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTty
3 15000
BLEND PER THE TERMS AND

RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID? Y

SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000 $2.8650
EXT. PRICE $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $42,975.00

GROUP ITEM Qry

4 15000
ULTRA LOVV SULFUR PER THE
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $2.7050 $0.0000 $0.0000 $2.8550
EXT. PRICE $40,575.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $42,825.00

GROUP ITEM QTy

5 15000
UNLEADED FUEL PER THE TE
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $2.3360 $0.0000 $0.0000 $2.4130
EXT. PRICE $35,040.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $36,195.00
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