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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

JANUARY 27, 2006
TO: RONN D. JONES, PURCHASING OFFICER
FROM: BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER

SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2006-
081-BH
TITLE: WINDSHIELDS & WINDSHIELD REPAIRS

BID OPENING DATE: 1/4/2006

| RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE

PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: VARIOUS

ITEM QTy. DESCRIPTION VENDOR DESIGNATION %I/PRICE
1 1 Replacement of windshields Touch of Glass Primary 78% OFF
2 1 Replacement of windshields Horizon Auto Glass, LLC Secondary 67% OFF

1 Repair of glass Chips up to 1” in diameter Safelite Fulfillment, Inc. Primary $24.95

2 1 Repair of glass cracks up to 6” long Safelite Fulfillment, Inc. Primary $24.95

3 1 Repair glass cracks greater than 6” long but Safelite Fulfiliment Inc. Primary $29.95

not longer than 12" long

4 1 Repair of glass Chips up to 1" in diameter Accessories Depot of NM, Secondary $25.00
Inc.

5 1 Repair of glass cracks up to 6” long Accessories Depot of NM, Secondary $37.50
Inc.

6 1 Repair glass cracks greater than 6” long but | Accessories Depot of NM, Secondary $50.00
not longer than 12" long Inc.




THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISIO
ISSUING A PLJRCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON:_ &, Q"/ J{¢_. DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: _ 3/ 3 /UZ/

7ty
RONN D. JONE (DATE)
PURCHASING OFEICER




City of Albugquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM I
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-081-BH
BID TITLE: WINDSHIELDS & WINDSHIELD REPAIRS
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From Item No.: 1 To temNo.: 1
$0.21 $0.20 ANDERSON GLASS COMPANY, INC.
$0.27 $0.26 SAFELITE FULLFILLMENT, INC.
$0.35 $0.33 SPEEDY GLASS
$0.40 $0.38 A CLASSIC GLASS SHOP
$0.47 $0.45 ACCESSORIES DEPOT OF NEW MEXICO
$0.67 $0.64 HORIZON AUTO GLASS, LLC.
$0.78 $0.74 A TOUCH OF GLASS
$0.79 $0.75 AUTO GLASS SERVICES, INC.
From ltem No.: 2 To tem No.: 4
$12.00 $11.40 * A TOUCH OF GLASS
$14.00 $13.30 * A CLASSIC GLASS SHOP
$25.00 $23.75 * AUTO GLASS SERVICES, INC.
$30.00 $28.50 * ANDERSON GLASS COMPANY, INC.
$70.00 $66.50 * SPEEDY GLASS
$79.85 $75.85 SAFELITE FULLFILLMENT, INC.
$112.50 $106.87 ACCESSORIES DEPOT OF NEW MEXICO
$135.00 $128.25 HORIZON AUTO GLASS, LLC.

Total Offers = 16

* Denotes that at least one ltem in the Group was ‘No Bid'
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City of Albugquergque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Ii
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response  Vendor Preference
Number Name Type Delivery Notes

1 SAFELITE FULLFILLMENT, INC. LOCAL BUSI

2 ACCESSORIES DEPOT OF NEW MEXI LOCAL BUSI

3 AUTO GLASS SERVICES, INC. LOCAL BUSI

4 ANDERSON GLASS COMPANY, INC. LOCAL BUSI

5 SPEEDY GLASS LOCAL BUSI

6 A CLASSIC GLASS SHOP LOCAL BUSI

7 HORIZON AUTO GLASS, LLC. LOCAL BUSI

8 A TOUCH OF GLASS LOCAL BUSI

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-081-BH
BID TITLE: WINDSHIELDS & WINDSHIELD REPAIRS
BID OPENING DATE: 1/4/2006
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320
GROUP ITEM QTY
1 1 1

DISCOUNT FROM MOST CURR
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $0.2710 $0.4725 $0.7900 $0.2100
EXT. PRICE $0.27 $0.47 $0.79 $0.21

January 6, 2006

$0.3500
$0.35

Page 1 of 3



GROUP ITEM QTY
1 1 1
DISCOUNT FROM MOST CURR

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $0.4000
EXT. PRICE $0.40

GROUP ITEM QTY
2 2 1
REPAIR OF AUTOMOTIVE GLA

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $24.9500
EXT. PRICE $24.85

GROUP ITEM QTY
2 2 1
REPAIR OF AUTOMOTIVE GLA

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $14.0000
EXT. PRICE $14.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

2 3 1
REPAIR OF AUTOMOTIVE GLA
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $24.9500
EXT. PRICE $24.85

January 6, 2006

$0.6700
$0.67

$25.0000
$25.00

$45.0000
$45.00

$37.5000
$37.50

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-081-BH
BID TITLE: WINDSHIELDS & WINDSHIELD REPAIRS
BID OPENING DATE: 1/4/2006
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

$0.7800
$0.78

$25.0000
$25.00

$12.0000
$12.00

$0.0000
$0.00

$30.0000
$30.00

$0.0000
$0.00

$30.0000
$30.00

$40.0000
$40.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY

2 3 1
REPAIR OF AUTOMOTIVE GLA
RESPONSE 6
NO BID? Y
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

2 4 1
REPAIR AUTOMOTIVE GLASS
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $29.9500
EXT. PRICE $29.95

GROUP ITEM QTY

2 4 1
REPAIR AUTOMOTIVE GLASS
RESPONSE 6
NO BID? Y
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

January 6, 2006

$45.0000
$45.00

$50.0000
$50.00

$45.0000
$45.00

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-081-BH
BID TITLE: WINDSHIELDS & WINDSHIELD REPAIRS
BID OPENING DATE: 1/4/2006
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

$0.0000
$0.00

$0.0000
$0.00

$0.0000
$0.00

$0.0000
$0.00

$0.0000
$0.00
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