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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

OCTOBER 11, 2007

TO: JOHN J. VIGIL, PURCHASING MANAGER

FROM: BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER

SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2008- BID OPENING DATE: 10/11/2006
062-BH

TITLE: MUSICAL INSTRUMENT RENTALS & SUPPLIES

I RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: FAMILY & COMMUNITY

VENDOR

ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL PAYMENT
NO. QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT AMOUNT TERMS

1 10 ¥a" VIOLIN, CASE, BOW, ROSINOR  ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN $16.03 $160.30 30 DAYS

2 37 %%Q\ylél!:!N, CASE, BOW, ROSINOR  ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN $16.03 $593.11 30 DAYS
3 20 3/-.EC\)/LIJ('DD‘IE_IN CASE, BOW, ROSIN OR ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN $21.38 $427.60 30 DAYS
4 4 ﬁgl\;l'g_LA, CASE, BOW, ROSINOR  ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN $16.03 $64.12 30 DAYS
5 3 1[529\3%LA, CASE, BOW, ROSINOR  ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN $16.03 $ 48.09 30 DAYS
6 3 1%93;0\0[_LA, CASE, BOW, ROSINOR  ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN $21.38 $64.14 30 DAYS
7 5 1398@1& CASE, BOW, ROSIN OR ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN $21.38 $106.90 30 DAYS
8 10 1/Lz:-”QCUIéL\LLLO, CASE, BOW, ROSINOR  ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN $37.41 $374.10 30 DAYS
9 5 ;”QéJEALLLO, CASE, BOW, ROSINOR  ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN $37.41 $187.05 30 DAYS

EQUAL



10 3 4/4 CELLO, CASE, BOW, ROSIN OR ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN $37.41 $187.05 30 DAYS

EQUAL

11 10 ESSENTIAL ELEMENTS 2000 BOOK 1 ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN $795 $ 79.50 30 DAYS
FOR VIOLIN

12 2 ¥a VIOLIN SET OF FOUR (4) ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN $36.68 $73.36 30 DAYS
DOMINANT STRINGS

13 2 Y2 VIOLIN SET OF FOUR (4) ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN $36.68 $ 73.36 30 DAYS
DOMINANT STRINGS

14 2 % VIOLIN SET OF FOUR (4) ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN $36.68 $73.36 30 DAYS
DOMINANT STRINGS

15 2 4/4 VIOLIN SET OF FOUR (4) ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN $36.68 $73.36 30 DAYS
DOMINANT STRINGS

16 2 VIOLA SET OF FOUR (4) ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN $60.00 $120.00 30 DAYS
DOMINANT STRINGS, 13"

17 2 14” VIOILA SET OF FOUR (4) ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN $ 60.00 $120.00 30 DAYS
DOMINANT STRINGS

18 2 15" VIOLA SET OF FOUR (4) ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN $60.00 $120.00 30 DAYS
DOMINANT STRINGS

19 2 va CELLO SET OF FOUR (4) ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN $45.00 $ 90.00 30 DAYS
RED LABEL STRINGS

20 2 ¥2 CELLO SET OF FOUR (4) ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN $45.00 $ 90.00 30 DAYS
RED LABEL STRINGS

21 2 % CELLO SET OF FOUR (4) ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN $45.00 $90.00 30 DAYS
RED LABEL STRINGS

22 2 4/4 CELLO SET OF FOUR (4) ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN $45.00 $90.00 30 DAYS

RED LABEL STRINGS

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION BY
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON: NIA’ . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: 0

N ,,5 o/ Lo Mm@/@ﬁ 07

/Jogl\‘j J. égL z '(DATE) VALORIE VIGIL, DIRECTOR
P ANAGER FAMILY & COMMUNITY SERVI




City of Albugquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM I
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response

Vendor

Preference

Number Name Type Delivery Notes
1 ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN SHOP LOCAL BUSI

GROUP ITEM QTY

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-062-BH
BID TITLE: MUSICAL INSTRUMENT RENTALS & SUPPLIES
BID OPENING DATE: 10/11/2006
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

1 10
1/4" VIOLIN, CASE, BOW, ROSI
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $16.0300
EXT. PRICE $160.30

GROUP ITEM QTY

2 37
1/2" VIOLIN, CASE, BOW, ROS!
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $16.0300
EXT. PRICE $593.11

GROUP ITEM QTy

3 20
3/4" VIOLIN, CASE, BOW, ROS|
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $21.3800
EXT. PRICE $427.60

October 11, 2007
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GROUP  ITEM QTy

4 4
11" VIOLA, CASE, BOW, ROSI
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $16.0300
EXT. PRICE $64.12

GROUP ITEM Qry

5 3
12" VIOLA, CASE, BOW, ROSIN
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $16.0300
EXT. PRICE $48.09

GROUP ITEM QTYy

6 3
13" VIOLA, CASE, BOW, ROSIN
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $21.3800
EXT. PRICE $64.14

GROUP ITEM QTY

7 5
14" VIOLA, CASE, BOW, ROSIN
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $21.3800
EXT. PRICE $106.90

October 11, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-062-BH
BID TITLE: MUSICAL INSTRUMENT RENTALS & SUPPLIES

BID OPENING DATE: 10/11/2006

BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: {505) 768-3320
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GROUP ITEM QTy

8 10
1/2" CELLO, CASE, BOW, ROSI
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $37.4100
EXT. PRICE $374.10

GROUP ITEM Qry
9 5
3/4 CELLO, CASE, BOW, ROSI

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $37.4100
EXT. PRICE $187.05

GROUP ITEM QTY

10 3
4/4 CELLO, CASE, BOW, ROS!
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $37.4100
EXT. PRICE $112.23

GROUP  ITEM QTy
11 10
ESSENTIAL ELEMENTS 2000 B

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $7.9500
EXT. PRICE $79.50

October 11, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-062-BH

BID TITLE: MUSICAL INSTRUMENT RENTALS & SUPPLIES

BID OPENING DATE: 10/11/2006

BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320
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GROUP ITEM  QTY
12 2
1/4 VIOLIN SET OF FOUR (4) D

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $36.6800
EXT. PRICE $73.36

GROUP ITEM Qry
13 2
1/2 VIOLIN SET OF FOUR (4) D

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $36.6800
EXT. PRICE $73.36

GROUP ITEM QTY
14 2
3/4 VIOLIN SET OF FOUR (4) D

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $36.6800
EXT. PRICE $73.36

GROUP ITEM QTY

15 2
4/4 VIOLIN SET OF FOUR (4) D
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $36.6800
EXT. PRICE $73.36

October 11, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-062-BH
BID TITLE: MUSICAL INSTRUMENT RENTALS & SUPPLIES

BID OPENING DATE: 10/11/2006

BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320
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GROUP ITEM  QTY
16 2
VIOLA SET OF FOUR (4) DOMI

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $60.0000
EXT. PRICE $120.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

17 2
14" VIOLA SET OF FOUR (4) D
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $60.0000
EXT. PRICE $120.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
18 2
15" VIOLA SET OF FOUR (4) D

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $60.0000
EXT. PRICE $120.00

GROUP ITEM QTy

19 2
1/4 CELLO SET OF FOUR ()R
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $45.0000
EXT. PRICE $90.00

October 11, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-062-BH
BID TITLE: MUSICAL INSTRUMENT RENTALS & SUPPLIES

BiD OPENING DATE: 10/11/2006

BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320
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GROUP ITEM  QTY
20 2
1/2 CELLO SET OF FOUR (4) R

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $45.0000
EXT. PRICE $90.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

21 2
3/4 CELLO SET OF FOUR (4) R
RESPONSE 1
NO BIiD?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $45.0000
EXT. PRICE $90.00

GROUP ITEM  QTY

22 2
4/4 CELLO SET OF FOUR (4) R
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $45.0000
EXT. PRICE $90.00

October 11, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-062-BH
BID TITLE: MUSICAL INSTRUMENT RENTALS & SUPPLIES

BID OPENING DATE: 10/11/2006

BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320
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City of Albugquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM il
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-062-BH
BID TITLE: MUSICAL INSTRUMENT RENTALS & SUPPLIES
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments

From Item No.:

From Item No.:

From ltem No.:

From item No.:

From Item No.:

From Item No.:

From Item No.:

From [tem No.:

To item No.:
$160.30 $152.28 ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN SHOP
To ltem No
$593.11 $563.45 ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN SHOP
To ltem No
$427.60 $406.22 ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN SHOP
To Item No.:
$64.12 $60.91 ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN SHOP
To Iltem No.:
$48.09 $45.69 ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN SHOP
To Item No.:
$64.14 $60.93 ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN SHOP
To Item No.:
$106.90 $101.56 ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN SHOP
To Item No.:
$374.10 $355.40 ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN SHOP

From ltem No.: 9

To item No.:

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'

October 11, 2007
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-062-BH
BID TITLE: MUSICAL INSTRUMENT RENTALS & SUPPLIES
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
$187.05 $177.70 ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN SHOP
From Iltem No.: 10 To Item No.: 10
$112.23 $106.62 ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN SHOP
From item No.: 11 To Item No.: 11
$79.50 $75.52 ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN SHOP
From Item No.: 12 To Item No.: 12
$73.36 $69.69 ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN SHOP
From ltem No.: 13 To item No.: 13
$73.36 $69.69 ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN SHOP
From Item No.: 14 To item No.: 14
$73.36 $69.69 ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN SHOP
From item No.: 15 To item No.: 15
$73.36 $69.69 ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN SHOP
From ltem No.. 16 To ltem No.: 16
$120.00 $114.00 ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN SHOP
From Item No.: 17 To ltem No.: 17
$120.00 $114.00 ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN SHOP
From Item No.: 18 To ltem No.: 18
$120.00 $114.00 ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN SHOP

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Big'
October 11, 2007
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-062-BH
BID TITLE: MUSICAL INSTRUMENT RENTALS & SUPPLIES
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From [tem No.: 18 To ltem No.: 19

$390.00 $85.50 ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN SHOP
From ltem No.: 20 To ltem No.: 20

$90.00 $85.50 ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN SHOP
From ltem No.: 21 To ltem No.: 21

$90.00 $85.50 ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN SHOP
From Item No.: 22 To Item No.: 22

$90.00 $85.50 ROBERTSON & SONS VIOLIN SHOP

* Denotes that at least one item in the Group was 'No Bid'

October 11, 2007

Total Offers = 22
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