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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

AUGUST 1, 2006

TO: JOHN J. VIGIL, PURCHASING MANAGE
FROM:  BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER'gy\

SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2007-
006-BH

TITLE: READY MIX CONCRETE

BID OPENING DATE: 7/27/2006

| RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: VARIOUS

ITEM QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION VENDOR RECOMMENDED FOR UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT
NO. AWARD
1 1,200 C.Y. READY MIX CONCRETE, 3000 P.S.I. ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX $100.00 $120,000.00
%" AGGREGATE
2 80C.Y. READY MIX CONCRETE 3000 P.S.I. ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX $105.00 $8,400.00
1%." AGGREGATE
3 1,000 C.Y. READY MIX CONCRETE 3000 P.S.l. ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX $120.00 $120,000.00
11/2” TO 4” ALL AROUND STONE
MATERIAL
4 100 C.Y. READY MIX CONCRETE, SEVEN BAG ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX $125.00 $12,500.00
SHOT-CRETE MIX
5 2,000C.Y. | LEAN FILL MIXTURE WITH A MINIMUM ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX $80.00 $160,000.00
ORDER OF A TRUCK LOAD
6 400 C.Y. CONCRETE READY MIX 4000 P.S.I. ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX $130.00 $52.000.00
3/8” MIXWITH CLASS F FLY ASH
7 600 C.Y. READY MIX CONCRETE 3500 P.S.I. ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX $105.00 $63,000.00
%" AGGREGATE
8 1,000 C.Y. CHARGE PER ONE MINUTE ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX $1.30 $1,300.00
INCREMENT FOR WAITING TIME
PAST ALLOWED TEN MINUTES PER
CUBIC YARD
9 600 C.Y. ADDITION OF ASTM APPROVED NON- ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX $6.10 $3,600.00
CALCIUM CHLORIDE ACCELERATOR
PER CUBIC YARD




10 400 OZ. ASTM APPROVED HIGH RANGE ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX $.12 $48.00
4 WATER REDUCER
11 40C.Y. PER CUBIC YARD FOR FIBER MESH ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX $8.00 $320.00
12 1CY. ADDITION OF “DAVIS COLORS’ ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX $32.00 $32.00
SUNSET ROSE #160
13 1C.Y. ADDITION OF “DAVIS COLORS” ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX $32.00 $32.00
OMAHA TAN #5084
14 1CY. ADDITION OF “DAVIS COLORS” SAN ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX $48.00 $48.00
DIEGO BUFF #5237
15 1C.Y. ADDITION OF “DAVIS COLORS” MIAMI ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX $32.00 $32.00
BUFF #5447
16 1CY. ADDITION OF “DAVIS COLORS” BAJA ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX $64.00 $64.00
RED #160
17 1CY. ADDITION OF “DAVIS COLORS” MESA ALBUQUERQUE REDI MiX $64.00 $64.00
BUFF #5447
18 1C.Y. ADDITION OF “DAVIS COLORS” BRICK ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX $128.00 $128.00
RED #160
19 1CY. ADDITION OF “DAVIS COLORS” TILE ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX $96.00 $96.00
RED #1117
20 1CY. ADDITION OF “DAVIS COLORS” DARK ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX $160.00 $160.00
GRAY #3860
21 1C.Y. ADDITION OF “DAVIS COLORS” PLUM ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX $64.00 $64.00
#1395
22 1C.Y. ADDITION OF “DAVIS COLORS: ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX $128.00 $128.00
GRANITE RED #1395
23 1C.Y. ADDITION OF “DAVIS COLORS” ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX $64.00 $64.00
TAUPE #677
24 400 C.Y. PRICE FOR SPECIALTY CONCRETE, ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX $150.00 $60,000.00
I.E., 6,000 P.S.I.
25 600 C.Y. ASTM APPROVED NON-CALCIUM ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX $6.10 $3,660.00
CHLORIDE ACCELERATOR PER
CUBIC YARD
26 400 OZ ADDITION OF ASTM APPROVED HIGH ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX $.12 $48.00
RANGE WATER REDUCER
27 1 GAL. COLOR SEAL II, MINIMUM PURCHASE ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX $26.00 $26.00

WILL BE IN QUANTITIES OF TWO
GALLONS




ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON:

28

1EA

PRICE FOR AFTER HOURS/AND OR
EMERGENCY DELIVERIES

ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX

$500.00

$500.00

. DATE OF RECOMMENDATION:

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION BY ,

APPROVED: -

(DATE)



City of Albuquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Il

ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT
Response Vendor Preference
Number Name Type Delivery Notes
1 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC. LOCAL BUSI
2 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS LOCAL BUSI

GROUP ITEM QTYy

1 1200
PRICE PER CUBIC YARD FOR
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU cY
UNIT PRICE $100.0000
EXT. PRICE $120,000.00

GROUP ITEM QTYy

2 80
PRICE PER CUBIC YARD FOR
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU CcYy
UNIT PRICE $105.0000
EXT. PRICE $8,400.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

3 1000

PRICE PER CUBIC YARD FOR
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU cYy
UNIT PRICE $120.0000
EXT. PRICE $120,000.00

July 27, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-006-BH

BID TITLE: READY MIX CONCRETE
BID OPENING DATE: 7/27/2006

BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

cY
$145.0000
$174,000.00

cY
$165.0000
$13,200.00

cY
$170.0000
$170,000.00
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GROUP ITEM QTYy
4 100
PRICE PER CUBIC YARD FOR

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU cY
UNIT PRICE $125.0000
EXT. PRICE $12,500.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
5 2000
PRICE PER CUBIC YARD FOR

RESPONSE 1

NO BID?

SKU cYy
UNIT PRICE $80.0000
EXT. PRICE $160,000.00

GROUP ITEM QTYy
6 400
PRICE PER CUBIC YARD FOR 4

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU cY
UNIT PRICE $130.0000
EXT. PRICE $52,000.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
7 600
PRICE PER CUBIC YARD FOR

RESPONSE 1

NO BID?

SKU CcY

UNIT PRICE $105.0000

EXT. PRICE $63,000.00
July 27, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-006-BH
BID TITLE: READY MIX CONCRETE
BID OPENING DATE: 7/27/2006
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

CcYy
$190.0000
$19,000.00

cYy
$80.0000
$180,000.00

cYy
$170.0000
$68,000.00

cY
$150.0000
$90,000.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY
8 1000
CHARGE PER ONE MINUTE IN

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU cY
UNIT PRICE $1.3000
EXT. PRICE $1,300.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
9 600
PRICE PER PERCENTAGE FOR

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU cY
UNIT PRICE $6.1000
EXT. PRICE $3,660.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
10 400
PRICE PER OUNCE FOR THE A

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU oz
UNIT PRICE $0.1200
EXT. PRICE $48.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

11 40

PRICE PER CUBIC YARD FOR A
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU cYy
UNIT PRICE $8.0000
EXT. PRICE $320.00
July 27, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-006-BH
BID TITLE: READY MIX CONCRETE
BID OPENING DATE: 7/27/2006
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

cY
$2.0000
$2,000.00

cYy
$5.0000
$3,000.00

oz
$0.1500
$60.00

cY
$7.0000
$280.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY
12 1
PRICE PER CUBIC YARDFORT

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU cYy
UNIT PRICE $32.0000
EXT. PRICE $32.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
13 1
PRICE PER CUBIC YARD FORT

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU cYy
UNIT PRICE $32.0000
EXT. PRICE $32.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

14 1
PRICE PER CUBIC YARDFOR T
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU cYy
UNIT PRICE $48.0000
EXT. PRICE $48.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
15 1
PRICE PER CUBIC YARD FORT

RESPONSE 1

NO BID?

SKU cYy

UNIT PRICE $32.0000

EXT. PRICE $32.00
July 27, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-006-BH
BID TITLE: READY MIX CONCRETE
BID OPENING DATE: 7/27/2006
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

cYy
$24.0000
$24.00

cYy
$24.0000
$24.00

cYy
$30.0000
$30.00

cYy
$30.0000
$30.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY
16 1
PRICE PER CUBIC YARDFOR T

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU cY
UNIT PRICE $64.0000
EXT. PRICE $64.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
17 1
PRICE PER CUBIC YARDFOR T

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU cY
UNIT PRICE $64.0000
EXT. PRICE $64.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
18 1
PRICE PER CUBIC YARDFOR T

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU cYy
UNIT PRICE $128.0000
EXT. PRICE $128.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
19 1
PRICE PER CUBIC YARDFOR T

RESPONSE 1

NO BID?

SKU CcY

UNIT PRICE $96.0000

EXT. PRICE $96.00
July 27, 2006

REQUEST FOR 8ID NUMBER: RFB2007-006-BH
BID TITLE: READY MIX CONCRETE
BID OPENING DATE: 7/27/2006
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

cYy
$35.0000
$35.00

cYy
$35.0000
$35.00

cY
$55.0000
$55.00

cY
$50.0000
$50.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY
20 1
PRICE PER CUBIC YARD FOR T

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU CcY
UNIT PRICE $160.0000
EXT. PRICE $160.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
21 1
PRICE PER CUBIC YARD FOR T

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU CcY
UNIT PRICE $64.0000
EXT. PRICE $64.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
22 1
PRICE PER CUBIC YARDFOR T

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU CcY
UNIT PRICE $128.0000
EXT. PRICE $128.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

23 1

PRICE PER CUBIC YARDFOR T
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU CY
UNIT PRICE $64.0000
EXT. PRICE $64.00

July 27, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-006-BH
BID TITLE: READY MIX CONCRETE
BID OPENING DATE: 7/27/2006
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

CcY
$48.0000
$48.00

CcY
$70.0000
$70.00

CcY
$85.0000
$85.00

CcY
$80.0000
$90.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY
24 1
PRICE FOR SPECILITY CONCR

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU cYy
UNIT PRICE $150.0000
EXT. PRICE $150.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
25 600
PRICE PER PERCENTAGE FOR

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU cYy
UNIT PRICE $6.1000
EXT. PRICE $3,660.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
26 400
PRICE PER OUNCE FOR THE A

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU oz
UNIT PRICE $0.1200
EXT. PRICE $48.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

27 1

PRICE PER GALLON FOR COL
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT PRICE $26.0000
EXT. PRICE $26.00

July 27, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-006-BH
BID TITLE: READY MIX CONCRETE
BID OPENING DATE: 7/27/2006
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

cYy
$180.0000
$180.00

cYy
$5.0000
$3,000.00

oz
$0.1500
$60.00

GL
$55.0000
$55.00
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-006-BH
BID TITLE: READY MIX CONCRETE
BID OPENING DATE: 7/27/2006

BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320
GROUP ITEM QTY

28 1

PRICE FOR AFTER HOUR/EME

RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?

SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $500.0000 $750.0000
EXT. PRICE $500.00 $750.00

July 27, 2006
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City of Albuquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Il
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-006-BH
BID TITLE: READY MIX CONCRETE
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From ltem No.. 1 To item No.: 1
$120,000.00 $114,000.00 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC.
$174,000.00 $165,300.00 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS
From item No.: 2 To item No.: 2
$8,400.00 $7,980.00 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC.
$13,200.00 $12,540.00 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS
From ltem No.: 3 To ltem No.: 3
$120,000.00 $114,000.00 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIXINC.
$170,000.00 $161,500.00 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS
From ltem No.: 4 To item No.: 4
$12,500.00 $11,875.00 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC.
$19,000.00 $18,050.00 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS
From item No.. 5 Toltem No.: 5
$160,000.00 $152,000.00 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC.
$180,000.00 $171,000.00 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS
From item No.: 6 To temNo.: 6
$52,000.00 $49,400.00 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC.
$68,000.00 $64,600.00 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS
From item No.: 7 To temNo.: 7

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid’

July 27, 2006
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-006-BH
BID TITLE: READY MIX CONCRETE
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
$63,000.00 $59,850.00 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC.
$90,000.00 $85,500.00 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS

From ltem No.: 8 Toltem No.: 8

$1,300.00 $1,235.00 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC.
$2,000.00 $1,900.00 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS

From ltem No.. 9 To item No.: 9

$3,000.00 $2,850.00 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS
$3,660.00 $3,477.00 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC.

From ltem No.: 10 To item No.: 10

$48.00 $45.60 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC.
$60.00 $57.00 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS

From ltem No.: 11 To ltem No.: 11

$280.00 $266.00 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS
$320.00 $304.00 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC.

From ltem No.: 12 To ltem No.: 12

$24.00 $22.80 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS
$32.00 $30.40 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC.

From ltem No.: 13 To ltem No.: 13

$24.00 $22.80 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS
$32.00 $30.40 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC.

From ltem No.: 14 To tem No.. 14

$30.00 $28.50 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was ‘No Bid'
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BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-006-BH
BID TITLE: READY MIX CONCRETE

item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
$48.00 $45.60 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC.
From ltem No.: 15 To tem No.: 15
$30.00 $28.50 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS
$32.00 $30.40 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC.
From Item No.: 16 To item No.: 16
$35.00 $33.25 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS
$64.00 $60.80 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC.
From ltem No.: 17 To ltem No.: 17
$35.00 $33.25 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS
$64.00 $60.80 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC.
From Item No.: 18 To ltem No.: 18
$55.00 $52.25 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS
$128.00 $121.60 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC.
From ltem No.: 19 To ltem No.: 19
$50.00 $47.50 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS
$96.00 $91.20 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC.
From ltem No.: 20 To Item No.: 20
$48.00 $45.60 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS
$160.00 $152.00 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC.
From Iltem No.: 21 To ltem No.: 21
$64.00 $60.80 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC.
$70.00 $66.50 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'

July 27, 2006
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-006-BH
BID TITLE: READY MIX CONCRETE
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From ltem No.: 22 To tem No.. 22
$85.00 $80.75 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS
$128.00 $121.60 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC.
From ltem No.: 23 To ltem No.: 23
$64.00 $60.80 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC.
$90.00 $85.50 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS
From ltem No.. 24 To tem No.: 24
$150.00 $142.50 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC.
$180.00 $171.00 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS
From ltem No.: 25 To temNo.. 25
$3,000.00 $2,850.00 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS
$3,660.00 $3,477.00 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC.
From ltem No.: 26 To tem No.: 26
$48.00 $45.60 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC.
$60.00 $57.00 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS
From ltem No.: 27 To tem No.: 27
$26.00 $24.70 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC.
$55.00 $52.25 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS
From ltem No.: 28 To tem No.: 28
$500.00 $475.00 ALBUQUERQUE REDI MIX INC.
$750.00 $712.50 COYOTE GRAVEL PRODUCTS

* Denotes that at least one ltem in the Group was 'No Bid'

July 27, 2006
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-006-BH
BID TITLE: READY MIX CONCRETE
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments

Total Offers = 56

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid’
July 27, 2006 Page 5of 5



