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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

DECEMBER 27, 2005

TO: RONN D. JONES, PURCHASING OFFICER
FROM: SUZANNE BOEHLAND, SENIOR BUYER
SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER BID OPENING DATE: 12/21/2005

RFB2006-072-SB
TITLE: MOTORCYCLE MAINTENANCE, REPAIR, AND PARTS

| RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY:
DEPT OF FINANCE & ADMINISTRATION

VENDOR RECOMMENDED FOR PARTS MARK-UP/
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AWARD LABOR RATE PER HOUR DISCOUNT
PDC Custom Cycles $ 85.00 15% discount off retail
1 BMW Hourly Labor Rate
Sandia BMW Motorcycles $ 80.00 BMW List Price
2 Harley-Davidson Hourly Labor Rate PDC Custom Cycles $65.00 15% discount off retail
3 Honda Hourly Labor Rate Motorsports, Inc. $63.00 Cost plus 20%
Motorsports, Inc. $63.00 Cost plus 20%
4 Kawasaki Hourly Labor Rate
PDC Custom Cycles $ 85.00 15% discount off retail
5 Suzuki Hourly Labor Rate Motorsports, Inc. $63.00 Cost plus 20%

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION BY

ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDSON:__[ / 1/ /¢ . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: __/ /9¢/ [0t
' APPROVED:
A ///,q,é_y //? S0l
RONN D. JONES (DATE) TANDA MEADORS, DIRECTOR (BATE)
PURCHASING WR DEPT OF FINANCE & ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES



AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Il

ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT
Response Vendor Preference
Number Name Type Delivery Notes
1 SANDIA BMW MOTORCYCLES LOCAL BUSI BMW LIST PRICE
2 PDC CUSTOM CYCLES 15% DISCOUNT OFF RETAIL.
3 MOTORSPORT, INC. LOCAL BUSI COST PLUS 20%.
REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-072-SB
BID TITLE: MOTORCYCLE MAINTENANCE, REPAIR, AND PARTS
BID OPENING DATE: 12/21/2005
SUZANNE BOEHLAND, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320
GROUP ITEM QTY
1 1
BMW HOURLY LABOR RATE
RESPONSE 1 2 3
NO BID? Y
SKU HR HR HR
UNIT PRICE $80.0000 $85.0000 $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $80.00 $85.00 $0.00
GROUP ITEM Qrty
2 1
HARLEY-DAVIDSON HOURLY
RESPONSE 2 3
NO BID? Y
SKU HR HR
UNIT PRICE $65.0000 $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $65.00 $0.00
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GROUP ITEM Qry

3 1

HONDA HOURLY LABOR RATE
RESPONSE 3
NO BID?
SKU HR
UNIT PRICE $63.0000
EXT. PRICE $63.00
GROUP ITEM Qry

o] 4 0
KAWASAKI HOURLY LABOR
RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU
UNIT PRICE
EXT. PRICE
GROUP ITEM Qry

0 5 0
SUZUKI HOURLY LABOR RATE
RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU
UNIT PRICE
EXT. PRICE
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-072-SB
BID TITLE: MOTORCYCLE MAINTENANCE, REPAIR, AND PARTS
BID OPENING DATE: 12/21/2005
SUZANNE BOEHLAND, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2

HR
$85.0000
$85.00

3

HR
$63.0000
$63.00

3
HR

$63.0000
$63.00
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AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM II
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-072-SB
BID TITLE: MOTORCYCLE MAINTENANCE, REPAIR, AND PARTS
SUZANNE BOEHLAND, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

item Bid Amount Discounted Vendor
From Item No.: 1 To Iltem No.:
$0.00 $0.00 * MOTORSPORT, INC.
$80.00 $76.00 SANDIA BMW MOTORCYCLES
$85.00 $85.00 PDC CUSTOM CYCLES
From Item No.: 2 To ltem No.:
$0.00 $0.00 * MOTORSPORT, INC.
$65.00 $65.00 PDC CUSTOM CYCLES
From Item No.: 3 To ltem No.:
$0.00 $0.00 * PDC CUSTOM CYCLES
$63.00 $59.85 MOTORSPORT, INC.
From ltem No.: 4 To ltem No.:
$63.00 $59.85 MOTORSPORT, INC.
$85.00 $85.00 PDC CUSTOM CYCLES
From Item No.: 5 To ltem No.:
$0.00 $0.00 * PDC CUSTOM CYCLES
$63.00 $59.85 MOTORSPORT, INC.

Total Offers = 11

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was ‘No Bid’
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