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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

APRIL 14, 2006

TO: JOHN J. VIGIL, ACTING PURCHASING OFFICER
FROM: BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYE
SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2006-

163-BH

TITLE: PARTS WASHER SERVICE

BID OPENING DATE: 4/12/2006

| RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE

PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: VARIOUS

VENDOR
ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL
NO.  QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT AMOUNT
1 1 BRAKE CLEANING CART SAFETY-KLEEN $56.79 $ 56.79
2 1 PARTS CLEANER BASIN SAFETY-KLEEN $103.97 $103.97
3 1 PARTS CLEANER BASIN SAFETY-KLEEN $130.29 $130.29
4 1 PARTS CLEANER BASIN SAFETY-KLEEN $136.64 $136.64
(SMALL PARTS)
5 1 PARTS CLEANER BASIN SAFETY-KLEEN $178.38 $178.38
(SMALL PARTS BASKET)
6 1 PNEUMATIC PARTS WASHER SAFETY-KLEEN $97.62 $97.62
7 1 FURNISH/INSTALL SOLVENT SAFETY-KLEEN $126.66 $126.66
(CITY OWNED EQUIPMENT)
8 1 FURNISH/INSTALL BRAKE SAFETY-KLEEN $79.48 $79.48
CLEANER-MODEL 26
9 1 FURNISH/INSTALL BRAKE SAFETY-KLEEN $199.25 $199.25

CLEANER-MODEL 34




THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISIQN B

ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON;_H [ 25 /0lp . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: _&f / /18[00
APPROVED:- —
< == D gl
P N D<JON ) (DATE)
U
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City of Albuquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM il
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-163-BH
BID TITLE: PARTS WASHER SERVICE
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments

From ltem No.: 1 To item No.: 10

$1,371.85 $1,371.85 SAFETY KLEEN SERVICES

Total Offers = 1

* Denotes that at least one item in the Group was 'No Bid'
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City of Albuquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Ii
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response
Number

Vendor Preference
Name Type Delivery Notes

SAFETY KLEEN SERVICES

GROUP ITEM QTy
1 1 1
BRAKE CLEANING ASBESTOS

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $56.7900
EXT. PRICE $56.79

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 2 1
20"X30" (NOMINAL) RECIRCULA

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $103.9700
EXT. PRICE $103.97

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 3 1
26"X36" (NOMINAL) CIRCULATI
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA

UNIT PRICE $130.2900

EXT. PRICE $130.29
April 14, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-163-BH
BID TITLE: PARTS WASHER SERVICE
BID OPENING DATE: 4/12/2006
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-163-BH
BID TITLE: PARTS WASHER SERVICE
BID OPENING DATE: 4/12/2006
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 4 1
36"X24" (NOMINAL) RECIRCULA

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $136.6400
EXT. PRICE $136.64

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 5 1
44"X24" (NOMINAL) RECIRCULA
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $178.3800
EXT. PRICE $178.38

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 6 1
IMMERSION CLEANER WITH P

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $397.6200
EXT. PRICE $97.62

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 7 1
FURNISH AND INSTALL SOLVE
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA

UNIT PRICE $126.6600

EXT. PRICE $126.66
April 14, 2006
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GROUP ITEM QTY
1 8 1
FURNISH AND INSTALL BRAKE

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $79.4800
EXT. PRICE $79.48

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 9 1
FURNISH AND INSTALL BRAKE

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $199.2500
EXT. PRICE $189.25

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 10 1
FURNISH AND INSTALL BRAKE

RESPONSE 1

NO BID?

SKU EA

UNIT PRICE $262.7700

EXT. PRICE $262.77
April 14, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-163-BH
BID TITLE: PARTS WASHER SERVICE
BID OPENING DATE: 4/12/2006

BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320
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