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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

JUNE 26, 2006
TO: JOHN J. VIGIL, PURCHASING MANAGER
FROM: SUZANNE BOEHLAND, SENIOR BUYER

SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER
RFB2006-173-SB
TITLE: MISCELLANEOUS PASSENGER VEHICLES

BID OPENING DATE: 6/21/2006

I RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: VARIOUS

'Lﬁy (gg% ITEM DESCRIPTION Reégaﬁéﬁkeo UNIT AMOUNT A&gﬁﬁT P#Eg&gT
: FOR AWARD
1 5 1-TON PICKUP TRUCK — VERSION 1 RICH FORD $28,982.00  $144,91000  NET 30
2 5 1-TON PICKUP TRUCK — VERSION 2 RICH FORD $25200.00  $126,000.00  NET 30
3 5 %-TON PICKUP TRUCK — VERSION 1 RICH FORD $23219.00  $116,09500  NET 30
4 5 %-TON PICKUP TRUCK — VERSION 2 RICH FORD $28,950.00  $14479500  NET 30
5 5 %-TON PICKUP TRUCK — VERSION 3 RICH FORD $30,250.00  $151,29500  NET 30
6 5 %-TON PICKUP TRUCK — VERSION 4 RICH FORD $24,206.00  $121,030.00  NET 30
7 5 %-TON PICKUP TRUCK — VERSION 5 RELIABLE CHEVROLET $16,584.00  $82,920.00 NET 30
8 5 %-TON PICKUP TRUCK — VERSION 6 RELIABLE CHEVROLET $29240.00  $14620000  NET 30

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. AC‘I]UQL AV\SARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION\BY
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDSON: " [«{ ¢ - ( {-p . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: ! :
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SUZANNE BOEHLAND, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

City of Albugquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM |
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-173-SB
BID TITLE: MISCELLANEOUS PASSENGER VEHICLES

Iitem Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From Item No.: 1 To ltem No.: 1
$0.00 $0.00 * RELIABLE CHEVROLET
$144 910.00 $137,664.50 RICH FORD SALES INC
$148,970.00 $148,970.00 BRAD FRANCIS FORD
$164,835.35 $164,835.35 BRAD FRANCIS CHEVROLET
$167,335.00 $167,335.00 TILLERY CHEVROLET-GMC, INC.
From ltem No.: 2 To Item No.: 2
$0.00 $0.00 * RELIABLE CHEVROLET
$126,000.00 $119,700.00 RICH FORD SALES INC
$130,426.70 $130,426.70 BRAD FRANCIS FORD
$144 979.55 $144,979.55 BRAD FRANCIS CHEVROLET
$148,495.00 $148,495.00 TILLERY CHEVROLET-GMC, INC.
From ltem No.: 3 To Item No.: 3
$0.00 $0.00 “BRAD FRANCIS FORD
$0.00 $0.00 * BRAD FRANCIS CHEVROLET
$116,095.00 $110,290.25 RICH FORD SALES INC
$128,135.00 $121,728.25 RELIABLE CHEVROLET
$142,915.00 $142,915.00 TILLERY CHEVROLET-GMC, INC.
From ltem No.: 4 To Item No.: 4
$144,795.00 $137,555.25 RICH FORD SALES INC
$146,590.00 $139,260.50 RELIABLE CHEVROLET
$149,979.90 $149,979.90 BRAD FRANCIS CHEVROLET

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'
June 27, 2006
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SUZANNE BOEHLAND, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-173-SB
BID TITLE: MISCELLANEQUS PASSENGER VEHICLES

item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
$152,818.45 $152,818.45 BRAD FRANCIS FORD
$152,950.00 $152,950.00 TILLERY CHEVROLET-GMC, INC.
From ltem No.: 5 To tem No.: 5
$151,295.00 $143,730.25 RICH FORD SALES INC
$156,225.00 $148,413.75 RELIABLE CHEVROLET
$155,742.30 $155,742.30 BRAD FRANCIS FORD
$160,131.20 $160,131.20 BRAD FRANCIS CHEVROLET
$173,115.00 $173,115.00 TILLERY CHEVROLET-GMC, INC.
From item No.: 6 To Item No.: 6
$121,030.00 $114,978.50 RICH FORD SALES INC
$133,815.00 $127,124.25 RELIABLE CHEVROLET
$128,166.30 $128,166.30 BRAD FRANCIS FORD
$131,138.40 $131,138.40 BRAD FRANCIS CHEVROLET
$140,210.00 $140,210.00 TILLERY CHEVROLET-GMC, INC.
From ltem No.: 7 To item No.: 7
$0.00 $0.00 * RICH FORD SALES INC
$0.00 $0.00 * BRAD FRANCIS FORD
$82,920.00 $78,774.00 RELIABLE CHEVROLET
$86,074.45 $86,074.45 BRAD FRANCIS CHEVROLET
$87,475.00 $87,475.00 TILLERY CHEVROLET-GMC, INC.
From item No.: 8 To ltem No.: 8
$0.00 $0.00 * RICH FORD SALES INC
$0.00 $0.00 * BRAD FRANCIS FORD
$146,200.00 $138,890.00 RELIABLE CHEVROLET
$149,539.45 $149,539.45 BRAD FRANCIS CHEVROLET

* Denotes that at least one ltem in the Group was 'No Bid'
June 27, 2006
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Item

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-173-SB
BID TITLE: MISCELLANEQOUS PASSENGER VEHICLES
SUZANNE BOEHLAND, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments

$153,295.00 $153,295.00 TILLERY CHEVROLET-GMC, INC.

Total Offers = 40

* Denotes that at least one item in the Group was 'No Bid’

June 27, 2006
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City of Albugquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Ii
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Vendor Preference

Number Name Type Delivery Notes
1 RICH FORD SALES INC LOCAL BUSI 75-80 DAYS ARO
2 RELIABLE CHEVROLET LOCAL BUSI MINIMUM 55 DAYS ARO
3 TILLERY CHEVROLET-GMC, INC. 70 - 90 DAYS ARO
4 BRAD FRANCIS FORD 60 DAYS ARO
5 BRAD FRANCIS CHEVROLET 60 DAYS ARO

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-173-SB
BID TITLE: MISCELLANEOUS PASSENGER VEHICLES
BID OPENING DATE: 6/21/2006
SUZANNE BOEHLAND, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 5
1-TON PICKUP TRUCK - VERSI

RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID? Y

SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $28,982.0000 $0.0000 $33,467.0000 $29,794.0000 $32,967.0700
EXT. PRICE $144,910.00 $0.00 $167,335.00 $148,970.00 $164,835.35

GROUP ITEM QTY
2 5
1-TON PICKUP TRUCK - VERSI

RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID? Y

SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $25,200.0000 $0.0000 $29,699.0000 $26,085.3400 $28,995.9100
EXT. PRICE $126,000.00 $0.00 $148,495.00 $130,426.70 $144,979.55
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-173-SB
BID TITLE: MISCELLANEQOUS PASSENGER VEHICLES
BID OPENING DATE: 6/21/2006
SUZANNE BOEHLAND, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTY
3 5
3/4-TON PICKUP TRUCK - VER

RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID? Y Y
SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $23,219.0000 $25,627.0000 $28,583.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $116,095.00 $128,135.00 $142,915.00 $0.00 $0.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
4 5
3/4-TON PICKUP TRUCK - VER

RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID?

SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $28,959.0000 $29,318.0000 $30,590.0000 $30,563.6900 $29,995.9800
EXT. PRICE $144,795.00 $146,590.00 $152,950.00 $152,818.45 $149,979.90

GROUP ITEM QTY

5 5
3/4-TON PICKUP TRUCK - VER
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $30.259.0000 $31,245.0000 $34,623.0000 $31,148.4600 $32,026.2400
EXT. PRICE $151,295.00 $156,225.00 $173,115.00 $155,742.30 $160,131.20

GROUP ITEM QTY
6 5
3/4-TON PICKUP TRUCK - VER

RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID?

SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $24,206.0000 $26,763.0000 $28,042.0000 $25,633.2600 $26,227.6800
EXT. PRICE $121,030.00 $133,815.00 $140,210.00 $128,166.30 $131,138.40
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-173-SB
BID TITLE: MISCELLANEOUS PASSENGER VEHICLES
BID OPENING DATE: 6/21/2006
SUZANNE BOEHLAND, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTY

7 5
1/2-TON FLEX FUEL PICKUP T
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID? Y Y
SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $0.0000 $16,584.0000 $17,495.0000 $0.0000 $17,214.8900
EXT. PRICE $0.00 $82,920.00 $87,475.00 $0.00 $86,074.45
GROUP ITEM QTY

8 5
FLEX FUEL LARGE UTILITY VE
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID? Y Y
SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $0.0000 $29,240.0000 $30,659.0000 $0.0000 $29,907.8900
EXT. PRICE $0.00 $146,200.00 $153,295.00 $0.00 $149,539.45

June 27, 2006 Page 3 of 3



