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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

MAY 9, 2006
TO: RONN D. JONES, PURCHASING OFFICER
FROM: DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER
SUBJECT: RECE())gIMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2006- BID OPENING DATE: 4/19/2006
157-

TITLE: CROSSING GUARD UNIFORMS

I RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: POLICE

VENDOR
ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL PAYMENT
NO. QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT  AMOUNT TERMS
1-18 Various Crossing Guard clothes & supplies TLC Uniforms $31,758.72 net

925 Second St NW
Albuquerque, NM 87102  (Local Preference Applied)

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISIGN BY
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDSON:__ 5 /&5/0 2 . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: 5( / (p /(9 (o
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AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM |t
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-157-DG
BID TITLE: CROSSING GUARD UNIFORMS
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments

From tem No.:

1

To item 18
$33,430.25 $31,758.72 TLC UNIFORMS
$33,384.75 $33,384.75 NEVES
$39,847.26 $39,847.26 BLK COMMODITIES CORP
$43,559.75 $43,559.75 SAFETY AND SECURITY INT.

Total Offers 4

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No
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AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM I
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response  Vendor Preference
Number Name Type Delivery Notes

1 SAFETY AND SECURITY INT.

2 BLK COMMODITIES CORP 30 DAYS

3 TLC UNIFORMS LOCAL BUSI 2-3 WEEKS

4 NEVES

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-157-DG
BID TITLE: CROSSING GUARD UNIFORMS
BID OPENING DATE: 4/19/2006
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320
GROUP ITEM QTyY
1 1 100
SUMMER BASEBALL CAP,
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT $2.5000 $3.6000 $3.3500 $3.3000
EXT. PRICE $250.00 $360.00 $335.00 $330.00
GROUP ITEM QTyY
1 2 100

WINTER BASEBALL CAP,
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT $7.0000 $4.4800 $3.3500 $3.3000
EXT. PRICE $700.00 $448.00 $335.00 $330.00
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-157-DG
BID TITLE: CROSSING GUARD UNIFORMS
BID OPENING DATE: 4/19/2006
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTy

1 3 50
KNIT CAP 100% ACRYLIC,
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT $4.2500 $2.9800 $3.0000 $2.5000
EXT. PRICE $212.50 $149.00 $150.00 $125.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 4 185
"SECURITY" SHIRT WITH
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT $18.5000 $19.9800 $26.5000 $24.0000
EXT. PRICE $3,052.50 $3,296.70 $4,372.50 $3,960.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 5 165
"SECURITY" SHIRT WITH
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT $21.2500 $20.9800 $27.5000 $28.0000
EXT. PRICE $3,506.25 $3,461.70 $4,537.50 $4,620.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 6 145
PANTS % POLYESTER, 40%
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT $16.0000 $20.6800 $16.5000 $15.5000
EXT. PRICE $232.00 $299.86 $239.25 $224.75
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-157-DG
BID TITLE: CROSSING GUARD UNIFORMS
BID OPENING DATE: 4/19/2006
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP  ITEM QTY

1 7 70
WHISTLE, STAINLESS STEEL,
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT $2.2500 $1.9800 $1.9000 $1.9500
EXT. PRICE $157.50 $138.60 $133.00 $136.50
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 8 70
LANYARD, WHISTLE SNAP,
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT $1.0000 $1.4900 $1.5000 $1.5000
EXT. PRICE $70.00 $104.30 $105.00 $105.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 9 200
SAFETY VEST, REFLECTIVE
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT $17.0000 $20.6800 $14.5000 $19.0000
EXT. PRICE $3,400.00 $4,136.00 $2,900.00 $3,800.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 10 165
RAIN COAT, HOODSNAP ON,
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT $42.0000 $14.3800 $14.0000 $12.0000
EXT. PRICE $6,930.00 $2,372.70 $2,310.00 $1,980.00
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-157-DG
BID TITLE: CROSSING GUARD UNIFORMS
BID OPENING DATE: 4/19/2006
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 11 250
GLOVES, SAFETY ORANGE,
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT $3.0000 $1.0000 $2.9500 $1.9900
EXT. PRICE $750.00 $250.00 $737.50 $497.50
GROUP ITEM QTY

1 12 150
HEAVY COAT, SHELL 100%
RESPONSE 1 : 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT $60.0000 $67.4800 $53.0000 $53.9000
EXT. PRICE $9,000.00 $10,122.00 $7,950.00 $8,085.00
GROUP ITEM QTY

1 13 165
IKE JACKET, 65% POLYESTER
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT $32.0000 $33.2800 $25.5000 $25.9000
EXT. PRICE $5,280.00 $5,491.20 $4,207.50 $4,273.50
GROUP ITEM QTY

1 14 50
DRESS CAP: 8 POINT, WHITE
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT $50.0000 $35.9800 $25.5000 $26.0000
EXT. PRICE $2,500.00 $1,799.00 $1,275.00 $1,300.00
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-157-DG
BID TITLE: CROSSING GUARD UNIFORMS
BID OPENING DATE: 4/19/2006
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 15 30
TIE CLIP ON, 100%
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT $4.3000 $5.3800 $3.8500 $3.7500
EXT. PRICE $129.00 $161.40 $115.50 $112.50
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 16 1150
PATCHES: BLACK OUTLINE,
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT $2.7500 $2.9800 $1.4500 $1.4000
EXT. PRICE $3,162.50 $3,427.00 $1,667.50 $1,610.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 17 160
BADGES, CHROME, WORDS
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT $21.5000 $19.8800 $8.5000 $7.5000
EXT. PRICE $3,440.00 $3,180.80 $1,360.00 $1,200.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 18 50
TROOPER HAT WITH FLIP
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT $15.7500 $12.9800 $14.0000 $13.9000
EXT. PRICE $787.50 $649.00 $700.00 $695.00
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