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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE
ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

MAY 14, 2007
TO: JOHN J. VIGIL, PURCHASING MANAGER
FROM: DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER
SUBJECT: I:léEngIMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2007- BID OPENING DATE: 5/2/2007
1-

TITLE: DAIRY PRODUCTS

I RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: VARIOUS

VENDOR
ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL PAYMENT
NO. QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT AMOUNT TERMS
1 various Milk and assorted milk products Creamland Dairies various prices  $141,664 net
PO box 25067
Albuguerque, NM 87125
1 various Ice Cream and Sherbert Zanios various prices $14,223.20 net

221 Airport Dr. NW
Albuguerque, NM 87121

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISIQN BY

ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON: ® . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: / 7

APPR : \ /
1 i ,S 3//¢ Aqa;z

JOHN J. gIL i / (DATE)

P Si AGER




AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM i
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-161-DG
BID TITLE: DAIRY PRODUCTS
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From ltem No.: 1 To ltem 9
$144,177.35 $136,968.49 CREAMLAND DAIRIES
$188,500.50 $179,075.47 ZANIOS FOODS IND
From ltem No.: 10 To ltem 13
$14,223.20 $13,512.04 ZANIOS FOODS IND
$16,559.00 $15,731.05 CREAMLAND DAIRIES
Total Offers 4

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No

May 4, 2007
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AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM I
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response Vendor Preference
Number Name Type Delivery Notes
CREAMLAND DAIRIES LOCAL BUSI
ZANIOS FOODS IND LOCAL BUSI 2 DAYS ARO

GROUP  ITEM QTyY

1 1100
MILK, WHITE, WHOLE,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT $2.9925
EXT. PRICE $299.25
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 2 450000
MILK, WHITE, 1% IN 1/2 PINTS
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT $0.2156
EXT. PRICE $97,020.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 3100000
MILK, CHOCOLATE, 1% IN 1/2
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT $0.2280
EXT. PRICE $22,800.00

May 15, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-161-DG
BID TITLE: DAIRY PRODUCTS
BID OPENING DATE: 5/2/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2

EA
$3.5000
$350.00

2

EA
$0.3000
$135,000.00

2

EA
$0.3200
$32,000.00
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GROUP ITEM QTyY

1 4 50
CREAMERS, HALF & HALF,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU cs
UNIT $9.5757
EXT. PRICE $478.79
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 5 250
SOUR CREAM, 5# TUB
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT $4.6239
EXT. PRICE $1,155.98
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 6 250
SOUR CREAM, 1 0Z PCS. 200
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU cs
UNIT $20.1200
EXT. PRICE $5,030.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 7 500
COTTAGE CHEESE, 5# TUBS.
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU 8
UNIT $7.4317
EXT. PRICE $3,715.85

May 15, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-161-DG
BID TITLE: DAIRY PRODUCTS
BID OPENING DATE: 5/2/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2

(OF]
$8.6300
$431.50

2

EA
$5.7000
$1.425.00

2

Cs
$21.6000
$5,400.00

2

B
$7.6500
$3,825.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY

1 8 500
YOGURT, 4 0Z, ASSORTED
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU cs
UNIT $23.3136
EXT. PRICE $11,656.80
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 9 100
WHIPPED CREAM TOPPING
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU cs
UNIT $20.2068
EXT. PRICE $2,020.68
GROUP ITEM  QTY

2 10 250
SHERBET, 3 0Z, ASSORTED
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU cs
UNIT $19.5000
EXT. PRICE $4,875.00
GROUP [TEM  QTY

2 11 100
ICE CREAM, 3 GALLON TUBS,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU B
UNIT $17.9500
EXT. PRICE $1,795.00

May 15, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-161-DG
BID TITLE: DAIRY PRODUCTS
BID OPENING DATE: 5/2/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2

CSs
$16.5600
$8,280.00

2

Cs
$17.8900
$1,789.00

2

CS
$15.9400
$3,985.00

2

B
$15.7900
$1,579.00
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GROUP  ITEM QTY

2 12 20
ICE CREAM, 5 QUART
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $6.9500
EXT. PRICE $139.00
GROUP  ITEM QTY

2 13 500
ICE CREAM, 3 OZ CUPS,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU Cs
UNIT $19.5000
EXT. PRICE $9,750.00

May 15, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-161-DG
BiD TITLE: DAIRY PRODUCTS
BID OPENING DATE: 5/2/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2

EA
$13.4600
$269.20

2

Cs
$16.7800
$8,390.00
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