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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE
ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

@

As3S MARCH 1, 2006
JOHN J. VIGIL, 427G PURCHASING OFFICER

FROM: KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER

SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2006-
111-KD

TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING

TO:

BID OPENING DATE: 2/15/2006

I RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: VARIOUS

VENDOR
ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT PAYMENT
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT TERMS
1-49 VARIOUS CONCRETE AND PRECISION CONCRETE $6002.55 N30
ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING SERVICES, INC.

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION BY
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON: 3/9/06 . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: 3/2/06

APPROVED

Y,

TANDA MEADORS,

DIRECTOR

DEPRATMENT OF FINANCE AND
ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES

(DATE)




City of Albugquerque

AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM |

ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT
Response  Vendor Preference
Number Name Type Delivery Notes
1 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, | LOCAL BUSI

2 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE D LOCAL BUSI

GROUP ITEM QTY

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-111-KD
BID TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING
BID OPENING DATE: 2/15/2006
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

1 8
CONCRETE CORE DRILL 34" T
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU EA - EA
UNIT PRICE $21.1400 $19.0000
EXT. PRICE $169.12 $152.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

2 8
CONCRETE CORE DRILL 2° TO
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $21.1400 $22.0000
EXT. PRICE $169.12 $176.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

3 8
CONCRETE CORE DRILL 3-1/2"
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $25.6800 $25.5000
EXT. PRICE $205.44 $204.00

February 22, 2006

Page 1 of 13



GROUP ITEM QTyYy

4 8
CONCRETE COREDRILLUPT
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $32.1000
EXT. PRICE $256.80

GROUP ITEM QTY

5 8
CONCRETE CORE DRILL 7" IN
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $37.4500
EXT. PRICE $299.60

GROUP ITEM QTyYy

6 8
CONCRETE CORE DRILL 8" IN
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $42.8000
EXT. PRICE $342.40

GROUP ITEM Qry

7 8
CONCRETE COREDRILLUPT
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $48.1500 -
EXT. PRICE $385.20

February 22, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-111-KD
BID TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING
BID OPENING DATE: 2/15/2006
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

$34.0000
$272.00

$38.0000
$304.00

$45.0000
$360.00

$49.0000
$392.00

Page 2 of 13



GROUP ITEM QTy

8 8
CONCRETE CORD DRILL 10" IN
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $53.5000
EXT. PRICE $428.00

GROUP ITEM QTy

9 8
CONCRETE CORE DRILL 12" IN
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $64.2000
EXT. PRICE $513.60

GROUP ITEM QTy

10 8
CONCRETE COREDRILLUP T
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $89.8800
EXT. PRICE $719.04

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 8
CONCRETE CORE DRILL 16" IN

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $102.7200
EXT. PRICE $821.76

February 22, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-111-KD
BID TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING
BID OPENING DATE: 2/15/2006
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

$58.0000
$464.00

$72.0000
$576.00

$112.0000
$896.00

$125.0000
$1,000.00
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-111-KD
BID TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING
BID OPENING DATE: 2/15/2006
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTyYy

12 8
CONCRETE CORE DRILL 18" IN
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $115.5600 $146.0000
EXT. PRICE $624.48 $1,168.00

GROUP ITEM QTyYy

13 8
CONCRETE CORE DRILL 20" IN
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $128.4000 $175.0000
EXT. PRICE $1,027.20 $1,400.00

GROUP ITEM QTyYy

14 8
CONGRETE CORE DRILL 24" IN
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $154.0800 $216.0000
EXT. PRICE $1.232.64 $1,728.00

GROUP ITEM QTyYy

15 8
CONCRETE COREDRILL 3/4* T
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $22.4700 $28.0000
EXT. PRICE $179.76 $224.00

February 22, 2006 Page 4 of 13



GROUP ITEM QTy

16 8
CONCRETE CORE DRILL2" TO
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $38.5200
EXT. PRICE $308.16

GROUP ITEM QTy
17 8
CONCRETE CORE DRILL 3-1/2"

RESPONSE 1

NO BID?

SKU EA

UNIT PRICE $53.5000
EXT. PRICE $428.00

GROUP ITEM QTy

18 8
CONCRETE CORE DRILL 6" IN
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $64.2000
EXT. PRICE $513.60

GROUP ITEM QTYy

19 8
CONCRETE COREDRILLT*IN
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $74.9000
EXT. PRICE $599.20

February 22, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-111-KD
BID TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING
BID OPENING DATE: 2/15/2006
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

$33.0000
$264.00

$51.0000
$408.00

$62.0000
$496.00

$72.0000
$576.00
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GROUP ITEM QTyYy

20 8
CONCRETE CORE DRILL 8" IN
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $85.6000
EXT. PRICE $684.80

GROUP ITEM QTyYy

21 8
CONCRETE CORE DRILL 8" IN
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $96.3000
EXT. PRICE $770.40

GROUP ITEM QTyYy

22 8
CONCRETE CORE DRILL 10" IN
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $107.0000
EXT. PRICE $656.00

GROUP ITEM QTyYy

23 8
CONCRETE CORE DRILL 127 IN
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $128.4000
EXT. PRICE $1,027.20

February 22, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-111-KD
BID TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING
BID OPENING DATE: 2/15/2006
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

$82.0000
$656.00

$90.0000
$720.00

$102.0000
$816.00

$136.0000

$1,088.00
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-111-KD
BID TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING
BID OPENING DATE: 2/15/2006
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTY

24 8
CONCRETE CORE DRILL 14" IN
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $179.7600 $185.0000
EXT. PRICE $1,438.08 $1,480.00

GROUP ITEM QTYy

25 8
CONCRETE CORE DRILL 16" IN
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $205.4400 $240.0000
EXT. PRICE $1,643.52 $1,820.00

GROUP ITEM QTYy

26 8
CONCRETE CORE DRILL 18" IN
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $231.1200 $292.0000
EXT. PRICE $1,848.96 $2,336.00

GROUP ITEM QTy

27 8
CONCRETE CORE DRILL 20" IN
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $256.8000 $324.0000
EXT. PRICE $2,054.40 $2,592.00

February 22, 2006 Page 7 of 13



REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-111-KD
BID TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING
BID OPENING DATE: 2/15/2006
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTYy

28 8
CONCRETE CORE DRILL 24" IN
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $308.1600 $389.0000
EXT. PRICE $2,465.28 $3,112.00

GROUP ITEM QTYy

29 1
PIF SLAB SAW CONCRETE ON
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $0.6400 $0.5500
EXT. PRICE $0.64 $0.55

GROUP ITEM QTYy

30 1
PIF SAW CUT CONCRETE ON
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $2.4100 $1.2500
EXT. PRICE $2.41 $1.25

GROUP ITEM QTYy
31 1
PIF SLAB SAW ASPHALT (PER |

RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?

SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $0.2600 $0.2500
EXT. PRICE $0.26 $0.25

‘February 22, 2006 Page 8 of 13



GROUP ITEM QTY

32 1
PIF ASPHALT CUTTINGWITH S
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $0.2600
EXT. PRICE $0.26

GROUP ITEM QTY
33 1
SAFETY GROOVING 1/8" TO 3/1

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $4.8200
EXT. PRICE $4.82

GROUP ITEM QTY

34 1
MINIMUM CHARGE TO CORE D
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $187.2500
EXT. PRICE $187.25

GROUP ITEM QTY

35 1
MINIMUM CHARGE TO CORE D
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $294.2500
EXT. PRICE $294.25

February 22, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-111-KD
BID TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING
BID OPENING DATE: 2/15/2006
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

$0.3500
$0.35

$0.0000
$0.00

$32.0000
$32.00

$88.0000
$88.00
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GROUP ITEM QTYy

36 1
MINIMUM CHARGE TO CORE D
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $187.2500
EXT. PRICE $187.25

GROUP ITEM QTY
37 1
MINIMUM CHARGE TO CORE D

RESPONSE 1

NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $187.2500
EXT. PRICE $187.25

GROUP ITEM QTY

38 1
MINIMUM CHARGE FOR SLAB
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $187.2500
EXT. PRICE $187.25

GROUP ITEM QTYy

39 1
MINIMUM CHARGE FOR SLAB
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $267.5000
EXT. PRICE $267.50

February 22, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-111-KD
BID TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING
BID OPENING DATE: 2/15/2006
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

$155.0000
$155.00

$75.0000
$75.00

$165.0000
$165.00

$215.0000
$215.00
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GROUP ITEM Qry

40 1
MINIMUM CHARGE FOR SLAB
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $267.5000
EXT. PRICE $267.50

GROUP ITEM Qry

H 1
MINIMUM CHARGE FOR SLAB
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $321.0000
EXT. PRICE $321.00

GROUP ITEM Qry

42 1
MINIMUM CHARGE FOR SAFET
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $802.5000
EXT. PRICE $802.50

GROUP ITEM Qry

43 8
CORE DRILL ASPHALT 3/4" TO
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $21.1400
EXT. PRICE $169.12

February 22, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-111-KD
BID TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING
BID OPENING DATE: 2/15/2006
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

$175.0000
$175.00

$215.0000
$215.00

$0.0000
$0.00

$19.0000
$152.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY
44 8
CORE DRILL ASPHALT 3/4" TO

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $22.4700
EXT. PRICE $179.76

GROUP ITEM QTY

45 1
HOURLY RATE FOR REGULAR
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $80.2500
EXT. PRICE $80.25

GROUP ITEM QTY

46 1
ASPAHLT CUTTING WITH SELF
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $0.2600
EXT. PRICE $0.26

GROUP ITEM QTY

47 1
PER SQ. YD.: SAFETY GROOVI
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $4.8200
EXT. PRICE $4.82

February 22, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-111-KD
BID TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING
BID OPENING DATE: 2/15/2006
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

$24.0000
$192.00

$95.0000
$95.00

$0.2500
$0.25
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GROUP ITEM QTyY

48 1
MINIMUM CHARGE RATE FOR
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $187.2500
EXT. PRICE $187.25

GROUP ITEM QTyY

49 1
MINIMUM CHARGE QUOTE FO
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $187.2500
EXT. PRICE $187.25

February 22, 2006

REQUEST FOR BIiD NUMBER: RFB2006-111-KD
BID TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING
BiD OPENING DATE: 2/15/2006
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

$175.0000
$175.00

$155.0000
$155.00

Page 13 of 13



Ciry of Albugquergue
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM il
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-111-KD
BID TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From tem No.: 1 To tem No.: 1
$169.12 $160.66 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$152.00 $144.40 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From ltem No.: 2 To ltem No.: 2
$176.00 $167.20 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$169.12 $160.66 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From item No.: 3 To tem No.: 3
$205.44 $195.17 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$204.00 $193.80 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From item No.. 4 To tem No.. 4
$272.00 $258.40 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$256.80 $243.96 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From tem No.: 5 Toltem No.: 5
$304.00 $288.80 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$299.60 $284.62 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From item No.: 6 To tem No.: 6
$360.00 $342.00 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$342.40 $325.28 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From item No.: 7 To tem No.. 7

* Denotes that at least one item in the Group was ‘No Bid'

February 22, 2006
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-111-KD
BID TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
$392.00 $372.40 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$385.20 $365.94 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From item No.: 8 Totem No.: 8
$464.00 $440.80 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$428.00 $406.80 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From item No.: 9 Totem No.: 9
$576.00 $547.20 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$513.60 $487.92 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From item No.: 10 To item No.: 10
$896.00 $851.20 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
. $719.04 $683.09 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
Fromitem No.: 11 To tem No.: 11
$1,000.00 $950.00 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$821.76 $780.67 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From item No.: 12 To item No.: 12
$1,168.00 $1,108.60 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$924.48 $878.26 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From item No.: 13 To tem No.: 13
$1,400.00 $1,330.00 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$1,027.20 $975.84 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From ltem No.: 14 To ltem No.: 14
$1,728.00 $1,641.60 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'
February 22, 2006
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-111-KD
BID TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
$1,232.64 $1,171.01 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.

From ltem No.: 15 To tem No.: 15

$224.00 $212.80 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.

$179.76 $170.77 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From item No.: 16 To tem No.: 16

$308.16 $292.75 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.

$264.00 $250.80 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From item No.: 17 To tem No.: 17

$428.00 $406.60 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.

$408.00 $387.60 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
Fromitem No.: 18 To tem No.: 18

$513.60 $487.92 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.

$496.00 $471.20 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From item No.: 19 To ltem No.: 19

$599.20 $569.24 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.

$576.00 $547.20 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From item No.: 20 To ltem No.: 20

$684.80 $650.56 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.

$656.00 $623.20 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From ltem No.: 21 To item No.: 21

$770.40 $731.88 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.

$720.00 $684.00 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.

* Denotes that at least one item in the Group was ‘No Bid’
February 22, 2006
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-111-KD
BID TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From item No.: 22 To kem No.: 22
$856.00 $813.20 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$816.00 $775.20 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From ltem No.. 23 To kemNo.: 23
$1,088.00 $1,033.60 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$1,027.20 $975.84 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From ltem No.: 24 To ltem No.: 24
$1,480.00 $1,406.00 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$1,438.08 $1,366.18 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From ltem No.. 25 To tem No.: 25 ‘
$1,920.00 $1,824.00 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$1,643.52 $1,561.34 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From ltem No.. 26 To tem No.. 26
$2,336.00 $2,219.20 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$1,848.96 $1,756.51 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From ltem No.: 27 To kem No.: 27
$2,592.00 $2,462.40 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$2,054.40 $1,951.68 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From ltem No.: 28 To ltem No.: 28
$3,112.00 $2,956.40 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$2,465.28 $2,34202 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.

* Denotes that at least one item in the Group was 'No Bid'
February 22, 2006
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-111-KD
BID TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From ltem No.: 29 To ftem No.: 29
$0.64 $0.61 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$0.55 $0.52 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From tem No.: 30 To ftem No.: 30
$2.41 $2.29 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$1.25 $1.19 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From ltem No.. 31 To ftem No.: 31
$0.26 $0.25 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$0.25 $0.24 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From ltem No.: 32 To tem No.. 32
$0.35 $0.33 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$0.26 $0.25 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From tem No.. 33 To ftem No.: 33
$4.82 $4.58 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$0.00 $0.00 * NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From ltem No.: 34 To tem No.: 34
$187.25 $177.89 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$32.00 $30.40 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From ltem No.: 35 To ftem No.:. 35
$294.25 $279.54 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$88.00 $83.60 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From liem No.: 36 To tem No.. 36

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was ‘No Bid'
February 22, 2006 Page 50of 7



REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-111-KD
BID TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
$187.25 $177.89 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$155.00 $147.25 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From ltem No.. 37 To tem No.: 37
$187.25 $177.89 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$75.00 $71.25 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From ltem No.: 38 To tem No.: 38
$187.25 $177.89 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$165.00 $156.75 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From ltem No.: 39 To tem No.: 38
$267.50 $254.12 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$215.00 $204.25 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From ltem No.: 40 To ltem No.: 40
$267.50 $254.12 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$175.00 $166.25 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From ltem No.. 41 To tem No.: 41
$321.00 $304.95 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$215.00 $204.25 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From ltem No.: 42 To ltem No.: 42
$802.50 $762.38 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$0.00 $0.00 * NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From ltem No.: 43 To tem No.. 43
$169.12 $160.66 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'
February 22, 2006
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-111-KD

BID TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
$152.00 $144.40 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From tem No.: 44 To item No.: 44
$192.00 $182.40 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$179.76 $170.77 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From ftem No.: 45 To tem No.. 45
$95.00 $90.25 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$80.25 $76.24 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From ltem No.: 46 To ltem No.:. 46
$0.26 $0.25 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$0.25 $0.24 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From item No.: 47 To ltem No.: 47
$4.82 $4.58 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$0.00 $0.00 * NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From tem No.: 48 To item No.: 48
$187.25 $177.89 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$175.00 $166.25 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From kem No.: 48 To ltem No.: 49
$187.25 $177.89 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$155.00 $147.25 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.

* Denotes that at least one item in the Group was 'No Bid’

February 22, 2006

Total Offers = 98
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City of Albugquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Ii
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-111-KD
BID TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

ftem Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From ltem No.: 1 To tem No.: 1

$152.00 $144.40 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.

$169.12 $160.66 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From ltem No.: 2 To tem No.: 2

$169.12 $160.66 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.

$176.00 $167.20 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From ltem No.: 3 TotemNo.: 3

$204.00 $193.80 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.

$205.44 $195.17 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From item No.: 4 To tem No.. 4

$256.80 $243.96 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.

$272.00 $258.40 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From item No.: § ToltemNo.: §

$299.60 $284.62 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.

$304.00 $288.80 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From item No.: 6 To tem No.: 6

$342.40 $325.28 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.

$360.00 $342.00 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From item No.: 7 To tem No.: 7

* Denotes that at least one Item In the Group was 'No Bid"
February 22, 2006
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-111-KD
BID TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
$385.20 $365.94 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$392.00 $372.40 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From tem No.: 8 To ltem No.: 8
$428.00 $406.60 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$464.00 $440.80 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From ltem No.: 9 Toltem No.: 9
$513.60 $487.92 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$576.00 $547.20 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From ltem No.: 10 To ltem No.: 10
$718.04 $683.09 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$896.00 $851.20 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From ftem No.: 11 To ltem No.: 11
$821.76 $780.67 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$1,000.00 $950.00 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From ltem No.: 12 To item No.: 12
$924.48 $878.28 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$1,168.00 $1,109.60 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From item No.: 13 To item No.: 13
$1,027.20 $975.84 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$1,400.00 $1,330.00 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From ltem No.: 14 To item No.: 14
$1,232.64 $1,171.01 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.

* Denotes that at least one ltem in the Group was ‘No Bid'

February 22, 2006
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-111-KD
BID TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
$1,728.00 $1,641.60 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From ltem No.. 15 To ltem No.: 15
$179.76 $170.77 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$224.00 $212.80 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From ltem No.: 16 To ltem No.: 16
$264.00 $250.80 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$308.16 $292.75 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From tem No.: 17 To tem No.: 17
$408.00 $387.60 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$428.00 $406.60 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From ltem No.: 18 Toltem No.: 18
$496.00 $471.20 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$513.60 $487.92 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From item No.: 19 To ltem No.: 19
$576.00 $547.20 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$599.20 $569.24 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From ltem No.: 20 To ltem No.: 20
$656.00 $623.20 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$684.80 $650.56 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From ltem No.: 21 To ltem No.: 21
$720.00 $684.00 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$770.40 $731.88 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.

* Denotes that at least one ltem in the Group was 'No Bid'

February 22, 2006 Page 3 of 7



REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-111-KD
BID TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

ftem Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From ltem No.: 22 To tem No.: 22
$816.00 $775.20 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$856.00 $813.20 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.

From tem No.: 23 To tem No.: 23

$1,027.20 $975.84 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.

$1,088.00 $1,033.60 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From item No.: 24 To tem No.: 24

$1,438.08 $1,366.18 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.

$1,480.00 $1,406.00 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From ltem No.. 25 To kem No.: 25

$1,643.52 $1,561.34 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.

$1,920.00 $1,824.00 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From ltem No.: 26 To tem No.: 26

$1,848.96 $1,756.51 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.

$2,336.00 $2,219.20 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From ttem No.: 27 To tem No.: 27

$2,054.40 $1,951.68 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.

$2,5692.00 $2,462.40 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From tem No.. 28 To tem No.: 28

$2,465.28 $2,342.02 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.

$3,112.00 $2,956.40 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.

* Denotes that at least one ltem in the Group was ‘No Bid'
February 22, 2006
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-111-KD
BID TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From item No.: 29 To ltem No.: 29
$0.55 $0.52 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$0.64 $0.61 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From fem No.: 30 To tem No.: 30
$1.25 $1.19 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$2.41 $2.29 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From ttem No.: 31 To ltem No.: 31
$0.25 $0.24 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$0.26 $0.25 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From Kem No.: 32 To ltem No.: 32
$0.26 $0.25 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$0.35 $0.33 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From fem No.: 33 To ltem No.: 33
$0.00 $0.00 * NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$4.82 $4.58 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From ftem No.. 34 To ltem No.: 34
$32.00 $30.40 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$187.25 $177.89 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From tem No.: 35 To tem No.: 35
$88.00 $83.60 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$294.25 $279.54 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From kem No.. 36 To tem No.: 36

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'
February 22, 2006
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-111-KD
BID TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
$155.00 $147.25 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$187.25 $177.89 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From ltem No.: 37 To kem No.: 37
$75.00 $71.25 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$187.25 $177.89 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From ltem No.. 38 To ltem No.: 38
$165.00 $156.75 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$187.25 $177.89 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From kem No.. 39 To kem No.: 39
$215.00 $204.25 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$267.50 . $254.12 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From tem No.: 40 To tem No.: 40
$175.00 $166.25 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$267.50 $254.12 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From ltem No.: 41 To tem No.: 41
$215.00 $204.25 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$321.00 $304.95 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From fkem No.: 42 To ltem No.: 42
$0.00 $0.00 * NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$802.50 $762.38 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From ltem No.: 43 To ltem No.: 43
$152.00 $144.40 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.

* Denotes that at least one Iltem in the Group was 'No Bid'
February 22, 2006
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-111-KD

BID TITLE: CONCRETE AND ASPHALT CUTTING AND CORING
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
$169.12 $160.66 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From item No.. 44 To tem No.: 44
$179.76 $170.77 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$192.00 $182.40 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From item No.: 45 To tem No.: 45
$80.25 $76.24 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
$95.00 $90.25 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
From ltem No.. 46 To item No.: 46
$0.25 $0.24 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$0.26 $0.25 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From ltem No.: 47 To ltem No.: 47
$0.00 $0.00 * NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$4.82 $458 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From item No.: 48 To tem No.: 48
$175.00 $166.25 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$187.25 $177.89 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.
From item No.: 49 To tem No.: 49
$155.00 $147.25 NBC CONCRETE CUTTING & CORE DRILLING, INC.
$187.25 $177.89 PRECISION CONCRETE SERVICES, INC.

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was ‘No Bid'
February 22, 2006

Total Offers = 98
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