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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

JUNE 26, 2007

TO: JOHN J. VIGIL, PURCHASING MANAGER

FROM: G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER

SUBJECT. RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2007- BID OPENING DATE: 5/30/2007
182-GJ

TITLE: ANALYTICAL SAMPLING

| RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT

VENDOR
ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL PAYMENT
NO.  QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT AMOUNT TERMS
1 ANALYTICAL SAMPLING HALL ENVIRONMENTAL $3,150.94

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL AW IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION BY
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDSON:_ 7 | 5 1e, . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: “

APPROVED: | APPROVED:
¢ 26/ 2007 M //” / £-27 o>

JOHN J. VIGIL' ™ LEONARD GARCIA, DIRECTOR (DATE)
RCHASING

SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT



City of Albuguergue
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Il
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-182-GJ
BID TITLE: ANALYTICAL SAMPLING
G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

ltem Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From ltem No.: 1 To item No.: 30
$3,316.78 $3,150.94 HALL ENVIRONMENTAL
$3,235.00 $3,235.00 WECK LABORATORIES, INC.
$3,727.75 $3,541.37 ASSAIGAI LABORATORIES

Total Offers = 3

* Denotes that at least one ltem in the Group was 'No Bid'
June 22, 2007 Page 1 of 1



City of Albugquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM II
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response  Vendor Preference
Number Name Type Delivery Notes
1 WECK LABORATORIES, INC. 14 WORKDAYS FROM SAMPLE RECEIPT AT
LABORATORY
2 HALL ENVIRONMENTAL LOCAL BUSI 25 BUSINESS DAYS
3 ASSAIGAI LABORATORIES LOCAL BUSI WHEN REQUIRED

GROUP ITEM QTyYy
1 1 1
COMPOST: MOISTURE CONTE

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $10.0000
EXT. PRICE $10.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 2 1
COMPOST: PARTICLE SIZE

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $75.0000
EXT. PRICE $75.00

June 22, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-182-GJ

EA
$10.6900
$10.69

EA
$53.4400
$53.44

BID TITLE: ANALYTICAL SAMPLING

BID OPENING DATE: 5/30/2007
G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$10.0000
$10.00

EA
$55.0000
$55.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY
1 3 1
COMPOST: SOLUBLE SALTS

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $12.0000
EXT. PRICE $12.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 4 1
COMPOST: PH
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $10.0000
EXT. PRICE $10.00

GROUP ITEM QTy

1 5 1
COMPOST: ORGANIC MATTER
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $18.0000
EXT. PRICE $18.00

GROUP ITEM QTyYy

1 6 1
COMPOST: TRACE METALS
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

June 22, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-182-GJ
BID TITLE: ANALYTICAL SAMPLING
BID OPENING DATE: 5/30/2007
G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$42.7500
$42.75

EA
$16.0300
$16.03

EA
$42.7500
$42.75

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$25.0000
$25.00

EA
$10.0000
$10.00

EA
$25.0000
$25.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY

1 7 1
COMPOST: FECAL COLIFORM
RESPONSE 1

NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 8 1
WATER SAMPLING: EPA 310.0
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $12.0000
EXT. PRICE $12.00

GROUP I'TEM QTY

1 9 1
WATER SAMPLING: EPA 300.0
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $40.0000
EXT. PRICE $40.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 10 1
WATER SAMPLING: EPA 353.2
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU
UNIT PRICE $20.0000
EXT. PRICE $20.00

June 22, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-182-GJ
BID TITLE: ANALYTICAL SAMPLING
BID OPENING DATE: 5/30/2007
G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$16.0300
$16.03

EA
$48.0900
$48.09

$16.0300
$16.03

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$20.0000
$20.00

EA
$57.5000
$57.50

$15.0000
$15.00
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GROUP ITEM QTy
1 1" 1
WATER SAMPLING: RADIUM 2

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $270.0000
EXT. PRICE $270.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 12 1
WATER SAMPLING: EPA 415.1

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $32.0000
EXT. PRICE $32.00

GROUP ITEM QTyYy
1 13 1
WATER SAMPLING: EPA 6020

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $40.0000
EXT. PRICE $40.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 14 1
WATER SAMPLING: EPA 504.1
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $50.0000
EXT. PRICE $50.00

June 22, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-182-GJ
BID TITLE: ANALYTICAL SAMPLING
BID OPENING DATE: 5/30/2007
G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$171.0000
$171.00

EA
$32.0600
$32.06

EA
$42.7500
$42.75

EA
$42.7500
$42.75

EA
$215.0000
$215.00

EA
$30.0000
$30.00

EA
$60.0000
$60.00

EA
$52.5000
$52.50
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GROUP ITEM QTY

1 15 1
WATER SAMPLING: 8082
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $80.0000
EXT. PRICE $80.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 16 1
WATER SAMPLING: EPA 350.1

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $20.0000
EXT. PRICE $20.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 17 1
WATER SAMPLING: EPA 9012A
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $28.0000
EXT. PRICE $28.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 18 1
WATER SAMPLING: EPA 351.2

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $28.0000
EXT. PRICE $28.00

June 22, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-182-GJ
BID TITLE: ANALYTICAL SAMPLING
BID OPENING DATE: 5/30/2007
G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$74.8100
$74.81

EA
$16.0300
$16.03

EA
$32.0600
$32.06

EA
$26.7200
$26.72

EA
$90.0000
$90.00

EA
$20.0000
$20.00

EA
$45.0000
$45.00

EA
$35.0000
$35.00

Page 5 of 8



GROUP ITEM QTY
1 19 1
WATER SAMPLIING: EPA 6010

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $110.0000
EXT. PRICE $110.00

GROUP ITEM QTy
1 20 1
WATER SAMPLING: EPA 8260

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $105.0000
EXT. PRICE $105.00

GROUP ITEM QTy
1 21 1
WATER SAMPLING: EPA 8310

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $120.0000
EXT. PRICE $120.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 22 1
WATER SAMPLING: EPA 420.1
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $28.0000
EXT. PRICE $28.00

June 22, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-182-GJ
BID TITLE: ANALYTICAL SAMPLING
BID OPENING DATE: 5/30/2007
G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$160.3100
$160.31

EA
$106.8800
$106.88

EA
$96.1900
$96.19

EA
$64.1300
$64.13

EA
$214.7500
$214.75

EA
$125.0000
$125.00

EA
$125.0000
$125.00

EA
$45.0000
$45.00
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GROUP ITEM QTYy
1 23 1
WATER SAMPLING: PH AND F

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $1,000.0000
EXT. PRICE $1,000.00

GROUP I'TEM QTYy
1 24 1
OTHER SAMPLING: MODIFIED

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $80.0000
EXT. PRICE $80.00

GROUP ITEM QTy

1 25 1
OTHER SAMPLING: EPA 418.1
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $40.0000
EXT. PRICE $40.00

GROUP |ITEM QTY

1 26 1
OTHER SAMPLING: EPA 8021 (
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $40.0000
EXT. PRICE $40.00

June 22, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-182-GJ
BID TITLE: ANALYTICAL SAMPLING
BID OPENING DATE: 5/30/2007
G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$1,026.0000
$1,026.00

EA
$74.8100
$74.81

EA
$42.7500
$42.75

EA
$42.7500
$42.75

EA
$1,202.2500
$1,202.25

EA
$80.0000
$80.00

EA
$65.0000
$65.00

EA
$45.0000
$45.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY
1 27 1
OTHER SAMPLING: TCLP 1311

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $775.0000
EXT. PRICE $775.00

GROUP ITEM Qry

1 28 1
OTHER SAMPLING: TCLP 1311
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $150.0000
EXT. PRICE $150.00

GROUP ITEM QTyYy

1 29 1
OTHER SAMPLING: TOTAL SU
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $12.0000
EXT. PRICE $12.00

GROUP I'TEM QTY

1 30 1
OTHER SAMPLING: TOTAL RE
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $30.0000
EXT. PRICE $30.00

June 22, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-182-GJ
BID TITLE: ANALYTICAL SAMPLING
BID OPENING DATE: 5/30/2007
G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$801.5600
$801.56

EA
$180.0000
$180.00

EA
$16.0300
$16.03

EA
$21.3800
$21.38

EA
$850.0000
$850.00

EA
$168.2500
$168.25

EA
$12.5000
$12.50

EA
$30.0000
$30.00
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