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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

DECEMBER 12, 2006

TO: JOHN J. VIGIL, PURCHASING MANAGER

FROM: DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER

SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2007- BID OPENING DATE: 11/22/2006
061-DG

TITLE: BAKERY PRODUCTS

| RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: DEPT. OF SENIOR AFFAIRS

VENDOR
I'TEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL PAYMENT
NO. QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT AMOUNT TERMS
1 5000 dz HAMBURGER BUNS EARTHGRAINS/SARA LEE $1.08  $5400.00 Net
2 5000 dz HOT DOG BUNS 111 MONTANO RD. NE $1.03  $5150.00
3 5000 dz BREAD, SANDWICH WHITE ABQ., NM 87107 $.096  $4800.00
4 2000 LF BREAD, TEXAS TOAST WHITE $1.16  $2320.00
5 10,000 LF BREAD, SANDWICH WHOLE WHEAT $0.98  $9800.00
6 2500 LF BREAD, SANDWICH, DK RYE, $1.75 $4375.00
7 2500 LF BREAD, SANDWICH, LT. RYE, $1.75 $4375.00
8 2500 LF BREAD, SANDWICH, SOURDOUGH $1.80 $4500.00
9 2500 PK ROLLS HOAGIE $1.25 $3135.00
10 2500 PK ROLLS, PAN, WHITE $1.19  $2975.00
11 2500 PK ROLLS, PAN WHOLE WHEAT $1.29  $3225.00

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTU?& fWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION B
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON: ’A . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: __| ! o8 07

APPROV

« . S
[ off g e
; Z/ (DATE) /Eﬁ_ANCA HMECTOR (DATE)
R DEPT. OF IOR AFFAIRS
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DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM I
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-061-DG

BID TITLE: BAKERY PRODUCTS

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From tem No.: To item
$4,800.00 $4,800.00 EARTHGRAINS/SARA LEE
From Item No.: To item
$5,800.00 $5,800.00 EARTHGRAINS/SARA LEE
From Itemy No.: To item
$4,900.00 $4,900.00 EARTHGRAINS/SARA LEE
From ltem No.: To ltem
$3,500.00 $3,500.00 EARTHGRAINS/SARA LEE
From Item No.: To ltem
$17,500.00 $17,500.00 EARTHGRAINS/SARA LEE
From Itemy No.: To Item
$4,500.00 $4,500.00 EARTHGRAINS/SARA LEE
From ltem No.: To ltem
$3,125.00 $3,125.00 EARTHGRAINS/SARA LEE
From item No.: To litem
$4,500.00 $4,500.00 EARTHGRAINS/SARA LEE
From Itemy No.: To ltem

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No
Decembe r 12, 2006
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-061-DG
BID TITLE: BAKERY PRODUCTS
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments

$3,125.00 $3,125.00 EARTHGRAINS/SARA LEE
From Iterm No.: 10 To ltem 10

$2,975.00 $2,975.00 EARTHGRAINS/SARA LEE
From ltem No.: 11 To Iltem 1"

$3,225.00 $3,225.00 EARTHGRAINS/SARA LEE

Total Offers 11

* Denotes that at least one ltem in the Group was '"No
December 12, 2006 Page 2 of 2



AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM 1

ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT
Vendor Preference
Name Type Delivery Notes

EARTHGRAINS/SARA LEE

Response
Number
1

GROUP ITEM QTYy

1 5000
BUNS, HAMBURGER, 4 INCH,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU Dz
UNIT $0.9600
EXT. PRICE $4,800.00
GROUP ITEM QTY

2 5000
BUNS, HOT DOG, 6 INCH,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $1.1600
EXT. PRICE $5,800.00
GROUP ITEM QTyY

3 5000
BREAD, SANDWICH, WHITE 1
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU LF
UNIT $0.9800
EXT. PRICE $4,900.00

December 12, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-061-DG
BID TITLE: BAKERY PRODUCTS
BID OPENING DATE: 11/22/2006
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320
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GROUP  ITEM QTyYy

4 2000
BREAD, TEEXAS TOAST, WHITE
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU LF
UNIT $1.7500
EXT. PRICE $3,500.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

5 10000
BREAD, SANDWICH, WHOLE
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU LF
UNIT $1.7500
EXT. PRICE $17,500.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

6 2500
BREAD, SANDWICH, DARK
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU LF
UNIT $1.8000
EXT. PRICE $4,500.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

7 2500
BREAD, SANDWICH,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU LF
UNIT $1.2500
EXT. PRICE $3,125.00

December 12, 2006

REQUEST FOR BiD NUMBER: RFB2007-061-DG

BID TITLE: BAKERY PRODUCTS
BID OPENING DATE: 11/22/2006

DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320
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GROUP  ITEM QTY

8 2500
BREAD, SANDWICH,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU LF
UNIT $1.8000
EXT. PRICE $4,500.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY
9 2500

ROLLS, HOAGIE, 6 INCH,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU PK
UNIT $1.2500
EXT. PRICE $3,125.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

10 2500
ROLLS, PAN, WHITE, 24 PER
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU PK
UNIT $1.1900
EXT. PRICE $2,975.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

11 2500
ROLLS, PAN, WHOLE WHEAT,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU PK
UNIT $1.2900
EXT. PRICE $3,225.00

December 12, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-061-DG

BID TITLE: BAKERY PRODUCTS
BID OPENING DATE: 11/22/2006

DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320
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