CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE
ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
OCTOBER 25, 2005

TO: RONN JONES, PURCHASING OFFICER
FROM:  SHIRLEY GRIEGO, SENIOR BUYEW"
SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER BID OPENING DATE: 10/19/2005

RFB2006-042-SG
TITLE: FUJITSU 5650C SCANNER OR EQUIVALENT

| RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: WATER UTILITY DEPARTMENT

ITEM ITEM VENDOR TOTAL PAYMENT
NO. QUANTITY DESCRIPTION RECOMMENDED UNIT AMOUNT TERMS
1 GROUP FUJITSU 5650C INTEGRITY NETWORKING SYSTEMS $20,690.00 NET 30
SCANNERS 4601 COLUMBINE AVE., NE

ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87113

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. AGLUA! "WARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION BY
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON: 33/8/05 " patE of RECOMMENDATION: __ 31/1/05

APPRO\% . u ,%165 /’PP}@I )

2
RONN JONES ﬁ J (DATE)
PURCHASING OFF

——




City of Albugquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Il
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-042-SG
BID TITLE: FUJITSU 5650C SCANNER OR EQUIVALENT
SHIRLEY GRIEGO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments

From Item No.: 1 Toltem No.. 5
$20,690.00 $19,655.50 INTEGRETY NETWORKING SYSTEMS
$27,950.84 $27,950.84 EN POINTE TECHNOLOGIES SALES, INC.
$28,263.56 $28,263.56 COMPUTECH INTERNATIONAL
$28,380.00 $28,380.00 HERSHEY TECHNOLOGIES
$28,470.30 $28,470.30 SOUTHERN COMPUTER WAREHOUSE
$29,010.00 $29,010.00 COMPUTER SOLUTIONS GROUP
$29,574.00 $29574.00  * CDW GOVERNMENT, INC
$30,335.04 $30,335.04 OPTICAL STORAGE SYSTEMS
$30,827.20 $30,827.20 MATRIX IMAGING PRODUCTS, INC
$31,319.90 $31,319.90 ZONES CORPORATE SOLUTIONS, INC
$32,450.00 $32,450.00 HOWARD COMPUTERS
$36,970.00 $35,121.50 GHA TECHNOLOGIES

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'
October 19, 2005

Total Offers = 12

Page 1 of 1



City of Albuquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM I
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

r Response Vendor Preference
Number Name Type Delivery Notes
1 INTEGRETY NETWORKING SYSTEMS LOCAL BUSI 5 TO 7 DAYS ARO
2 COMPUTER SOLUTIONS GROUP NOT IDENTIFIED.
NOTE THAT LOCAL PREFERENCE FORM IS NOT
INCLUDED WITH BID.
3 COMPUTECH INTERNATIONAL 7-10 DAYS ARO
4 SOUTHERN COMPUTER WAREHOUS 7 DAYS
5 ZONES CORPORATE SOLUTIONS, IN 14-21 DAYS ARO
6 EN POINTE TECHNOLOGIES SALES, | 7 DAYS ARO
7 MATRIX IMAGING PRODUCTS, INC 12 DAYS FROM ORDER (PRE-PAID BY MATRIX IMAGING
TO [S501 PINO RD NE, BLDG J-E]))
8 HOWARD COMPUTERS NOT INDICATED.
NOTE: MANDATORY ADDENDA IS NOT SUBMITTED.
9 CDW GOVERNMENT, INC IN STOCK ITEM-97% SHIPPED SAME DAY ORDER IS
PLACED.
OUT OF STOCK ITEM-2-10 DAYS ARO, SUBJECT TO
AVAILABILITY.
PURCHASING NOTE: MANDATORY ADDENDA IS NOT
SUBMITTED.
10 HERSHEY TECHNOLOGIES NOT INDICATED.
PURCHASING NOTE: MANDATORY ADDENDA IS NOT
SUBMITTED.
11 OPTICAL STORAGE SYSTEMS 6 DAYS ARO DESTINATION
12 GHA TECHNOLOGIES LOCAL BUSI 3 WEEKS

October 19, 2005
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GROUP ITEM QTYy
1 1 4
SCANNER,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $4,330.0000
EXT. PRICE $17,320.00
GROUP ITEM QTY
1 1 4
SCANNER,
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $4,019.9400
EXT. PRICE $16,079.76
GROUP ITEM QTY
1 1 4
SCANNER,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $4,668.8600
EXT. PRICE $18,675.44
GROUP ITEM QTYy
1 2 4
ONE YEAR WARRANTY UPLIFT
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $94.0000
EXT. PRICE $376.00

October 19, 2005

$4,225.0000
$16,900.00

EA
$4,421.8000
$17,687.20

12

EA
$4,264.0000
$17,056.00

$926.0000
$3,704.00

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-042-SG
BID TITLE: FUNTSU S650C SCANNER OR EQUIVALENT
BID OPENING DATE: 10/19/2005
SHIRLEY GRIEGO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO : (505) 768-3320

EA
$3,947.8900
$15,791.56

EA
$4,363.0000
$17,452.00

$948.0000
$3,792.00

EA
$4,069.3900
$16,277.56

EA
$4,200.0000
$16,800.00

EA
$910.4200
$3,641.68

EA
$3,942.6200
$15,770.48

10
EA

$3,945.0000
$15,780.00

$881.6300
$3,526.52
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-042-SG
BID TITLE: FUJITSU 5650C SCANNER OR EQUIVALENT
BID OPENING DATE: 10/19/2005
SHIRLEY GRIEGO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 2 4
ONE YEAR WARRANTY UPLIFT
RESPONSE 6 7 8 9 10
NO BID? Y
SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $880.9400 $1,095.0000 $146.0000 $0.0000 $951.0000
EXT. PRICE $3,523.76 $4,380.00 $584.00 $0.00 $3,804.00
GROUP ITEM QTYy
1 2 4
ONE YEAR WARRANTY UPLIFT
RESPONSE 11 12
NO BID?
SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $927.0000 $1,431.0000
EXT. PRICE $3,708.00 $5,724.00
GROUP ITEM QTYy
1 3 8
ONE YEAR WARRANTY EXTEN
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $154.0000 $1,022.0000 $1,023.0000 $991.6700 $1,446.6300
EXT. PRICE $1,232.00 $8,176.00 $8,184.00 $7,933.36 $11,573.04
GROUP ITEM QTY
1 3 8
ONE YEAR WARRANTY EXTEN
RESPONSE 6 7 8 9 10
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $961.4000 $1,085.0000 $1,597.0000 $1,580.0000 $1,029.0000
EXT. PRICE $7,691.20 $8,760.00 $12,776.00 $12,640.00 $8,232.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY

1 3 8
ONE YEAR WARRANTY EXTEN
RESPONSE 11
NO BID?
SKuU EA
UNIT PRICE $993.9500
EXT. PRICE $7,951.60

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 4 2
SMALL COMPUTER SYSTEM IN
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKuU EA
UNIT PRICE $795.0000
EXT. PRICE $1,590.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 4 2
SMALL COMPUTER SYSTEM IN
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $324.9300
EXT. PRICE $649.86

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 4 2
SMALL COMPUTER SYSTEM IN
RESPONSE 11
NO BID?

SKuU EA
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

October 19, 2005

12

$1,548.0000
$12,384.00

$90.0000
$180.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

12

EA
$814.0000
$1,628.00

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-042-SG
BID TITLE: FUJITSU S650¢ SCANNER OR EQUIVALENT
BID OPENING DATE: 10/1 8/2005
SHIRLEY GRIEGO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

$223.0000
$446.00

$790.0000
$1,580.00

EA
$264.5800
$529.16

EA
$50.0000
$100.00

EA
$203.0600
$406.12

10

$252.0000
$504.00
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GROUP  ITEM QTy

1 S 2
SMALL COMPUTER SYSTEM IN
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $86.0000
EXT. PRICE $172.00

GROUP  ITEM QTy

1 S 2

SMALL COMPUTER SYSTEM IN
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $3.1300
EXT. PRICE $6.26
GROUP  ITEM QTy

1 S 2
SMALL COMPUTER SYSTEM IN
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

October 19, 2005

$25.0000
$50.00

$0.0000
$0.00

12

$89.0000
$178.00

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-042.SG
BID TITLE: FUJITSU 5650C SCANNER OR EQUIVALENT
BID OPENING DATE: 1011 9/2005
SHIRLEY GRIEGO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (508) 768-3320

$25.0000
$50.00

$29.0000
$58.00

EA
$44.2700
$88.54

EA
$17.0000
$34.00

EA
$21.8700
$43.74

10

$30.0000
$60.00
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