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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

FEBRUARY 7, 2005

TO: RONN D. JONES, PURCHASING OFFICER

FROM: EENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER

SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2005- BID OPENING DATE: 1/12/2005
096-DG

TITLE: APPLIANCES FOR PUBLIC HOUSING

I RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: FAMILY & COMMUNITY

VENDOR

ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL PAYMENT
NO. QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT AMOUNT TERMS

1 10 ea est. 20" Electric Stoves Gorman Distributing Co. $280.00  $2800.00 Net

2 20 ea 30" Electric Stoves PO Box 743 $252.17 $5043.40

3 32 ea 30" Gas Stoves Albuquerque, NM 87103 $305.95 $9790.40

4 40 ea 18.2¢f Refrigerators $378.85 $15,154.00

5 40 ea 14.7 cf Refrigerators $363.32 $14,532.80

TOTAL $47,320.60

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAI. AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIV!SI
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON:__ 3/01/05  paTE OF RECOMMENDATION: 2 05
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Uity of Albuquerque

AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM i
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-096-DG
BID TITLE: APPLIANCES FOR PUBLIC HOUSING
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From item No.. 1 To ltem No.: 3

$17,633.80 $17,633.80 GORMAN DIST. CO.

$22,748.16 $22,748.16 AARDVARK CO. INC.
From ltem No.: 4 To ltem No.: 5

$29,686.80 $29,686.80 GORMAN DIST. CO.

$40,562.00 $40,562.00

AARDVARK CO. INC.

" Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'
January 19, 2005

Total Offers = 4
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Uity of Albuquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Ii
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response
Number

Vendor
Name

Preference
Type Delivery Notes

GORMAN DIST. CO.

AARDVARK CO. INC.

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 1 10
20" ELECTRIC STOVES PER AT

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $280.0000
EXT. PRICE $2,800.00

GROUP  ITEM QTY
1 2 20
30" ELECTRIC STOVES PER S

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $252.1700
EXT. PRICE $5,043.40

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 3 32
30" GAS STOVES PER SPECIFI

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $305.9500
EXT. PRICE $9,790.40

January 19, 2005

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-096-DG
BID TITLE: APPLIANCES FOR PUBLIC HOUSING

BID OPENING DATE: 1/12/2005

DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$344.8400
$3,448.40

EA
$374.3000
$7,486.00

EA
$369.1800
$11,813.76
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GROUP  ITEM QTY

2 4 40
REFRIGERATORS: 18.2 CUFT.
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $378.8500
EXT. PRICE $15,154.00

GROUP  ITEM QTyYy
2 5 40
REFRIGERATORS; 14.7 CUFT

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $363.3200
EXT. PRICE $14,532.80

January 19, 2005

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-096-DG
BID TITLE: APPLIANCES FOR PUBLIC HOUSING
BID OPENING DATE: 1/12/2005
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$510.3700
$20,414.80
2

EA
$503.6800
$20,147.20
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