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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

DECEMBER 26, 2006

TO: JOHN J. VIGIL, PURCHASING MANAGER

FROM: BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYE

SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2007- BID OPENING DATE: 12/20/2006
083-BH

TITLE: FERTILIZERS AND CHEMICALS

I RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, |IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: VARIOUS

VENDOR
ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL
NO.  QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT AMOUNT
1 30.0 TON FERTILIZER,46-0-0- HELENA CHEMICAL $ 425.00 $12,750.00
3 30.0 TON FERTILIZER 121-7-14 HELENA CHEMICAL $ 446.00 $13,380.00
5 18.0 TON FERTILIZER 20-0-20 HELENA CHEMICAL $1,198.00 $21,564.00
7 4.0TON FERTILIZER 18-3-18 HELENA CHEMICAL $1,586.00 $ 6,344.00
2 55.0 TON FERTILIZER 20-4-8 ROCKY MOUNTAIN POOL $ 450.00 $24,750.00
4 200.0 TON FERTILIZER 16.8.8 ROCKY MOUNTAIN POOL $ 350.00 $70.000.00
6 3.0 TON FERTILIZER 4-0-10 GOLF ENVIRO SYSTEM $ 996.00 $ 2,988.00
8 30.0 TON FERTILIZER 5-3-4 GAYNOR ENTERPRISES $ 650.00 $19,500.00

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUA? AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION BY
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON: l /Q»l 0] . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: / / 5]07
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City of Altbugquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Il
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-083-BH
BID TITLE: FERTILIZERS AND CHEMICALS
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Iltem Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From ltem No.. 1 To ltem No.: 1
$0.00 $0.00 GOLF ENVIRO SYSTEMS, INC.
$0.00 $0.00 GAYNOR ENTERPRISES
$12,750.00 $12,112.50 HELENA CHEMICAL CO.-
$13,200.00 $12,540.00 ROCKY MOUNTAIN POOL & AG
$14,550.00 $14,550.00 FERTIZONA LLC
From ltem No.: 2 To item No.: 2
$0.00 $0.00 GOLF ENVIRO SYSTEMS, INC.
$0.00 $0.00 GAYNOR ENTERPRISES
$24,750.00 $23,512.50 ROCKY MOUNTAIN POOL & AG
$25,630.00 $24,348.50 HELENA CHEMICAL CO.
$27,775.00 $27,775.00 FERTIZONA LLC
From tem No.: 3 To ltem No.: 3
$0.00 $0.00 GOLF ENVIRO SYSTEMS, INC.
$0.00 $0.00 GAYNOR ENTERPRISES
$13,380.00 $12,711.00 HELENA CHEMICAL CO. -
$13,650.00 $12,967.50 ROCKY MOUNTAIN POOL & AG
$13,800.00 $13,800.00 FERTIZONA LLC
From ltem No.. 4 To ltem No.: 4
$0.00 $0.00 GOLF ENVIRO SYSTEMS, INC.
$0.00 $0.00 GAYNOR ENTERPRISES
$70,000.00 $66,500.00 ROCKY MOUNTAIN POOL & AG

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-083-BH
BID TITLE: FERTILIZERS AND CHEMICALS
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments

$80,000.00 $76,000.00 HELENA CHEMICAL CO.
$82,000.00 $82,000.00 FERTIZONA LLC
From Item No.. § To ltem No.: &
$0.00 $0.00 FERTIZONA LLC
$0.00 $0.00 GAYNOR ENTERPRISES
$21,564.00 $20,485.80 HELENA CHEMICAL CO..
$22,230.00 $21,118.50 ROCKY MOUNTAIN POOL & AG
$24,696.00 $24,696.00 GOLF ENVIRO SYSTEMS, INC.
From ltem No.: 6 To ltem No.: 6
$0.00 $0.00 ROCKY MOUNTAIN POOL & AG
$0.00 $0.00 FERTIZONA LLC
$0.00 $0.00 GAYNOR ENTERPRISES
$2,988.00 $2,988.00 GOLF ENVIRO SYSTEMS, INC.
$4,320.00 $4,104.00 HELENA CHEMICAL CO.
From ltem No.: 7 To item No.: 7
$0.00 $0.00 ROCKY MOUNTAIN POOL & AG
$0.00 $0.00 FERTIZONA LLC
$0.00 $0.00 GAYNOR ENTERPRISES
$6,344.00 $6,026.80 HELENA CHEMICAL CO.
$7,960.00 $7,960.00 GOLF ENVIRO SYSTEMS, INC.
From ltem No.: 8 To Item No.: 8
$0.00 $0.00 ROCKY MOUNTAIN POOL & AG
$0.00 $0.00 HELENA CHEMICAL CO.
$0.00 $0.00 FERTIZONA LLC
$19,500.00 $19,500.00 GAYNOR ENTERPRISES

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'

December 26, 2006
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-083-BH
BID TITLE: FERTILIZERS AND CHEMICALS
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments

$28,800.00 $28,800.00 GOLF ENVIRO SYSTEMS, INC.

Total Offers = 40

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'

December 26, 2006
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City of Albuquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM i
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response

Vendor Preference

Number Name Type Delivery Notes

1 ROCKY MOUNTAIN POOL & AG LOCAL BUSI

2 GOLF ENVIRO SYSTEMS, INC.

3 HELENA CHEMICAL CO. STATE MANU

4 FERTIZONA LLC

5 GAYNOR ENTERPRISES

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-083-BH
BID TITLE: FERTILIZERS AND CHEMICALS
BID OPENING DATE: 12/20/2006
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320
GROUP ITEM QTy
1 30
FERTILIZER, 46-0-0 HOMOGEN
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU TN TN TN TN
UNIT PRICE $440.0000 $0.0000 $425.0000 $485.0000
EXT. PRICE $13,200.00 $0.00 $12,750.00 $14,550.00
GROUP ITEM QTY
2 55

FERTILIZER, 20-4-8 BLENDED
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU ™ TN TN N
UNIT PRICE $450.0000 $0.0000 $466.0000 $505.0000
EXT. PRICE $24,750.00 $0.00 $25,630.00 $27,775.00

December 26, 2006

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY
3 30
FERTILIZER, 121-7-14 BLENDE

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU TN
UNIT PRICE $455.0000
EXT. PRICE $13,650.00

GROUP [TEM QTY
4 200
FERTILIZER, 16-8-8 BLENDED

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU TN
UNIT PRICE $350.0000
EXT. PRICE $70,000.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

5 18
FERTILIZER, 20-0-20 + 0.435%
RESPONSE 1
NO BiD?
SKU TN
UNIT PRICE $1,235.0000
EXT. PRICE $22,230.00

GROUP ITEM Qry

6 3
FERTILIZER 4-0-10 (HOMOGEN
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU ™
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

December 26, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-083-BH
BID TITLE: FERTILIZERS AND CHEMICALS
BID OPENING DATE: 12/20/2006
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$1,372.0000
$24,696.00

TN
$996.0000
$2,988.00

TN
$446.0000
$13,380.00

TN
$400.0000
$80,000.00

TN
$1,198.0000
$21,564.00

TN
$1,440.0000
$4,320.00

TN
$460.0000
$13,800.00

TN
$410.0000
$82,000.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00

TN
$0.0000
$0.00
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-083-BH
BID TITLE: FERTILIZERS AND CHEMICALS
BID OPENING DATE: 12/20/2006
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTY

7 4
FERTILIZER 18-3-18 (HOMOGE
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID?
SKU TN TN TN TN TN
UNIT PRICE $0.0000 $1,990.0000 $1,586.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00 $7.960.00 $6,344.00 $0.00 $0.00
GROUP ITEM QTY

8 30
FERTILIZER, 5-3-4 (HOMOGEN
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID?
SKU TN TN TN TN TN
UNIT PRICE $0.0000 $960.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000 $650.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00 $28,800.00 $0.00 $0.00 $19,500.00
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