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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

FEBRUARY 8, 2005

TO: RONN D. JONES, PURCHASING OFFICER

FROM: ~ DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER

SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2005- BID OPENING DATE: 2/2/2005
103-DG

TITLE: ANIMAL DIETS - MAZURI

I RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: CULTURAL SERVICES

VENDOR
ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL PAYMENT
NO.  QUANTITY I[TEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT  AMOUNT TERMS
1-10 various Various animal diets & food products ~ Western Mercantile See bid 3$11,551.11 Net

111 Rio Bravo Blvd.
Albuquerque, NM 87105

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION BY
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON:_ 3/01/05 . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: 2/22/05
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RONN D. JONES (DATE MILLIE SANTILLANES, DIRECTOR (DATE)
PURCHASING OFFICER CULTURAL SERVICES
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Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments

City of Albuquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Il
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-103-DG
BID TITLE: ANIMAL DIETS - MAZURI

DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

From ltem No.: 1 To ltem No.: 10

$11,551.11
$11,962.19

$10,973.56 WESTERN MERCANTILE

$11,364.09 DANS BOOTS AND SADDLES

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'

February 2, 2005

Total Offers = 2
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City of Albuquerque

AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM i
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response Vendor Preference
Number Name Type Delivery Notes
1 WESTERN MERCANTILE LOCAL BUSI 2 WEEKS ARO
2 DANS BOOTS AND SADDLES LOCAL BUSI 3 WEEKS

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 1 12
BROWSE BISCUITS (8MA4) 2

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $27.7000
EXT. PRICE $332.40

GROUP I{TEM QTY
1 2 55
HERBIVORE ADF 25; 50# BA

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $14.7200
EXT. PRICE $809.60

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 3 45
KANGARQOO DIET (5288) 40#

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $24.2500
EXT. PRICE $1,091.25

February 2, 2005

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-103-DG
BID TITLE: ANIMAL DIETS - MAZURI
BID OPENING DATE: 2/2/2005
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$26.9900
$323.88

EA
$14.9900
$824.45

EA
$23.9900
$1,079.55
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GROUP  ITEM QTY
1 4 12
INSECTIVORE DIET (5MK8) 2

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $25.6900
EXT. PRICE $308.28

GROUP  ITEM QTY
1 5 5
MINIPIG ELDER 25# BAG

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $9.2000
EXT. PRICE $46.00

GROUP  ITEM QTY

1 6 12
MONKEY CRUNCH 10KG BAG
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $20.9800
EXT. PRICE $251.76

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 7 48
MONKEY GROWTH AND REPR

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $15.5900
EXT. PRICE $748.32

February 2, 2005

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-103-DG
BID TITLE: ANIMAL DIETS - MAZURI
BID OPENING DATE: 2/2/2005
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$25.9900
$311.88

EA
$9.9900
$49.95

EA
$19.9900
$239.88

EA
$14.9900
$719.52
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-103-DG
BID TITLE: ANIMAL DIETS - MAZURI
BID OPENING DATE: 2/2/2005
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 8 12
NEW WORLD PRIMATE (5MAS5)

'

RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?

SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $30.5000 $28.9900
EXT. PRICE $366.00 $347.88

GROUP ITEM QTyY

1 9 450
OSTRICH GROWER/MAINTENA
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU EA EA
UNIT PRICE $14.2500 $14.5300
EXT. PRICE $6,412.50 $6,565.50

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 10 5
MARMOSET JELLY (5041)
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BIB?
SKU Cs Cs
UNIT PRICE $237.0000 $299.9400
EXT. PRICE $1,185.00 $1,489.70
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