CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE
Inter-Office Correspondence Reference No. RFB2006-119-WR
March 13, 2006

Reguisition # P47893

TO: John Vigil, Assistant Purchaging Officer

From: Wayne Riddle, Senior Buyer@

Subject: Recommendation of Award on Request No. RFB2006-119-WR

Title: RAPID PROCUREMENT FOR KITCHEN RENOVATIONS FOR THE DEPT OF FINANCE

AND ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES (DFA), ALBUQUERQUE CONVENTION CENTER
Bid Opening: 02/15/2006

I recommend awarding the following as the lowest responsive offers meeting specifications.

AWARDED TO: ITEM BID PRICE TERMS
Enterprise Builders 1 - Floor Repair $126,696.00 2% 20 Days, Net
Stanley mount Vice President 2 - Ceiling & Drywall Repair $99, 346 »

P.0O. Box 3987 3 - Equipment Repairs $411,081.00 "

Albuquerque, NM 87190

Standard Restaurant Equipment 4 - Small Wares $200,757.52 Net
Beverly Nilles, Sales

2407 Candelaria NE

Albugquerque, NM 87107

Note: The requirement for a Protest Period has been waived since this is a Rapid Procurement.

Note: The pricing for the sole bid responses received from Enterprise Builders (for Items 1-3) has been
normalized to reflect actual pricing being offered to the City.

Note: The bid response received from East Bay Restaurant Supply, Inc. is not considered responsive since
does not meet the minimum requirements for Item #4.
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This is a Recommendation of Award, not an actual award. An actual award will be made by the
Purchasing Division by issuing a Purchase Order after the completion of the Recommendation of
Award process. Date of Recommendation: #lj}{é}@

3 - —Z 42 3 /%;
I/ (Date) Tanda Meadors (Dayke)

4 hasing QOfficer Director,
DFA



City of Albuquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM I
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-119-WR

BID TITLE: RAPID PROCUREMENT OF KITCHEN RENOVATIONS
WAYNE RIDDLE, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From Item No.: To Item No.:
$0.00 $0.00 * STANDARD RESTAURANT EQUIPMENT
$0.00 $0.00 * EAST BAY RESTAURANT SUPPLY, INC.
$126,696.00 $120,361.20 ENTERPRISE BUILDERS
From Item No.: To Item No.:
$0.00 $0.00 * STANDARD RESTAURANT EQUIPMENT
$0.00 $0.00 * EAST BAY RESTAURANT SUPPLY, INC.
$99,346.00 $94,378.70 ENTERPRISE BUILDERS
From Item No.: To Item No.:
$0.00 $0.00 * STANDARD RESTAURANT EQUIPMENT
$0.00 $0.00 * EAST BAY RESTAURANT SUPPLY, INC.
$411,081.00 $390,526.95 ENTERPRISE BUILDERS
From ltem No.: To ltem No.:
$178,828.26 $178,828.26 EAST BAY RESTAURANT SUPPLY, INC.
BID NON-RESPONSIVE SINCE IT DOES NOT MEET MINIMUM REQUIREMENTS
$200,757.52 $200,757.52 STANDARD RESTAURANT EQUIPMENT
$247,755.00 $235,367.25 ENTERPRISE BUILDERS

* Denotes that at least one ltem in the Group was 'No Bid’

March 13, 2006

Total Offers = 12
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GROUP ITEM
1

AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Il
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response Vendor Preference
Number Name Type Delivery Notes
1 STANDARD RESTAURANT 3-5 WEEKS ARO
2 ENTERPRISE BUILDERS LOCAL BUS!I
3 EAST BAY RESTAURANT SUPPLY,

Q1Y

1

PROVIDE A BID PRICE FOR

RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU

UNIT PRICE
EXT.

GROUP ITEM
2

PROVIDE

RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU

UNIT PRICE
EXT.

March 13, 2006

$0.0000
$0.00

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-119-WR
BID TITLE: RAPID PROCUREMENT OF KITCHEN RENOVATIONS
BID OPENING DATE: 2/17/2006
WAYNE RIDDLE, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2 3

Y

LT LT
$126,696.0000 $0.0000
$126,696.00 $0.00

2 3

Y

LT LT
$99,346.0000 $0.0000
$99,346.00 $0.00
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GROUP ITEM QTy

3 1
PROVIDE
RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU LT
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. $0.00
GROUP ITEM QTy

4 1
PROVIDE
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU LT
UNIT PRICE $200,757.5200
EXT. $200,757.52

March 13, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-119-WR
BID TITLE: RAPID PROCUREMENT OF KITCHEN RENOVATIONS
BID OPENING DATE: 2/17/2006
WAYNE RIDDLE, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2 3

Y

LT LT
$411,081.0000 $0.0000
$411,081.00 $0.00

2 3

LT LT
$247,755.0000 $178,828.2600
$247,755.00 $178,828.26
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