ROA, RFB2005-174-DG, Page 1
CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

JUNE 21, 2005

TO: RONN D. JONES, PURCHASING OFFICER

FROM: “DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER

SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2005- BID OPENING DATE: 6/8/2005
174-DG

TITLE: WINDOW REPAIR, SCREENS & GLASS

I RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: FAMILY & COMMUNITY

VENDOR

ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL PAYMENT
NO. QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT  AMOUNT TERMS
1 ea 2250 sf Manuf. Screens All-Pro Glass $1.00 $ 2250.00 net

2 ea 250 sf Labor: Window Repairs/ Hardware 2715 Vassar PINE Ste. A $42.70 $10,675.00

3 ea 1000 sf Hardware and parts Abg. N:M 87107 $ 75 $ 75000

4 ea 1000 sf Door and Window Frames $ 50 $ 75000

5 ea 3400 sf Tempered Safety Glass $ 225 § 7,560.00

6 ea 340 sf Laminated Safety Glass $ 300 $ 102000

7 ea 340 sf Clear Float Glass $ 1.00 § 34000

8 ea 100 hr Service charge/Trip Fee $30.00 $ 3,000.00

9 hr 40 hr Labor rates for “After Hours” Weekend / Holiday $ 4270 3§ 1,708.00

10 hr 20 hr Emergency After Hours care. Flat Fee charge $ 2000 $ 400.00

11 sf 200 sf Board Up Price. Per sf of wood $ 100 $ 20000

Total
$26,493.00

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL ?WARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DlVl;f)N BY
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON: . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: 2

APP ROVED M?{“m :

(it A e g,
RONND. JONES (DATE)
PURCHASING OFFIEE‘R FAMILY & COMMUNI Y SERVICES




From ltem No.:

1

City of Albuquerque

AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM i
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-174-DG
BID TITLE: WINDOW REPAIR, SCREENS & GLASS
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments

To ltem No.: 11

$28,743.00 $28,743.00 ALL PRO GLASS & SCREEN INC.
$28,755.50 $28,755.50 SCREEN-CO INC.
$48,655.00 $48,655.00 GLASS ON WHEELS

Total Offers = 3

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'

June 8, 2005
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City of Albugquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Il
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response
Number

Vendor
Name

Preference
Type Delivery Notes

SCREEN-CO INC.

ALL PRO GLASS & SCREEN INC.

GLASS ON WHEELS

GROUP ITEM QTyY
1 1 2250
PROVIDE A PRICE PER SQUA

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU SF
UNIT PRICE $1.0500
EXT. PRICE $2,362.50

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 2 250
LABOR: HOURLY RATE FOR

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU HR
UNIT PRICE $42.7000
EXT. PRICE $10,675.00
June 8, 2005

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-174-DG
BID TITLE: WINDOW REPAIR, SCREENS & GLASS

DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

SF
$1.0000
$2,250.00

HR
$42.7000
$10,675.00

BID OPENING DATE: 6/8/2005

SF
$2.5000
$5,625.00

HR
$35.0000
$8,750.00
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-174-DG
BID TITLE: WINDOW REPAIR, SCREENS & GLASS
BID OPENING DATE: 6/8/2005
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 3 1000
HARDWARE AND PARTS. ST
RESPONSE 1 2 3
NO BID?
SKU DL DL DL
UNIT PRICE $0.7500 $0.7500 $1.0000
EXT. PRICE $750.00 $750.00 $1,000.00

GROUP ITEM QTyY
1 4 1500
DOOR AND WINDOW FRAMES.

RESPONSE 1 2 3
NO BID?

SKU DL DL DL
UNIT PRICE $0.5000 $0.5000 $1.0000
EXT. PRICE $750.00 $750.00 $1,500.00

GROUP ITEM QTyY
1 5 3400
TEMPERED SAFETY GLASS.

RESPONSE 1 2 3
NO BID?

SKU SF SF SF
UNIT PRICE $2.2500 $2.2500 $5.0000
EXT. PRICE $7,650.00 $7,650.00 $17,000.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 6 340
LAMINATED SAFETY GLASS

RESPONSE 1 2 3
NO BID?

SKU SF SF SF
UNIT PRICE $3.0000 $3.0000 $8.0000
EXT. PRICE $1,020.00 $1,020.00 $2,720.00
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GROUP  ITEM QTY
1 7 340
CLEAR FLOAT GLASS

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU SF
UNIT PRICE $1.0000
EXT. PRICE $340.00

GROUP ITEM QTyY
1 8 100
SERVICE CHARGE/TRIP FEE.

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $30.0000
EXT. PRICE $3,000.00

GROUP  [TEM QTY
1 9 40
LABOR RATES FOR "AFTER H

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU HR
UNIT PRICE $42.7000
EXT. PRICE $1,708.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 10 20
EMERGENCY AFTER HOURS C

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU HR
UNIT PRICE $15.0000
EXT. PRICE $300.00
June 8, 2005

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-174-DG
BID TITLE: WINDOW REPAIR, SCREENS & GLASS
BID OPENING DATE: 6/8/2005
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

SF
$1.0000
$340.00

EA
$30.0000
$3,000.00

HR
$42.7000
$1,708.00

HR
$20.0000
$400.00

SF
$4.0000
$1,360.00

EA
$60.0000
$6,000.00

HR
$45.0000
$1,800.00

HR
$95.0000
$1,900.00
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-174-DG
BID TITLE: WINDOW REPAIR, SCREENS & GLASS
BID OPENING DATE: 6/8/2005

DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320
GROUP ITEM QTY

1 11 200

BOARD UP PRICE. PRICE PE

RESPONSE 1 2 3
NO BID?

SKU SF SF SF
UNIT PRICE $1.0000 $1.0000 $5.0000
EXT. PRICE $200.00 $200.00 $1,000.00

June 8, 2005
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