CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE
Inter-Office Correspondence Reference No. REFBZ005-129-WR
September 06, 2005

Requisition #’S 199904, 176446 & 182651

TO: Ronn Jones, Purchasing Officer

From: Wayne Riddle, Senior Buyer

Subject: Recommendation of Award on Request No. RFB2005-129-WR
Title: LANDSCAPING SERVICES FOR VARIOUS DEPT'S

Bid Opening: 08/03/05

I recommend awarding the following as the lowest responsive offers meeting specifications.

AWARDED TO: ITEM DESCRIPTION TERMS
HEADS UP LANDSCAPE GROUP 1 - $43,200.00 (24 MONTHS) NET
BRANDON ROGERS, ESTIMATOR (ISOTOPES STADIUM)

P.O. BOX 87107
ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87184-0597

RIO GRANDE LANDSCAPES GROUP 2 - $26,280.00 (24 MONTHS) NET
JAKE GAULTNEY, MANAGER (LIBRARTES)

5000 MIDNIGHT VISTA NW

ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87114

TRUGREEN LANDCARE GROUP 3 - $330,498.00 (24 MONTHS) NET
JEFEF REID, ACCOUNT MANAGER (HOUSING SERVICES)

6219 CORONA AVE, NE

ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87113




PAGE 2

NOTE: THE BID RESPONSE RECEIVED FROM LEECO GROUNDS MAINTENANCE IS CONSIDERED NON-RESPONSIVE
SINCE IT DOES NOT INCLUDE REVISED PRICE PAGE 41 OR TAXES W/ PRICING, AS REQUIRED FOR GROUP 1.

This i@ a Recommendation of Award, not an actual award. An actual award will be made by the

Pgrch c} Division by issuing a Purcnabo Order after the completion of the Protest Period on
gfégé, &5 . Date of Recommendation 19 /65 .
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City of Albugquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Ii
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-128-WR
BID TITLE: PROVIDE VARIOUS LANDSCAPING SERVICES
WAYNE RIDDLE, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

ftem Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From ltem No.: 1 To ltem No.: 1
$0.00 $0.00 * TRUGREEN LANDCARE
$0.00 $0.00 * ARTS SPRINKLERS
$38,400.00 $36,480.00 LEECO GROUND MANAGEMNT, INC.
NON-RESPONSIVE - DID NOT INCLUDE REV PRICE PAGE 41 OR TAXES W/PRICING AS
REQUIRED.
$43,200.00 $41,040.00 HEADS UP LANDSCAPE
$45,000.00 $42,750.00 RIO GRANDE LANDSCAPE
$72,000.00 $68,400.00 DESERT GARDENS
$76,320.00 $72,504.00 TREES & TURF
$73,497.36 $73,497.36 LEE LANDSCAPES
From ltem No.. 2 To ltem No.: 2
$0.00 $0.00 * TRUGREEN LANDCARE
$0.00 $0.00 * TREES & TURF
$0.00 $0.00 * LEECO GROUND MANAGEMNT, INC.
$0.00 $0.00 * ARTS SPRINKLERS
$26,280.00 $24,966.00 RIO GRANDE LANDSCAPE
$33,000.00 $31,350.00 HEADS UP LANDSCAPE
$38,160.00 $36,252.00 DESERT GARDENS
$111,062.64 $111,062.64 LEE LANDSCAPES
Fromitem No.: 3 To ltem No.: 4
$0.00 $0.00 * HEADS UP LANDSCAPE
30.00 $0.00 * TREES & TURF

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'
August 19, 2005
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-129-WR

BID TITLE: PROVIOE VARIOUS LANDSCAPING SERVICES
WAYNE RIDDLE, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

iten_1 _ Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
$0.00 $0.00  * RIO GRANDE LANDSCAPE
$0.00 $0.00 « LEECO GROUND MANAGEMNT, INC.
$330,498.00 $330,498.00 TRUGREEN LANDCARE
$345,400.00 $345,400.00 ARTS SPRINKLERS
$620,275.00 $620,275.00 DESERT GARDENS
$702,738.80 LEE LANDSCAPES

$702,738.80

« Denotes that at least one ltem in the Group was 'No Bid'
Auaust 19, 2005

Total Offers = 24
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City of Albugquergque

AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Il
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response Vendor Preference
Number Name Type Delivery Notes
HEADS UP LANDSCAPE LOCAL BUSH

TRUGREEN LANDCARE

LEE LANDSCAPES

TREES & TURF LOCAL BUSI

RIO GRANDE LANDSCAPE LOCAL BUSI

LEECO GROUND MANAGEMNT, INC. LOCAL BUSI

DESERT GARDENS LOCAL BUS!

ARTS SPRINKLERS

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 1 24

FURNISH LABOR, EQUIPMENT,

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU MO
UNIT PRICE $1,800.0000
EXT. PRICE $43,200.00

August 19, 2005

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-129-WR
BID TITLE: PROVIDE VARIOUS LANDSCAPING SERVICES
BID OPENING DATE: 8/3/2005
WAYNE RIDDLE, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2 3

Y
MO MO
$0.0000 $3,062.3900
$0.00 $73,497.36

MO
$3,180.0000
$76,320.00

MO
$1,875.0000
$45,000.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY
1 1 24
FURNISH LABOR, EQUIPMENT,

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU MO
UNIT PRICE $1,600.0000
EXT. PRICE $38,400.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
2 2 24
PROVIDE VARIOUS MONTHLY

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU MO
UNIT PRICE $1,375.0000
EXT. PRICE $33,000.00

GROUP ITEM QTyY
2 2 24
PROVIDE VARIOUS MONTHLY

RESPONSE 6
NO BID? Y
SKU MO
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

3 3 24
PROVIDE MONTHLY LANDSCA
RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU MO
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

August 19, 2005

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-129-WR
BID TITLE: PROVIDE VARIOUS LANDSCAPING SERVICES
BID OPENING DATE: 8/3/2005
WAYNE RIDDLE, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

MO
$3,000.0000
$72,000.00

MO
$0.0000
$0.00

MO
$1,580.0000
$38,160.00

MO
$6,349.0000
$152,376.00

8

Y

MO
$0.0000
$0.00

MO
$4,627.6100
$111,062.64

MO
$0.0000
$0.00

MO
$16,147.4500
$387,538.80

4
Y

MO
$0.0000
$0.00

4
Y

MO
$0.0000
$0.00

MO
$1,095.0000
$26,280.00

MO
$0.0000
$0.00
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GROUP  ITEM QTY
3 3 24
PROVIDE MONTHLY LANDSCA

RESPONSE 6
NO BID? Y
SKU MO
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

GROUP ITEM QTyY
3 4 1
PROVIDE (ON AN AS NEEDED

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU GR
UNIT PRICE

EXT. PRICE $0.00

GROUP ITEM QTYy
3 4 1
PROVIDE (ON AN AS NEEDED

RESPONSE 6
NO BID? Y
SKU GR
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

August 19, 2005

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-129-WR
BID TITLE: PROVIDE VARIOUS LANDSCAPING SERVICES
BID OPENING DATE: 8/3/2005
WAYNE RIDDLE, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

MO
$14,800.0000
$355,200.00

GR
$178,122.0000
$178,122.00

GR
$265,075.0000
$265,075.00

MO
$9,600.0000
$230,400.00

GR
$315,200.0000
$315,200.00

GR
$115,000.0000
$115,000.00

4
Y

GR
$0.0000
$0.00

5

Y

GR
$0.0000
$0.00
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