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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

MARCH 6, 2006

TO: JOHN J. VIGIL, ASSISTANT, PURCHASING OFFICER

FROM: DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER

SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2006- BID OPENING DATE: 2/15/2006
112-DG

TITLE: MAZURI BRAND, ANIMAL DIETS

I RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY:

VENDOR

ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL PAYMENT
NO. QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT  AMOUNT TERMS

1 150 BGS WATERFOWL BREEDER FORMULA WESTERN MERCANTILE $24.06 $3609.00 NET

2 213 BGS WATERFOWL MAINT. FORMULA 111 RIO BRAVEO BLVD. $23.19  $4939.47

3 150 BGS PARROT BREEDER FORMULA ALBUQUERQUE, NM $21.256 $3187.50

4 225 BGS PARROT MAINT. FORMULA $21.25 $4781.25

5 350 BGS EXOTIC CANINE DIET MAZURI $27.40 $9590.00

6 175 BGS FLAMINGO COMPLETE $51.25 $8968.95

7 105 BGS FLAMINGO BREEDER, $59.99 $6298.95

TOTAL $41,374.92

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISIO B);
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON:_% //(¢/(J7 . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: _ %/ 9 /)ty

. APPROVED:
JOAN J IL (DATE) VELIA SILVA /DAYE)
PU\?@Q DIRECTOR, CULTURAL SERVICES




AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM 1I
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-112-DG
BID TITLE: MAZUR! BRAND ANIMAL DIETS
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments

From item No.: 1 To item 7

$41,374.92 $39,306.17 WESTERN MERCANTILE
$43,361.75 $41,193.66 DANS BOOTS AND SADDLES
$45,082.16 $42,828.05 MESILLA VALLEY FEEDERS

* Denotes that at least one item in the Group was 'No
March 1, 2006

Total Offers 3
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AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM II
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response Vendor Preference
Number Name Type Delivery Notes
1 WESTERN MERCANTILE LOCAL BUSI 2 WEEKS LEAD TIME
2 MESILLA VALLEY FEEDERS LOCAL BUSI 3WKS ARO
3 DANS BOOTS AND SADDLES LOCAL BUSI
REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-112-DG
BID TITLE: MAZURI BRAND ANIMAL DIETS
BID OPENING DATE: 3/1/2006
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320
GROUP ITEM QTY
1 1 150
WATERFOWL BREEDER
RESPONSE 1 2 3
NO BID?
SKU BG BG BG
UNIT $24.0600 $27.3200 $25.3000
EXT. PRICE $3,609.00 $4,098.00 $3,795.00
GROUP ITEM QTY
1 2 213
WATERFOWL MAINTENANCE
RESPONSE 1 2 3
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA
UNIT $23.1900 $27.3200 $24.3000
EXT. PRICE $4,939.47 $5,819.16 $5,175.90

March 1, 2006
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GROUP ITEM QTY

1 3 150
PARROT BREEDER FORMULA
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $21.2500
EXT. PRICE $3,187.50
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 4 225
PARROT MAINTENANCE
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $21.2500
EXT. PRICE $4,781.25
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 5 350
EXOTIC CANINE DIET MAZURI
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $27.4000
EXT. PRICE $9,590.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 6 175
FLAMINGO COMPLETE,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $51.2500
EXT. PRICE $8,968.75

March 1, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-112-DG
BID TITLE: MAZUR! BRAND ANIMAL DIETS
BID OPENING DATE: 3/1/2006
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2

EA
$29.3500
$4,402.50

2

EA
$29.3500
$6,603.75

2

EA
$26.0600
$9,121.00

2

EA
$50.2900
$8,800.75

3

EA
$21.7500
$3,262.50

3

EA
$21.7500
$4,893.75

3

EA
$28.9900
$10,146.50

3

EA
$54.0000
$9,450.00
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GROUP ITEM QTy

1 7 105
FLAMINGO BREEDER,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT $59.9900
EXT. PRICE $6,298.95

March 1, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-112-DG
BID TITLE: MAZURI BRAND ANIMAL DIETS
BID OPENING DATE: 3/1/2006
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2 3

EA EA
$59.4000 $63.2200
$6,237.00 $6,638.10
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